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State of New York Executive Department 
Office Of General Services 

Procurement Services Group 
Corning Tower Building - 38th Floor 

Empire State Plaza 
Albany, New York  12242 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov 
 

SUPPLEMENTAL CONTRACT AWARD NOTIFICATION 
 

Title  : Group 33700 – FINE & COARSE AGGREGATES 
 (All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions) 
Classification Code(s):  11 

Award Number : 22197    (Replaces Award 21642) 

Contract Period : August 30, 2012 Through June 30, 2013 

Bid Opening Date : March 31, 2011 

Date of Issue : December 24, 2012 

Specification Reference : As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids 

Contractor Information : Appears beginning on Page 2 of this Award 
 

Address Inquiries To: 

State Agencies & Vendors Political Subdivisions & Others 
Name  : 
Title : 
Phone : 
Fax : 
E-mail : 

Marcos Ortiz, CPPB 
Purchasing Officer I 
518-474-1557 
518-474-8676 
marcos.ortiz@ogs.ny.gov 

Procurement Services Group 
Customer Services 

Phone : 
Fax : 
E-mail : 

518-474-6717 
518-474-2437 
customer.services@ogs.ny.gov 

 
The Procurement Services Group values your input. 

Complete and return "Contract Performance Report" at end of document. 
 

Description 

Fine and Coarse Aggregates is sand, stone and crusher run for construction. It is also used in the repair 
of washouts, sinkholes, pavement sub-base problems, drainage installations and other road problems. 

 
PR #22197 

  

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/3370022197Can.htm
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NOTE:   See individual contract items to determine actual awardees. 

CONTRACT # CONTRACTOR & ADDRESS TELEPHONE # 
FEIN/ 

NYS VID 

PC65859 CALLANAN INDUSTRIES, INC.  800/446-8649 141539261 
 D/B/A IROQUOIS ROCK PRODUCTS 518/374-2222 Ext. 207 1000027416 
 P.O. Box 15097 Glenn R. DiMeo  
 Albany, NY  12212-5097 Fax: 518/346-0808  
  E-mail: gdimeo@callanan.com  
    
PC65955 CENTURY AGGREGATES INC. 518/273-5800 Ext. 29 202762181 
SB 74 Sand Rd. Nicholas M. DiNova, Jr. 1100054847 
 Falls Village, CT  06018 Fax: 518/273-6134  
 Accepts Procurement Card for orders up to $15,000 E-mail: ndinova@bondedconcrete.com 
    
PC65867 DALRYMPLE GRAVEL  607/737-6200 Ext. 107 160399910 
 & CONTRACTING CO., INC. Rick Hitchcock 1000007432 
 2105 S. Broadway  Fax: 607/737-1056  
 Pine City, NY  14871 E-mail: sstrong@dalholding.com  
    
PC65870 DUTCHESS QUARRY & SUPPLY CO. INC. 845/635-8151 141294098 
SB 49 Arborio Rd., P.O. Box 651  John P. Arborio 1000006649 
 Pleasant Valley, NY  12569 Fax: 845/635-2518  
  E-mail: dqsco@aol.com  
    
PC65883 PECKHAM MATERIALS CORP. 518/945-1120 141470013 
 2 Union St. Ext. Joseph Wildermuth 1000006732 
 Athens, NY  12015 Fax: 518/945-1298  
  E-mail: jwild@peckham.com  
    
PC65885 SENECA STONE CORPORATION 315/549-8253  Ext. 12 161124518 
 2105 S. Broadway Tom Cleere 1000007782 
 Pine City, NY  14871 Fax: 315/549-7156  
  E-mail: tcleere@dalholding.com  
 

Cash Discount, If Shown, Should be Given Special Attention. 
INVOICES MUST BE SENT DIRECTLY TO THE ORDERING AGENCY FOR PAYMENT. 

(See "Contract Payments" and "Electronic Payments" in this document.) 
 
SCOPE: 

 This supplemental award is intended to provide an opportunity for contractors on the original Fine and Coarse 
Aggregates statewide award to submit lower pricing for award on items for which they had received award pending 
status (AP).   

 
NOTE: 

  All other terms and conditions of the original award apply to this supplemental award.  We strongly 
advise all contract users to familiarize themselves with all terms and conditions before issuing a purchase 
order.  Please attach this supplemental to your copy of the Contract Award Notification. 
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REGION 1 
(Albany, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington Counties) 
Price FOB Plant/Net Ton  

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 203.06 203.07 203.20 304.11 304.12 

Callanan Rensselaer 1-7R $7.200 $7.200 $7.200   
Callanan Albany 1-23R, RFM $7.200 $7.200 $7.200   
Peckham Materials Greene 1-30R, RFM $7.000 $7.000 $7.000 $8.500  
Peckham Materials Warren 1-11F, R    $8.500  

 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 304.13 304.14 304.14A 17304.1011 

Callanan  Rensselaer 1-7R     
Callanan  Albany 1-23R, RFM     
Peckham Materials  Greene 1-30R, RFM $8.500 $8.500   
Peckham Materials  Warren 1-11F, R $8.500 $8.500   

 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 1 (Cont'd.) 
(Albany, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington Counties) 
Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 605.0901 605.1001 605.1101 620.02 620.03 

Callanan  Rensselaer 1-7R      
Callanan  Albany 1-23R, RFM      
Peckham Materials  Greene 1-30R, RFM $11.250   $12.000 $12.000 
Peckham Materials  Warren 1-11F, R $11.250 $13.650  $12.000 $12.000 
Peckham Materials  Saratoga 1-39R, 1-90F, G      
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-43R $11.250     
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-10R, RFM $11.250     
Peckham Materials  Essex 1-120F, G $11.250     
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-85F, G $11.250     

 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 1 (Cont'd.) 
(Albany, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington Counties) 
Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 620.04 620.05 620.06 620.08 

703-
0201A 

Callanan  Rensselaer 1-7R      
Callanan  Albany 1-23R, RFM      
Peckham Materials  Greene 1-30R, RFM $12.000  $13.250 $11.500  
Peckham Materials  Warren 1-11F, R $12.000   $11.500  
Peckham Materials  Saratoga 1-39R, 1-90F, G      
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-43R    $11.500  
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-10R, RFM    $11.500  
Peckham Materials  Essex 1-120F, G      
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-85F, G      

 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 1 (Cont'd.) 
(Albany, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703-
0201B 

703-
0201C 

703-
0201D 

703-
0201E 

Callanan  Rensselaer 1-7R     
Callanan  Albany 1-23R, RFM     
Peckham Materials  Greene 1-30R, RFM $12.100 $12.000 $12.000 $12.000 
Peckham Materials  Warren 1-11F, R $12.100 $12.000 $12.000 $12.000 
Peckham Materials  Saratoga 1-39R, 1-90F, G     
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-43R  $12.000 $12.000 $12.000 
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-10R, RFM     
Peckham Materials  Essex 1-120F, G     
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-85F, G     

 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 1 (Cont'd.) 
(Albany, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington Counties) 
Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703-
0201F 

703-
0202A 

703-
0202B 

703-
0202C 

Callanan  Rensselaer 1-7R     
Callanan  Albany 1-23R, RFM     
Peckham Materials  Greene 1-30R, RFM $12.000    
Peckham Materials  Warren 1-11F, R $12.000    
Peckham Materials  Saratoga 1-39R, 1-90F, G     
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-43R     
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-10R, RFM     
Peckham Materials  Essex 1-120F, G    $9.000 
Peckham Materials  Washington 1-85F, G    $9.000 

 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 1 (Cont'd.) 
(Albany, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington Counties) 
Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703-
0203H 

703-
0203I 

703-
0203J 

703-
0203K 

Callanan  Rensselaer 1-7R     

Callanan  Albany 1-23R, RFM     

Peckham Materials  Greene 1-30R, RFM     

Peckham Materials  Warren 1-11F, R     

Peckham Materials  Saratoga 1-39R, 1-90F, G     

Peckham Materials  Washington 1-43R     

Peckham Materials  Washington 1-10R, RFM     

Peckham Materials  Essex 1-120F, G  $9.000 $9.000 $9.000 

Peckham Materials  Washington 1-85F, G  $9.000 $9.000 $9.000 
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 1 (Cont'd.) 
(Albany, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington Counties) 
Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703-
0203L 703-03 703-04 703-06 703-07 

Callanan  Rensselaer 1-7R      

Callanan  Albany 1-23R, RFM      

Peckham Materials  Greene 1-30R, RFM      

Peckham Materials  Warren 1-11F, R      

Peckham Materials  Saratoga 1-39R, 1-90F, 
G 

     

Peckham Materials  Washington 1-43R      

Peckham Materials  Washington 1-10R, RFM      

Peckham Materials  Essex 1-120F, G $9.000     

Peckham Materials  Washington 1-85F, G $9.000    $9.000 
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 1 (Cont'd.) 
(Albany, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington Counties) 
Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 712-15A 712-15B A1 A2 A3 

Callanan  Rensselaer 1-7R      

Callanan  Albany 1-23R, RFM      

Peckham Materials  Greene 1-30R, RFM   $9.500 $9.500 $9.500 

Peckham Materials  Warren 1-11F, R $12.000 $12.000 $9.500 $9.500 $9.500 

Peckham Materials  Saratoga 1-39R, 1-90F, G      

Peckham Materials  Washington 1-43R      

Peckham Materials  Washington 1-10R, RFM      

Peckham Materials  Essex 1-120F, G      

Peckham Materials  Washington 1-85F, G      
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 1 (Cont'd.) 
(Albany, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington Counties) 
Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # A4 A5 

Abrasive 
A 

Abrasive 
B 

Callanan Rensselaer 1-7R     

Callanan Albany 1-23R, RFM     

Peckham Materials Greene 1-30R, RFM     

Peckham Materials Warren 1-11F, R     

Peckham Materials Saratoga 1-39R, 1-90F, G   $11.000 $11.000 

Peckham Materials Washington 1-43R     

Peckham Materials Washington 1-10R, RFM   $11.000 $11.000 

Peckham Materials Essex 1-120F, G   $11.000 $11.000 

Peckham Materials Washington 1-85F, G    $11.000 
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 1 (Cont'd.) 
(Albany, Greene, Rensselaer, Saratoga, Schenectady, Warren and Washington Counties) 
Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Hauling 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

Hauling 
0 - 1 Mile 

Hauling 
1+ 

Mile 

Add’l 
1+ Mile 

620.04 

Add’l 
1+ Mile 

620.05 

Add’l 
1+ Mile 

620.06 

Callanan Rensselaer 1-7R     $0.150 
Callanan Albany 1-23R, RFM     $0.150 
Peckham Materials Greene 1-30R, RFM      
Peckham Materials Warren 1-11F, R      
Peckham Materials Saratoga 1-39R, 1-90F, G      
Peckham Materials Washington 1-43R      
Peckham Materials Washington 1-10R, RFM      
Peckham Materials Essex 1-120F, G      
Peckham Materials Washington 1-85F, G      

 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 



GROUP 33700 – FINE AND COARSE AGGREGATES SUPPLEMENTAL PAGE 126 
 (All State Agencies & Political Subdivisions) AWARD  
 

 

 
22197aSupplemental.docx/T06mo 

REGION 2 
(Fulton, Hamilton, Herkimer, Madison, Montgomery and Oneida Counties) 
Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703-
0201B 

703-
0201C 

703-
0201D 

703-
0201E 

Callanan Industries Madison 2-11R $11.500    

Callanan Industries Montgomery 2-5R     
 

AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 2 (Cont'd.) 
(Fulton, Hamilton, Herkimer, Madison, Montgomery and Oneida Counties) 
Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Hauling 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

Hauling 
0 – 1 Mile 

 Hauling 
1+ Mile 

Add’l 
1+ Mile 

620.04 

Add’l 
1+ Mile 

620.05 

Add’l 
1+ Mile 

620.06 

Callanan Industries Madison 2-11R   $0.200 $0.180 $0.180 

Callanan Industries Montgomery 2-5R   $0.200 $0.180 $0.180 

AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 3 
(Cayuga, Cortland, Onondaga, Oswego, Seneca and Tompkins Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 203.06 203.07 203.20 304.11 304.12 

Seneca Stone Seneca 3-4R     $8.500 
 
 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 304.13 304.14 304.14A 

17304. 
1011 

Seneca Stone Seneca 3-4R  $8.000   
 
 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 605.0901 605.1001 605.1101 620.02 620.03 

Seneca Stone Seneca 3-4R $11.500 $12.500   $13.000 
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 3 (Cont'd.) 
(Cayuga, Cortland, Onondaga, Oswego, Seneca and Tompkins Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 620.04 620.05 620.06 620.08 

703-
0201A 

Seneca Stone Seneca 3-4R     $12.500 
 
 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703-
0201B 

703-
0201C 

703-
0201D 

703-
0201E 

Seneca Stone Seneca 3-4R  $11.500 $11.500  
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 3 (Cont'd.) 
(Cayuga, Cortland, Onondaga, Oswego, Seneca and Tompkins Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # A4 A5 

Abrasive 
A 

Abrasive 
B 

Seneca Stone Seneca 3-4R $8.250 $8.250   
 
 

   
Hauling 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

Hauling 
0 - 1 Mile 

Hauling 
1+ Mile 

Add’l 
1+Mile 
620.04 

Add’l  
1+Mile 
620.05 

Add’l 
1+Mile 
620.06 

Seneca Stone Seneca 3-4R $1.000 $0.300 $0.150 $0.150 $0.150 
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 6 
(Allegany, Chemung, Schuyler, Steuben and Yates) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 203.06 203.07 203.20 304.11 304.12 

Dalrymple Gravel Chemung 6-21F, G  $9.000    

Dalrymple Gravel Steuben 6-75F, G  $9.000    
 
 
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 8 
(Columbia, Dutchess, Orange, Putnam, Rockland, Ulster and Westchester Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material  

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 203.06 203.07 203.20 304.11 304.12 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM $8.000 $8.000 $8.000 $10.000 $10.000 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R $10.000 $10.000 $10.000   

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R $10.000 $10.000 $10.000   
 
 

   
Material  

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 304.13 304.14 304.14A 

17304. 
1011 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM $10.000 $10.000 $10.000 $10.000 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R     

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R     
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 8 (Cont'd.) 
(Columbia, Dutchess, Orange, Putnam, Rockland, Ulster and Westchester Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 605.0901 605.1001 605.1101 620.02 620.03 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM $12.000 $14.000 $12.000 $10.000 $10.000 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R    $12.750 $12.750 

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R    $12.750 $12.750 
 
 

   
Material  

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 620.04 620.05 620.06 620.08 

703- 
0201A 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM $15.000 $16.000 $16.000 12.000 $14.000 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R      

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R      
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 8 (Cont'd.) 
(Columbia, Dutchess, Orange, Putnam, Rockland, Ulster and Westchester Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703- 
0201B 

703- 
0201C 

703- 
0201D 

703- 
0201E 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM $12.000 $12.000 $12.000 $12.000 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R    $15.000 

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R    $15.000 
 
 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703- 
0201F 

703- 
0202A 

703- 
0202B 

703- 
0202C 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM $12.000 NA NA NA 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R     

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R     
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 8 (Cont'd.) 
(Columbia, Dutchess, Orange, Putnam, Rockland, Ulster and Westchester Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703-
0202D 

703-
0202E 

703-
0202F 

703-
0203G 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM NA NA NA NA 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R     

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R     
 
 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703- 
0203H 

703- 
0203I 

703- 
0203J 

703- 
0203K 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM NA NA NA NA 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R     

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R     
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 8 (Cont'd.) 
(Columbia, Dutchess, Orange, Putnam, Rockland, Ulster and Westchester Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703- 
0203L 703-03 703-04 703-06 703-07 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM NA $12.000 $12.000 $12.000 $12.000 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R      

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R      
 
 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 712-15A 712-15B A1 A2 A3 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM $15.000 $15.000 $10.000 $10.000 $10.000 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R      

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R      
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
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REGION 8 (Cont'd.) 
(Columbia, Dutchess, Orange, Putnam, Rockland, Ulster and Westchester Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # A4 A5 

Abrasive 
A 

Abrasive 
B 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM $10.000 $10.000 $10.000 $10.000 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R     

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R     
 
 

   
Hauling 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

Hauling 
0 - 1 Mile 

Hauling 
1+ Mile 

Add’l 
1+ Mile 

620.04 

Add’l 
1+ Mile 

620.05 

Add’l 
1+ Mile 

620.06 

Century Aggregates Litchfield 8-46R/RFM AP AP AP AP AP 

Dutchess Quarry Orange 8-5R      

Dutchess Quarry Dutchess 8-3R      
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 



GROUP 33700 – FINE AND COARSE AGGREGATES SUPPLEMENTAL PAGE 138 
 (All State Agencies & Political Subdivisions) AWARD  
 

 

 
22197aSupplemental.docx/T06mo 

REGION 9 
(Broome, Chenango, Delaware, Otsego, Schoharie, Sullivan and Tioga Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 203.06 203.07 203.20 304.11 304.12 

Callanan Industries Sullivan 9-37R/RFM $8.500 $8.500 $8.500 $8.500 $9.400 
 
 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 304.13 304.14 304.14A 

17304. 
1011 

Callanan Industries Sullivan 9-37R/RFM $9.400    
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 



GROUP 33700 – FINE AND COARSE AGGREGATES SUPPLEMENTAL PAGE 139 
 (All State Agencies & Political Subdivisions) AWARD  
 

 

 
22197aSupplemental.docx/T06mo 

REGION 9 (Cont'd.) 
(Broome, Chenango, Delaware, Otsego, Schoharie, Sullivan and Tioga Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 605.0901 605.1001 605.1101 620.02 620.03 

Callanan Industries Sullivan 9-37R/RFM  $14.500    
 
 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 620.04 620.05 620.06 620.08 

703- 
0201A 

Callanan Industries Sullivan 9-37R/RFM $15.000 $15.000 $14.000  $14.500 
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 



GROUP 33700 – FINE AND COARSE AGGREGATES SUPPLEMENTAL PAGE 140 
 (All State Agencies & Political Subdivisions) AWARD  
 

 

 
22197aSupplemental.docx/T06mo 

REGION 9 (Cont'd.) 
(Broome, Chenango, Delaware, Otsego, Schoharie, Sullivan and Tioga Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material 

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # 

703- 
0201B 

703- 
0201C 

703- 
0201D 

703- 
0201E 

Callanan Industries Sullivan 9-37R/RFM $12.750    
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
  



GROUP 33700 – FINE AND COARSE AGGREGATES SUPPLEMENTAL PAGE 141 
 (All State Agencies & Political Subdivisions) AWARD  
 

 

 
22197aSupplemental.docx/T06mo 

REGION 9 (Cont'd.) 
(Broome, Chenango, Delaware, Otsego, Schoharie, Sullivan and Tioga Counties) 

Price FOB Plant/Net Ton 

   
Material  

Contractor 
Supply 
County DOT # A4 A5 

Abrasive 
A 

Abrasive 
B 

Callanan Industries Sullivan 9-37R/RFM   $10.400 $10.400 
 
AP – Award Pending 
NB – No Bid 
NA – No Award 
 

*   *   *   *   * 


