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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  Natural Gas Interruptible Customers using Heating Oil  
DATE:  December 14, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: Jeffery Giocondo     | 518-474-9621 |          Jeffery.giocondo @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 

PC66709 
PC66710 
PC66711 
PC66712 
PC66713 
PC66714 
PC66715 
PC66716 
PC66717 
PC66718 
PC66719 

  PC66720 

CONTRACTOR: 

Adirondack Energy Products 
East Coast Petroleum Inc. 
Global Montello Group Corp. 
Heritagenergy Inc. 
James River Solutions 
Main Brothers Oil DBA Main Care Energy 
Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy 
Products 
Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. DBA Bottini Fuel 
NOCO Energy Corp. 
Sprague Operating Resources LLC. 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

  United Metro Energy Corp. 
    
 Procurement Services has been notified that National Grid interruptible gas service customers 
must switch to an alternate fuel no later than Thursday, December 15, 2016 at 10:00am until further 
notice.  Con Edison interruptible gas service customers must be off at 1:00am on Friday, December 
16, 2016 until Saturday at 10:00am. 
 
 All Authorized Users should contact their supplier for confirmation and updates. 
  
 Users of Natural Gas Interruptible supply that will switch over to Heating Oil during interruptible and/or 
curtailment events are reminded that before switching to heating oil it is a requirement that you must have a 
minimum of a 10 day supply on hand at all times. 
 
 Where a 10 day supply is not physically possible then there should be full tanks available during the 
upcoming coldest parts of the year. 
 
 In the colder months delivery delays may occur and we request that you plan ahead and work with 
your fuel oil supplier to ensure an adequate supply. During these events please be aware that other facilities 
may be designated a human needs customer placing them as a higher priority. Such as hospitals and 
nursing homes for which having heat is essential. 
 

All other terms and conditions of this award remain unchanged. 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  CHANGE IN INDEX USED FOR SYRACUSE KEROSENE 

PRICE ADJUSTMENTS 
DATE:  October 6, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: James Patrick   | 518-408-1026 |  james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 

PC66709 
PC66710 
PC66712 
PC66713 
PC66714 
PC66715 
PC66716 
PC66717 
PC66718 
PC66719 

  PC66720 

CONTRACTOR: 

Adirondack Energy Products 
East Coast Petroleum Inc. 
Heritagenergy Inc. 
James River Solutions 
Main Brothers Oil DBA Main Care Energy 
Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 
Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. DBA Bottini Fuel 
NOCO Energy Corp. 
Sprague Operating Resources LLC. 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

  United Metro Energy Corp. 
    
Please be advised that as of October 7, 2016, the weekly fuel price adjustments for Syracuse kerosene will 
be based solely on the low posting published in OPIS’s Oil Price Daily, as was the basis of the original bid 
(June 19, 2014) and award (November 20, 2014), due to inconsistent reporting of both a high and a low 
posted price. 
 
The state may periodically adjust pricing based on market conditions, as outlined in the “Price Revisions” 
clause from the IFB states, “Should postings differ from current description and/or format, a posting 
determined, by the Commissioner in his/her sole discretion; to be most reflective of market conditions will be 
used.”  OGS Procurement Services has determined that use of the low kerosene price for the Syracuse 
location is in the best interest of the state, and is in keeping with the original bid price basis.  
 
All other terms and conditions remain the same.   
 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  Contract Renewals 
DATE:  September 12, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to August 30, 2018 

CONTACT: James Patrick   | 518-408-1026 |  james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 

PC66709 
PC66710 
PC66712 
PC66713 
PC66714 
PC66715 
PC66716 
PC66717 
PC66718 
PC66719 

  PC66720 

CONTRACTOR: 

Adirondack Energy Products 
East Coast Petroleum Inc. 
Heritagenergy Inc. 
James River Solutions 
Main Brothers Oil DBA Main Care Energy 
Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 
Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. DBA Bottini Fuel 
NOCO Energy Corp. 
Sprague Operating Resources LLC. 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

  United Metro Energy Corp. 
    
The following contracts are being renewed to August 30, 2018. 
PC66712 Heritagenergy Inc. 
PC66714 Main Brothers Oil DBA Main Care Energy 
*PC66715 Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 
PC66716 Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. DBA Bottini Fuel 
PC66717 NOCO Energy Corp 
PC66718 Sprague Operating Resources LLC 
PC66719 Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 
PC66720 United Metro Energy Corp 
 
The following contracts are not being renewed and will expire November 17, 2016 
PC66709 Adirondack Energy Products 
PC66710 East Coast Petroleum Inc. 
PC66713 James River Solutions 
*PC66715 Mirabito is not renewing the following counties:  Schenectady, #2-MT Fuel and Schoharie, 

#2-MT Fuel 
 
 
The fuel types and counties for the contracts not being renewed including the two counties for Mirabito are to 
be re-bid along with any new fuel types from the recent filed requirements. 
 
 
 
 
All other terms and conditions remain the same.   
 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  Price Correction for Utica Posting Location #2 fuel oil 
DATE:  August 12, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: James Patrick   | 518-408-1026 |  james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 

PC66709 
PC66710 
PC66712 
PC66713 
PC66714 
PC66715 
PC66716 
PC66717 
PC66718 
PC66719 

  PC66720 

CONTRACTOR: 

Adirondack Energy Products 
East Coast Petroleum Inc. 
Heritagenergy Inc. 
James River Solutions 
Main Brothers Oil DBA Main Care Energy 
Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 
Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. DBA Bottini Fuel 
NOCO Energy Corp. 
Sprague Operating Resources LLC. 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

  United Metro Energy Corp. 
    
Please be advised that the pricing for #2 heating oil (using the Utica OPIS posting location) for the week of 
9-2-16 through 9-8-16 is being corrected to reflect the correct pricing denoted below.   
The OPIS low was entered as 1.4550 when it should have been entered as 1.4540.  
 
Chenango -  2-TW  $1.8140 
Fulton -   2-MT   $1.4956 
Fulton -   2-TW  $1.6506 
Hamilton -   2-MT   $1.5453 
Herkimer -   2-MT   $1.5006 
Herkimer -   2-TW  $1.7006 
Jefferson -   2-MT   $1.5006 
Jefferson -   2-TW  $1.6606 
Lewis -   2-TW  $1.6806 
Madison -   2-TW  $1.6656 
Montgomery -  2-MT   $1.4970 
Montgomery -  2-TW  $1.6506 
Oneida -   2-MT   $1.4856 
Oneida -   2-TW  $1.6006 
Onondaga -  2-TW  $1.6055 
Oswego -   2-MT   $1.4956 
Oswego -   2-TW  $1.6055 
 
All other terms and conditions remain the same.   
 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  CHANGE IN INDEX USED FOR BOSTON POSTING PRICE 

ADJUSTMENTS 
DATE:  August 12, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: James Patrick   | 518-408-1026 |  james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 

PC66709 
PC66710 
PC66712 
PC66713 
PC66714 
PC66715 
PC66716 
PC66717 
PC66718 
PC66719 

  PC66720 

CONTRACTOR: 

Adirondack Energy Products 
East Coast Petroleum Inc. 
Heritagenergy Inc. 
James River Solutions 
Main Brothers Oil DBA Main Care Energy 
Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 
Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. DBA Bottini Fuel 
NOCO Energy Corp. 
Sprague Operating Resources LLC. 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

  United Metro Energy Corp. 
    
Please be advised that as of August 12, 2016, the weekly fuel price adjustments for No. 6.5% and No. 4.5% 
Heating Oil utilizing the Boston OPIS posting location will be based solely on the low due to a change in 
OPIS that no longer receives a high price submission. 
 
The state may periodically adjust pricing based on market conditions, as outlined in the “Price Revisions” 
clause from the IFB states, “Should postings differ from current description and/or format, a posting 
determined, by the Commissioner in his/her sole discretion; to be most reflective of market conditions will be 
used.”  OGS Procurement Services has determined that use of the low kerosene price for the Boston 
location is in the best interest of the state, and is in keeping with the original bid price basis.  
 
All other terms and conditions remain the same.   
 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  CHANGE IN INDEX USED FOR BOSTON POSTING PRICE 

ADJUSTMENTS 
DATE:  August 12, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: James Patrick   | 518-408-1026 |  james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 

PC66709 
PC66710 
PC66712 
PC66713 
PC66714 
PC66715 
PC66716 
PC66717 
PC66718 
PC66719 

  PC66720 

CONTRACTOR: 

Adirondack Energy Products 
East Coast Petroleum Inc. 
Heritagenergy Inc. 
James River Solutions 
Main Brothers Oil DBA Main Care Energy 
Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 
Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. DBA Bottini Fuel 
NOCO Energy Corp. 
Sprague Operating Resources LLC. 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

  United Metro Energy Corp. 
    
Please be advised that as of August 12, 2016, the weekly fuel price adjustments for No. 6.5% and No. 4.5% 
Heating Oil utilizing the Boston OPIS posting location will be based solely on the low due to a change in 
OPIS that no longer receives a high price submission. 
 
The state may periodically adjust pricing based on market conditions, as outlined in the “Price Revisions” 
clause from the IFB states, “Should postings differ from current description and/or format, a posting 
determined, by the Commissioner in his/her sole discretion; to be most reflective of market conditions will be 
used.”  OGS Procurement Services has determined that use of the low kerosene price for the Utica location 
is in the best interest of the state, and is in keeping with the original bid price basis.  
 
All other terms and conditions remain the same.   
 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  New Contract Administrator for Superior Plus Energy  
DATE:  July 1, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: James Patrick   | 518-408-1026 |  james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 
 
PC66719 

   
CONTRACTOR: 

 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

   
    
Effective Immediately please be advised that there is a new contact for Superior Plus Energy Services Inc. 
D/B/A Griffith Energy 
This person has replaced Paul Tandlmayer. 
 
Teri Payne  
800-724-2552  
FAX No.: 877-776-9358  
E-mail: tpayne@superiorplusenergy.com  
 
All other terms and conditions remain the same.   
 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  JUNE 10, 2016 REVISED PRICING FOR UTICA #2 FUEL 

OIL  
DATE:  June 15, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: James Patrick   | 518-408-1026 |  james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 
 
PC66715 
PC66719 

   

CONTRACTOR: 
 
Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

   
    
Please be advised that the pricing for #2 Heating Fuel Oil in the following counties is being adjusted due to 
a miscalculation effecting the Utica OPIS location pricing of June 9, 2016.  The price adjustments below are 
retroactively revised and effective from Friday June 10, 2016 through Thursday June 16, 2016: 
 
 

COUNTY FUEL TYPE INCORRECT PRICE REVISED PRICE CONTRACTOR 
Chenango #2 TW $2.1674 $1.9856 Mirabito Holdings Inc. 
Fulton #2 MT $1.8490 $1.6672 Superior Plus 
Fulton #2 TW $2.0040 $1.8222 Superior Plus 
Hamilton #2 MT $1.8987 $1.7169 Mirabito Holdings Inc. 
Herkimer #2 MT $1.8540 $1.6722 Superior Plus 
Herkimer #2 TW $2.0540 $1.8722 Superior Plus 
Jefferson #2 MT $1.8540 $1.6722 Superior Plus 
Jefferson #2 TW $2.0140 $1.8722 Superior Plus 
Lewis #2 TW $2.0340 $1.8522 Superior Plus 
Madison #2 TW $2.0190 $1.8372 Superior Plus 
Montgomery #2 MT $1.8540 $1.6686 Superior Plus 
Montgomery #2 TW $2.0040 $1.8222 Superior Plus 
Oneida  #2 MT $1.9540 $1.6572 Superior Plus 
Oneida  #2 TW $2.1700 $1.7722 Superior Plus 
Onondaga #2 TW $1.9589 $1.7771 Superior Plus 
Oswego #2 MT $1.8490 $1.6672 Superior Plus 
Oswego #2 TW $1.9589 $1.7771 Superior Plus 

 
All other terms and conditions remain the same.   
 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  CHANGE IN INDEX USED FOR BUFFALO KEROSENE 

PRICE ADJUSTMENTS 
DATE:  April 21, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: James Patrick   | 518-408-1026 |  james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 

PC66709 
PC66710 
PC66712 
PC66713 
PC66714 
PC66715 
PC66716 
PC66717 
PC66718 
PC66719 

  PC66720 

CONTRACTOR: 

Adirondack Energy Products 
East Coast Petroleum Inc. 
Heritagenergy Inc. 
James River Solutions 
Main Brothers Oil DBA Main Care Energy 
Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 
Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. DBA Bottini Fuel 
NOCO Energy Corp. 
Sprague Operating Resources LLC. 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

  United Metro Energy Corp. 
    
Please be advised that as of April 22, 2016, the weekly fuel price adjustments for Buffalo kerosene will be 
based solely on the low posting published in OPIS’s Oil Price Daily, as was the basis of the original bid 
(June 19, 2014) and award (November 20, 2014), due to inconsistent reporting of both a high and a low 
posted price. 
 
The state may periodically adjust pricing based on market conditions, as outlined in the “Price Revisions” 
clause from the IFB states, “Should postings differ from current description and/or format, a posting 
determined, by the Commissioner in his/her sole discretion; to be most reflective of market conditions will be 
used.”  OGS Procurement Services has determined that use of the low kerosene price for the Utica location 
is in the best interest of the state, and is in keeping with the original bid price basis.  
 
All other terms and conditions remain the same.   
 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  CHANGE IN INDEX USED FOR UTICA KEROSENE PRICE 

ADJUSTMENTS 
DATE:  February 3, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: James Patrick   | 518-408-1026 |  james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 

PC66709 
PC66710 
PC66712 
PC66713 
PC66714 
PC66715 
PC66716 
PC66717 
PC66718 
PC66719 

  PC66720 

CONTRACTOR: 

Adirondack Energy Products 
East Coast Petroleum Inc. 
Heritagenergy Inc. 
James River Solutions 
Main Brothers Oil DBA Main Care Energy 
Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 
Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. DBA Bottini Fuel 
NOCO Energy Corp. 
Sprague Operating Resources LLC. 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

  United Metro Energy Corp. 
    
Please be advised that as of January 29, 2016, the weekly fuel price adjustments for Utica kerosene will be 
based solely on the low posting published in OPIS’s Oil Price Daily, as was the basis of the original bid 
(June 19, 2014) and award (November 20, 2014), due to inconsistent reporting of both a high and a low 
posted price. 
 
The state may periodically adjust pricing based on market conditions, as outlined in the “Price Revisions” 
clause from the IFB states, “Should postings differ from current description and/or format, a posting 
determined, by the Commissioner in his/her sole discretion; to be most reflective of market conditions will be 
used.”  OGS Procurement Services has determined that use of the low kerosene price for the Utica location 
is in the best interest of the state, and is in keeping with the original bid price basis.  
 
All other terms and conditions remain the same.   
 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  Contract Assignment 
DATE:  January 14, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: James Patrick   | 518-408-1026 |   james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: PC66711 
PC66712 CONTRACTOR: Global Montello Group Corp. 

Heritagenergy Inc. 
    
Effective January 15, 2016 Global Montello Group Corp. Contract PC66711 has been assigned to 
Heritagenergy Inc. Contract PC66712.  Any outstanding invoices for Global Montello Group Corp. PC66711 
will be processed as normal. 
 
Any automatic deliveries with Global Montello Group Corp. will be cancelled and will require reestablishing 
the service through Heritagenergy Inc. 
 
Authorized users of #2 fuel oil in the following counties are to switch to Heritagenergy Contract PC66712  
 
Putnam  - #2 Fuel Tank Wagon (TW) & Motor Transport (MT) 
Rockland  - #2 Fuel Tank Wagon (TW) & Motor Transport (MT) 
Sullivan  - #2 Fuel Tank Wagon (TW)  
 
There will be no price increases other than the standard weekly price adjustments. 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  Natural Gas Interruptible Customers using Heating Oil  
DATE:  January 8, 2016 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: James Patrick        | 518-408-1026 |             james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 

PC66709 
PC66710 
PC66711 
PC66712 
PC66713 
PC66714 
PC66715 
PC66716 
PC66717 
PC66718 
PC66719 

  PC66720 

CONTRACTOR: 

Adirondack Energy Products 
East Coast Petroleum Inc. 
Global Montello Group Corp. 
Heritagenergy Inc. 
James River Solutions 
Main Brothers Oil DBA Main Care Energy 
Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy 
Products 
Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. DBA Bottini Fuel 
NOCO Energy Corp. 
Sprague Operating Resources LLC. 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

  United Metro Energy Corp. 
    
Users of Natural Gas Interruptible supply that will switch over to Heating Oil during interruptible and/or 
curtailment events are reminded that before switching to heating oil it is a requirement that you must have a 
minimum of a 10 day supply on hand at all times. 
 
Where a 10 day supply is not physically possible then there should be full tanks available during the 
upcoming coldest parts of the year. 
 
In the colder months delivery delays may occur and we request that you plan ahead and work with your fuel 
oil supplier to ensure an adequate supply. During these events please be aware that other facilities may be 
designated a human needs customer placing them as a higher priority. Such as hospitals and nursing homes 
for which having heat is essential. 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.services@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  July 10, 2015 Price Correction & NYC Clean Heat Act. 
DATE:  July 14, 2015 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Heating Fuel Oil 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 to November 20, 2016 

CONTACT: James Patrick        | 518-408-1026 |             james.patrick @ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.: 

PC66709 
PC66710 
PC66711 
PC66712 
PC66713 
PC66714 
PC66715 
PC66716 
PC66717 
PC66718 
PC66719 

  PC66720 

CONTRACTOR: 

Adirondack Energy Products 
East Coast Petroleum Inc. 
Global Montello Group Corp. 
Heritagenergy Inc. 
James River Solutions 
Main Brothers Oil DBA Main Care Energy 
Mirabito Holdings Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy 
Products 
Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. DBA Bottini Fuel 
NOCO Energy Corp. 
Sprague Operating Resources LLC. 
Superior Plus Energy Services DBA Griffith Energy 

  United Metro Energy Corp. 
    
There is a slight adjustment in regards to #2 B2 fuels for NYC. The Correct prices are as follows: 
 
2-MT NYC B2 $1.8678 per gallon 
2-TW NYC B2 $1.8975 per gallon 
 
The following counties for #2 fuel pricing has been corrected  
 
Counties: 
Albany, Clinton, Delaware, Essex, Franklin, Otsego, Rensselaer, St Lawrence 
Saratoga, Schenectady, Schoharie, Warren, Washington 
 
The correct Prices are as follows: 
Albany      St. Lawrence  
2MT $1.7412    2TW $1.8061  2MT $1.7513 2TW $1.8713 
Clinton      Saratoga 
2MT $1.7252 2TW $1.8614  2MT $1.7331  2TW $1.8449 
Delaware      Schenectady  
2MT $1.7506 2TW $2.0156  2MT $1.7273 2TW $1.8449 
Essex       Schoharie 
2MT $1.7463 2TW $1.8835  2MT $1.7315 2TW $1.8642 
Franklin      Warren 
2MT $1.7252 2TW $1.8652  2MT $1.7572 2TW $1.8682 
Otsego      Washington 
2MT $1.7329 2TW $1.9841  2MT $1.7490 2TW $1.8582 
Rensselaer 
2TW $1.8409 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779Can.htm
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NYC Clean Heat Act - Authorized users of #4 and #6 fuels in NYC need to be aware of the NYC Clean Heat 
Act  

Regulations 
Regulations issued by the New York City Department of Environmental Protection will phase out the use of No. 4 
heavy heating oil in New York City.  The regulations were designed to balance near-term pollution reduction while 
minimizing costs for buildings. 

• All new boiler or burner installations must utilize one of the cleanest fuels, which may include natural gas, 
ultra-low sulfur 2 oil, biodiesel, or steam. 

• Beginning July 1, 2012, No. 6 oil Certificate of Operations will not be issued.  At a minimum, buildings will be 
required to convert to a fuel as clean as No. 4 oil.  

• All No. 6 oil Certificate of Operations expired on or before June 30, 2015. 
• All buildings must convert to one of the cleanest fuels upon boiler or burner retirement or by January 1, 2030, 

whichever is sooner. 

To find out when your building will be required to switch to a cleaner fuel go to the website at: 

https://www.nyccleanheat.org/sites/default/files/public//DEP%20Rules_Heavy%20Oil%20Phase-
out%20(Apr%2021%202011).pdf 
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Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | www.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717 

Contract Award Notification Update 
Subject:  Heating Oil Price Correction for May 29th  
DATE: June 4, 2015 AWARD #: 22779 GROUP #: 05500 

AWARD DESCRIPTION: Fuel Oil, Heating 

CONTRACT PERIOD: November 21, 2014 – November 20, 2016 

CONTACT:      James Patrick                          | 518-408-1026 |              james.patrick@ogs.ny.gov 

CONTRACT NO.:  PC66719 CONTRACTOR:   Superior Plus Energy 

    
There is a slight price correction for Kerosene using the Buffalo posting location on the weekly price list 
beginning May 29, 2015 ending June 4, 2015. 
 
The correct Kerosene prices for the following counties are as follows: 
 
Ontario and Orleans County 
Posted Price is $2.9973, the correct price is $2.9995 
 
Wayne County 
Posted Price is $3.0773, the correct price is $3.0795 
 
 
All other terms and conditions of this award remain unchanged 
 

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779can.htm


  
New York State Office Of General Services 

NY State Procurement (NYSPro) 
Corning Tower Building - 38th Floor 

Empire State Plaza 
Albany, New York  12242 
http://nyspro.ogs.ny.gov 

 

CONTRACT AWARD NOTIFICATION 
 

Title  : Group 05500 – Fuel Oil, Heating (Grades #2, #4, 
#6, Kerosene and Bioheating Fuel) (Statewide) 
Classification Code(s):  15 

Award Number : 22779 (Replaces Award  22685) 

Contract Period : November 21, 2014 – November 20, 2016 

Bid Opening Date : August 20, 2014  

Date of Issue : November 21, 2014 

Specification Reference : As Incorporated Herein. 

Contractor Information : Appears on Page 2 of this Award 
 

Address Inquiries To: 

State Agencies & Vendors Political Subdivisions & Others 
Name  : 
Title : 
Phone : 
Fax : 
E-mail : 

James Patrick  
Contract Manager Specialist 1 
518-408-1026 
518-474-2437 
James.patrick@ogs.ny.gov 

New York State Procurement (NYSPro) 
Customer Services 

Phone : 
Fax : 
E-mail : 

518-474-6717 
518-474-2437 
customer.services@ogs.ny.gov 

 
The New York State Procurement values your input. 

Complete and return "Contract Performance Report" at end of document. 
 

Description 
The purpose of this Award is to provide Authorized Users with a means of acquiring various grades 
of Fuel Oil, Heating for use at State and Non-State Agencies throughout New York State. The product shall 
be Contractor furnished, delivered and unloaded as specified herein. The pricing included in this document 
is the pricing bid by the contractors. For current pricing please go to the Pricing Information link listed 
below in this document. 

 
PR # 22779 
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For links to the current Prices, Contractor contact information and Contract Terms and For links to the current 
Prices, Contractor contact information and Contract Terms and Conditions for this Award, please see the 
Contractor Information page located http://www.ogs.ny.gov/purchase/spg/awards/0550022779can.htm 

    
   FED.ID 
CONTRACT # CONTRACTOR & ADDRESS CONTACT INFO. NYS VENDOR ID 
 
PC66709 Adirondack Energy Products, Inc. 518-483-3835 141719550 
 17 Junction Rd Sean Burke 1000007084 
 Malone, NY, 12953 Fax:  518-483-2005 
  E-mail:  sean@adirondackenergy.com 
 
Contact for Expediting & Emergency after hours / weekends Brian Monette  
Same Phone & Fax Numbers Vice President 
  Bjmonette@aol.com 
 
 
PC66710 East Coast Petroleum Inc. 718-402-5107  133762228 
                                 340 Jackson Avenue Elaine Cintron  1100005431 
                                 Bronx, NY 10454 Fax: 718-402-4336 
  info@eastcoastpetro.com 
 
 
Contact for Expediting & Emergency after hours / weekends Anthony Milanese  
Same Phone & Fax Numbers President   
Toll Free Phone 800-545-9155 amilanese@eastcoastpetro.com 
 
 
PC66711 Global Montello Group Corp. 781-398-4003 043443028 
 800 South Street Fax: 781-398-9213 1100005467 
 Waltham, MA  02454 
 Includes Expediting: Bids Group: Christina Fortin, Katie Doherty, Mike Simari 
  E-mail:  bids@globalp.com 
  1-800-542-0778 x 4003 
 
Emergency after Hours & Weekend / Holiday Dispatch Department available 24/7  
  1-800 826-5686   
  Fax 617-660-1141 
  E-mail: oildelivery@globalp.com 
 
 
PC66712 Heritagenergy Inc. 845-336-2000 ext. 3306 141463572 
 625 Sawkill Rd. Fax: 845-336-7410 1000051453 
 Kingston, NY 12401 Anne Larkin-Ede 
  E-mail:  aede@heritagenergy.com 
  1-800-451-3835 
 
Expediting Orders: Heritagenergy Customer Service 
  845-336-200 toll free 845-336-7410 
 
Emergency after Hours & Weekend / Holidays Heritaagenergy Emergency Service 
  845-336-2000 Toll Free 800-451-3835 
  Fax 845-336-7410 
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   FED.ID 
CONTRACT # CONTRACTOR & ADDRESS CONTACT INFO. NYS VENDOR ID 
 
PC66713 James River Solutions 804-358-9000 320135618 
 10487 Lakeridge Parkway Fax: 804-359-6307 1100131597 
 Ashland, VA 23005 Bridget Bailey 
 WBE - VA E-mail:  bbailey@jrpetro.com 
  800-825-5599 
 
Expediting Orders:  Darlene Harris, Customer Services Manager 
  804-358-9000 ext. 318 
   
Emergency after Hours & Weekend / Holidays Darlene Harris, Cleveland Planz, Allyn Swarts, Sunday Mitchell 
  Customer Service   
  804-393-1150 
   
 
PC66714 Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 518-438-7856 146024844 
 D/B/A Main Care Energy Fax: 518-438-5991 1000007301 
 1 Booth la David Borger, Operations Manager 
 Albany, NY 12211 E-mail:  dborger@maincareenergy.com 
  1-800-542-5552 
 
Expediting, Emergency after hours & Weekend Holiday same as above.  
 
 
PC66715 MIRABITO HOLDINGS, INC. 607-352-2958 150552668 
 D/B/A Mirabito Energy Products Fax: 607-584-5133 1000007358 
 The Metrocenter Joe D'Esti 
 49 Court Street E-mail:  joseph.desti@mirabito.com 
                                PO Box 5306  
      Binghamton, NY 13902 
 
Expediting, Emergency after hours & Weekend / Holiday         Gene Fuller / Joe Combes / John Martin 
               Transportation 
                             607-561-2727 
                                                        Fax: 607-432-2803 
 
PC66716 Morgan Fuel & Heating Co. Inc. 845-297-5580 ext. 1309 141420673 
 D/B/A Bottini Fuel Fax: 845-297-0817 1000006688 
 2785 West Main St. Vince Eagan Jr. 
 Wappinger Falls, NY 12590 E-mail:  veaganjr@bottinifuel.com 
                800-836-3835 
 
Emergency Contact after Hours, Weekend / Holiday          Dave Wood, Operations Manager 
                                           845-297-5580 ext. 1601 
                dwood@bottinifuel.com 
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   FED.ID 
CONTRACT # CONTRACTOR & ADDRESS CONTACT INFO. NYS VENDOR ID 
 
PC66717 NOCO Energy Corp. 716-614-1230 160727383 
 2440 Sheridan Drive Fax: 716-874-7032 1000007468 
 Tonawanda, NY 14150 Tom Spitznogle 
  E-mail:  tspitznogle@noco.com 
                800-601-6626 
 
Expediting Orders:              Alicia Lineberger, Customer Services Manager 
                716-614-1148 
                E-mail: alineberger@noco.com 
   
Emergency after Hours & Weekend / Holidays            Keven Galas, Manager Fleet Operations 
                                            716-435-7309 
                 E-mail: kgalas@noco.com 
 
PC66718 Sprague Operating Resources LLC. 1-914-328-6726 020415440 
 185 International Drive Fax: 1-914-517-2640 1000005203 
 Portsmouth, NH 03801 Customer Care Team 
  E-mail:  orders@spragueenergy.com 
                1-800-880-6037 
 
Expediting, Emergency after hours & Weekend Holiday same as above. 
 
PC66719 Superior Plus Energy Services Inc. 1-800-724-2552 160736353 
 D/B/A Griffith Energy Fax: 1-877-776-9358 1000007474 
 1870 Winton Road S Paul Tandlmayer, Director 
 Rochester, NY 14618 E-mail:  ptandlmayer@griffithenergy.com 
        
Emergency Contact after Hours, Weekend / Holiday          Central Dispatch / Emergency Service 
                                           800-955-5992 
                 
 
PC66720 United Metro Energy Corp. (718) 389-5800 EXT 173 462112871 
 500 Kingsland Ave. Fax: (718) 383-6586 1100082712 
 Brooklyn, NY 11222 Robert Leavy    
  E-mail: robertleavy@umecny.com 
       
Expediting Orders:              Scott Alnwick, Dispatch Manager 
                646-739-3004 
                Fax: 718-383-2499 
   
Emergency after Hours & Weekend / Holidays            Edward Abreu, Customer Service Manager 
                                            718-383-1400 
                 Fax: 718-383-2499 
                 E-mail: edwardabrue@umecny.com 
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Cash Discount, If Shown, Should be Given Special Attention. 
INVOICES MUST BE SENT DIRECTLY TO THE ORDERING AGENCY FOR PAYMENT. 

(See "Contract Payments" and "Electronic Payments" in this document.) 
 
AGENCIES SHOULD NOTIFY THE NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT PROMPTLY IF THE CONTRACTOR FAILS TO 
MEET DELIVERY OR OTHER TERMS OF THIS CONTRACT.  PRODUCTS OR SERVICES WHICH DO NOT COMPLY 
WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS OR ARE OTHERWISE UNSATISFACTORY TO THE AGENCY SHOULD ALSO BE 
REPORTED TO THE NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT. 
 
SMALL, MINORITY AND WOMEN-OWNED BUSINESSES: 

 The letters SB listed under the Contract Number indicate the contractor is a NYS small business.  
Additionally, the letters MBE and WBE indicate the contractor is a Minority-owned Business Enterprise 
and/or Woman-owned Business Enterprise. 

 
 
Awards by County and item type – The prices listed here are the bid prices and not the sell prices. 
Albany 

2-MT Mirabito Energy Products $3.0782  
2-TW Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc $3.1431  
6-MT (1.5%) Sprague  $3.0942  
KERO (Heating) Mirabito Energy Products $3.6531  

 
Allegany 

2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1353 
 
Bronx 

2-MT NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $3.0973  
2-TW NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $3.1270  
4-MT (0.15%) NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $2.8893  
6-MT (0.3%) NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $2.6552  

 
Broome 

2-MT Mirabito Energy Products $3.1342  
2-TW James River Solutions $3.2003  
KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $3.6590  

 
Cattaraugus 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1354  
2-TW NOCO Energy Corp. $3.2554  

 
Cayuga 
2-MT Mirabito Energy Products $3.1472  
2-TW James River Solutions $3.2203  
KERO (Heating) Mirabito Energy Products $3.7566  
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Chautauqua 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1354  
2-TW NOCO Energy Corp. $3.2554  

Chemung 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1293  
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.3792  

 
Chenango 
2-TW Mirabito Energy Products $3.4370  
KERO (Heating) Mirabito Energy Products $3.7388  

 
Clinton 
2-MT Adirondack Energy  $3.0622  
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.1984  
KERO (Heating) Adirondack Energy  $3.6222  

 
Columbia 
2-MT Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.1966  
2-TW Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.2416  
KERO (Heating) Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.7614  

 
Cortland 
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2542  

 
Delaware 
2-MT Sprague  $3.0876  
2-TW Mirabito Energy Products $3.3526  
2-TW B5 Mirabito Energy Products $3.5105  
KERO (Heating) Mirabito Energy Products $3.7855  

 
Dutchess 
2-MT Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.1566  
2-TW Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.2116  
2-TW B2 Mirabito Energy Products $3.7901  
2-TW B5 Mirabito Energy Products $3.7838  
6-MT (0.5%) Sprague  $3.1381  

 
Erie 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1254  
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.1838  

 
Essex 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.0833  
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2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2205  
KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $3.6632  

 
 
 
\Franklin 
2-MT Adirondack Energy  $3.0622  
2-TW Adirondack Energy  $3.2022  
KERO (Heating) Adirondack Energy  $3.5992  

 
Fulton 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1186  
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2736  
4-MT (1.5%) Sprague  $3.3795  
KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $3.6390  

 
Genesee 
2-TW NOCO Energy Corp. $3.2354  

 
Greene 
2-MT Heritagenergy $3.2022  
2-TW Heritagenergy $3.2797  
2-TW B5 Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc $3.8961  
6-MT (0.5%) Sprague  $3.1540  
KERO (Heating) Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.8144  

 
Hamilton 
2-MT Mirabito Energy Products $3.1683  
2-TW No Bid  
KERO (Heating) No Bid  

 
Herkimer 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1236  
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.3236  
KERO (Heating) Mirabito Energy Products $3.6735  

 
Jefferson 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1236  
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2836  
KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $3.7390  

 
Kings 
2-MT United Metro Energy Corp $3.2827  
2-MT NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $3.0935  
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2-TW NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $3.1270  
6-MT (0.3%) NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $2.6553  

 
Lewis 
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.3036  

 
Livingston 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1354  
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2188  

 
Madison 
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2886  

 
Monroe 
2-TW Mirabito Energy Products $3.1910  

 
Montgomery 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1186  
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2736  
KERO (Heating) NO BID  

 
Nassau 
2-MT East Coast Petroleum Inc. $3.2200  
2-TW United Metro Energy Corp $3.2627  

 
New York 
2-MT United Metro Energy Corp $3.2577  
2-MT NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $3.0985  
2-TW NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $3.1270  
4-MT (0.15%) NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $2.8385  

 
Niagara 
2-TW NOCO Energy Corp. $3.2554  

 
Oneida 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1086  
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2236  
KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $3.5390  

 
Onondaga 
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2285  
KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $3.6390  

 
Ontario 
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2238  
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KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $4.1520  

 
Orange 
2-MT Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.1616  
2-TW Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.2256  
2-TW B5 Mirabito Energy Products $3.6838  

 
Orleans 
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2538  
6-MT (.5%) NO BID  
KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $4.1520  

 
Oswego 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1186  
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2285  
KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $3.6390  

 
Otsego 
2-MT Mirabito Energy Products $3.0699  
2-TW Mirabito Energy Products $3.3211  

 
Putnam 
2-MT Global Montello Group Corp. $3.2005  
2-TW Global Montello Group Corp. $3.2768  
2-TW B5 Mirabito Energy Products $3.7439  

 
Queens 
2-MT NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $3.0935  
2-TW NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $3.1270  

 
Rensselaer 
2-TW Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc $3.1779  
KERO (Heating) Mirabito Energy Products $3.6521  

 
Richmond 
2-TW United Metro Energy Corp $3.4067  
2-TW B2 United Metro Energy Corp $3.4080  
2-TW NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp $3.1675  

 
Rockland 
2-MT Global Montello Group Corp. $3.2055  
2-TW Global Montello Group Corp. $3.2755  
6-MT (0.3%) NO BID  

 
St Lawrence 
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2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.0883  
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2083  
KERO (Heating) Adirondack Energy  $3.6222  

 
 
 
 
 
Saratoga 
2-MT Sprague  $3.0701  
2-TW Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc $3.1819  
KERO (Heating) Mirabito Energy Products $3.7067  

 
Schenectady 
2-MT Mirabito Energy Products $3.0643  
2-TW Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc $3.1819  

 
Schoharie 
2-MT Mirabito Energy Products $3.0685  
2-TW Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc $3.2012  

 
Schuyler 
2-TW James River Solutions $3.2463  

 
Seneca 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1393  
2-TW James River Solutions $3.1963  
KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $3.7790  

 
Steuben 
2-TW James River Solutions $3.1963  
KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $3.8790  

 
Suffolk 
2-MT United Metro Energy Corp $3.2427  
2-TW United Metro Energy Corp $3.2577  

 
Sullivan 
2-MT Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.1766  
2-TW Global Montello Group Corp. $3.2780  
2-TW B5 Mirabito Energy Products $3.6837  
KERO (Heating) Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.8114  

 
Tioga 
2-MT Superior Plus Energy $3.1313  
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Tompkins 
2-TW James River Solutions $3.1963  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Ulster 
2-MT Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.1566  
2-TW Morgan Fuel & Heating Co Inc  $3.2116  
2-TW B5 Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc $3.6361  
6-MT (0.5%) Sprague  $3.1342  

 
Warren 
2-MT Sprague  $3.0942  
2-TW Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc $3.2052  
KERO (Heating) Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc $3.8132  

 
Washington 
2-MT Sprague  $3.0860  
2-TW Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc $3.1952  
6-MT (0.5%) Sprague  $3.1263  
KERO (Heating) Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc $3.8132  

 
Wayne 
2-TW Superior Plus Energy $3.2438  
KERO (Heating) Superior Plus Energy $4.2320  

 
Westchester 
2-MT United Metro Energy Corp $3.2327  
2-TW United Metro Energy Corp $3.2710  
2-TW B5 United Metro Energy Corp $3.2775  

 
Wyoming 
KERO (Heating) NO BID $0.0000  

 
Yates 
2-TW NOCO Energy Corp. $3.3593  
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RECYCLED, REMANUFACTURED AND ENERGY EFFICIENT PRODUCTS: 

 The New York State Procurement supports and encourages the purchase of recycled, remanufactured, energy efficient 
and "energy star" products.  If one of the following codes appears as a suffix in the Award Number or is noted under the 
individual Contract Number(s) in this Contract Award Notification, please look at the individual awarded items for more 
information on products meeting the suffix description. 

 
RS,RP,RA Recycled 
RM Remanufactured 
SW Solid Waste Impact 
EE Energy Efficient 
E* EPA Energy Star 
ES Environmentally Sensitive 

 
NOTE TO AUTHORIZED USERS: 

 When placing purchase orders under the contract(s), the authorized user should be familiar with and follow the terms and 
conditions governing its use which usually appears at the end of this document.  The authorized user is accountable and 
responsible for compliance with the requirements of public procurement processes.  The authorized user must periodically 
sample the results of its procurements to determine its compliance.  In sampling its procurements, an authorized user should 
test for reasonableness of results to ensure that such results can withstand public scrutiny. 
 The authorized user, when purchasing from OGS contracts, should hold the contractor accountable for contract 
compliance and meeting the contract terms, conditions, specifications, and other requirements.  Also, in recognition of market 
fluctuations over time, authorized users are encouraged to seek improved pricing whenever possible. 
 Authorized users have the responsibility to document purchases, particularly when using OGS multiple award contracts 
for the same or similar product(s)/service(s), which should include: 

• a statement of need and associated requirements, 
• a summary of the contract alternatives considered for the purchase,  
• the reason(s) supporting the resulting purchase (e.g., show the basis for the selection among multiple contracts at the 

time of purchase was the most practical and economical alternative and was in the best interests of the State). 
 
DELIVERY: 

 Contractor must be prepared, at all times, to make prompt delivery as ordered.  In emergencies, fuel must be delivered within 
twenty-four (24) hours of notification.  Normal deliveries are considered to be Monday thru Friday (8:00 am - 5:00 pm).  
Saturday/Sunday deliveries are to be made on an emergency basis (and not a regular basis) ONLY. 
Agencies shall be responsible to insure that tanks are accessible by the contractor.  Failure of the agency to make appropriate 
arrangements, preventing delivery of product upon contractor’s arrival at delivery site, may result in a charge to the agency for 
the contractor’s transportation costs for that particular trip.  Agencies should also make certain that receiving personnel are 
available at time of delivery. 
 

PREVAILING WAGE: 
This award is subject to the prevailing wage rate provisions of New York State Labor Law.  See “WAGE AND HOUR 
PROVISIONS” in Appendix A paragraph 6. See "Prevailing Wage Rates - Public Works and Building Services Contracts" in 
Appendix B, OGS General Specifications.  Any federal or State determination of a violation of any public works law or 
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regulation, or labor law or regulation, or any OSHA violation deemed "serious or willful" may be grounds for a 
determination of vendor non-responsibility and termination of award. 

 The applicable Prevailing Wage Rate Schedule for this project is PRC # 2014900606 

For access to the Department of Labor (DOL) Public Works information including Prevailing Wage Schedule and updates, 
use the following link:   http://labor.ny.gov/workerprotection/publicwork/PWGeneralProvisions. 

 

IMPORTANT NOTE:  The above PRC number MUST be noted on all purchase orders issued for purchases from this 
contract. 

 
 
 
 
  FUEL SUPPLIER CERTIFICATE 

 

  

  This form may be used to supply reports to State Contract Users requesting documentation of fuel sulfur content, as may 
be required under State and/or Federal Environmental Laws.  When requested, this form should be supplied to the 
facility with each delivery or billing (As previously arranged with each facility)  

  

 1) 
Date of Delivery   

    

 Delivery  
Location / Account #   

  

  
Supplier Name    

    

  
Address   

    

  
City, State   

    

  
County   

    

  
2) Type of Fuel Delivered with MAXIMUM percent sulfur (Please check one) 

  

                                                            
    #2 (.0015%)     #4 (0.15%)       #6 (0.3%) NYC B2  
                              
    #2 B2 (.0015%)     #4 (0.5%)       #6 (0.3%)    
                                                            

       #2 B5 (.0015%)               #6 (0.5%)       
                                                            

       NYC (0.30)      Nassau, Rockland & Westchester Counties (0.37)          
     
 Is this a Biofuel Blend?          YES           NO    
     
 MINIMUM BTU Value per fuel type is as follows unless otherwise specified:    
 #2 fuel oil minimum BTU value per gallon is 139,000    
 #4 fuel oil minimum BTU value per gallon is 141,000    
 #6 fuel oil minimum BTU value per gallon is 143,000    

  (Items 3, 4, & 5 must be completed only if referring to a residual oil)        

3) Actual Sulfur Content:_____%       

4) Test Method______________________________________________       
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5) 
 
Location of oil when sampled for testing______________________________________________________ 
Indicate whether the oil was sampled as delivered or whether the sample was drawn from oil in storage at the oil supplier’s 
or oil refiner’s facility, or other location;       

6) We certify that the fuel supplied complies with the D396 (or latest revision) - Standard Specification for Fuel 
Oils. 

  

     

Signature  
 
 

NYS Procurement (NYSPro) 
Group 05500 

Fuel Oil, Heating 
 

                                

 
 

State of New York 
Office of General Services 

NYS PROCUREMENT (NYSPro)  
Contract Performance Report 

 Please take a moment to let us know how this contract award has measured up to your expectations.  If reporting on more than one 
contractor or product, please make copies as needed.  This office will use the information to improve our contract award, where 
appropriate.   Comments should include those of the product’s end user. 
 
Contract No.:  Contractor.  
 
Describe Product* Provided (Include Item No., if available):   
 
*Note: “Product” is defined as a deliverable under any Bid or Contract, which may include commodities (including printing), services 

and/or technology.  The term “Product” includes Licensed Software. 
 

 Excellent Good Acceptable Unacceptable 
• Product meets your needs     
• Product meets contract specifications     
• Pricing     

 
CONTRACTOR 
 

 Excellent Good Acceptable Unacceptable 
• Timeliness of delivery     
• Completeness of order (fill rate)     
• Responsiveness to inquiries     
• Employee courtesy     
• Problem resolution     

 
Comments:     
 
      
 
    (over) 
 
 
Agency:  Prepared by:  
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Address:  Title:  
 
   Date:  
 
   Phone:  
 
   E-mail:  
 

Please detach or photocopy this form & return by FAX to 518/474-2437 or mail to: 
 

NYS PROCUREMENT (NYSPro)  
Customer Services, 38th Floor 

Corning 2nd Tower - Empire State Plaza 
Albany, New York 12242 

*   *   *   *   * 
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