
Case prices include deposit fee
LOT 1-All Locations LOT 2-Jamaica LOT 3-Bloomingburg LOT 4-Guilderland LOT 5-Queensbury LOT 6-Plattsburg LOT 7-Oriskany LOT 8-Binghamton LOT 9-Alden

VENDOR 19008 cases 1800 cases 1440 cases 1800 cases 2880 cases 2880 cases 2088 cases 2880 cases 3240 cases

Atlantic Beverage 88,007.04 8,442.00 6,753.60 8,748.00 13,766.40 13,507.20 10,085.04 13,478.40 15,519.60

$4.63 case 4.69 case 4.69 case 4.86 case 4.78 case 4.69 case 4.83 case 4.68 case 4.79 case

Nestle Waters NO BID 8,442.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4.69 case

Blue Mountain Spring Water NO BID 9,900.00 7,560.00 9,180.00 14,976.00 15,552.00 10,126.80 14,688.00 17,496.00

5.50 case 5.25 case 5.10 case 5.20 case 5.40 4.85 case 5.10 case 5.40 case

Crystal Rock NO BID NO BID 8,208.00 10,260.00 16,416.00 16,416.00 11,901.60 16,416.00 18,468.00

5.70 case 5.70 case 5.70 case 5.70 case 5.70 case 5.70 case 5.70 case

DS Services of America 113,857.92 10,782.00 8,625.60 10,782.00 17,251.20 17,251.20 12,507.12 17,251.20 19,407.60

5.99 case 5.99 case 5.99 case 5.99 case 5.99 case 5.99 case 5.99 case 5.99 case 5.99 case

Aqua Blox 114,998.40 10,890.00 8,712.00 10,890.00 17,424.00 17,424.00 12,632.40 17,424.00 19,602.00

6.05 case 6.05 case 6.05 case 6.05 case 6.05 case 6.05 case 6.05 case 6.05 case 6.05 case

WW Grainger 126,023.04 11,934.00 9,547.20 11,934.00 19,094.40 19,094.40 13,843.44 19,094.40 21,481.20

6.63 case 6.63 case 6.63 case 6.63 case 6.63 case 6.63 case 6.63 case 6.63 case 6.63 case

IFB-0009 BID TABULATION 
BOTTLED WATER

BID OPENING DATE 3/19/14



Case prices include deposit fee
LOT 1-All Locations LOT 2-Jamaica LOT 3-Bloomingburg LOT 4-Guilderland LOT 5-Queensbury LOT 6-Plattsburg LOT 7-Oriskany LOT 8-Binghamton LOT 9-Alden

VENDOR 19008 cases 1800 cases 1440 cases 1800 cases 2880 cases 2880 cases 2088 cases 2880 cases 3240 cases

IFB-0009 BID TABULATION 
BOTTLED WATER

BID OPENING DATE 3/19/14

Derstines NO BID NO BID 10,224.00 12,906.00 21,398.40 21,542.40 15,931.44 21,081.60 25,174.80

7.10 case 7.17 case 7.43 case 7.48 case 7.63 case 7.32 case 7.77 case

Aqua Blox 161,187.84 15,264.00 12,211.20 15,264.00 24,422.40 24,422.40 17,706.24 24,422.40 27,475.20

8.48 case 8.48 case 8.48 case 8.48 case 8.48 case 8.48 case 8.48 case 8.48 case 8.48 case

NAL Water 284,359.68 26,928.00 21,542.40 26,928.00 43,084.80 43,084.80 31,236.48 43,084.80 48,470.40

14.96 case 14.96 case 14.96 case 14.96 case 14.96 case 14.96 case 14.96 case 14.96 case 14.96 case

Connetquot West 108,017.28 TOTAL BID IS FOR 25,536 CASES.  UNIT PRICE ONLY APPLIES IF 25,536 CASES ARE ORDERED BASED ON TRUCKLOAD QUANTITIES 

4.23 case

Connetquot West 60,759.72 TOTAL BID IS FOR 14,364 CASES.  UNIT PRICE ONLY APPLIES IF 14,364 CASES ARE ORDERED BASED ON TRUCKLOAD QUANTITIES 

4.23 case


	Orig TAB

