




23170 Transit Buses Bid Summary

Bidder (#) Bidder Name

LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Low Floor Vehicle 
<10,000 lb.

High Headroom 
Wagon <10,000 lb.

High Headroom 
Wagon <10,000 lb. 

(Flexible Floor 
Plan) 

Dual Rear Wheel 
Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 
Cutaway <22 ft. Low Floor Cutaway Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 
Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Electric)

Medium Duty 
Cutaway

(Alternate Fuels)
Conventional Style Conventional Style Low Floor 

(Front Engine)
Low Floor 

(Rear Engine)

4 Passenger 
[3A/1WC]

7 Passenger
[5A/1WC]

7 Passenger 
[6A/1WC]

9 Passenger 
[8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 
[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 
[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 
[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 
[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 
[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 
[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 
[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 
[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 
[33A/2WC]

Bid Summary Matthews Bus 
Alliance Inc. DBA 
Matthews Buses 
Commercial

$1,294,170.00 No Bid No Bid $3,817,845.00 $6,461,500.00 No Bid $17,729,725.00 No Bid $3,077,720.00 $2,626,685.00 $6,758,300.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (2) Alliance Bus Group 
Inc.

$1,377,500.00 $2,976,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,053,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (3) Shepard Bros., Inc $1,286,630.00 No Bid No Bid $3,636,950.00 $6,178,085.00 No Bid $17,135,475.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bid Summary (4) Factory Direct Bus 

Sales
No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,928,080.00 $6,637,245.00 No Bid $18,703,685.00 No Bid $3,023,660.00 $2,654,200.00 $6,846,260.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (5) EMPIRE BUS SALES, 
LLC

No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,031,622.00 No Bid No Bid $18,819,040.00 No Bid $3,076,026.00 $2,714,795.00 $7,185,255.00 $5,594,295.00 $7,525,021.00

Bid Summary (6) Fenton Mobility 
Products Inc.

No Bid $2,900,360.00 $2,212,560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (7) Don Brown Bus 
Sales, Inc.

No Bid $3,615,180.00 No Bid $3,763,600.00 $6,368,400.00 No Bid $17,998,430.00 No Bid $3,079,934.00 $2,651,600.00 $6,859,150.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (8) Don Brown Bus 
Sales, Inc.

No Bid $3,061,920.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (9) Mobility Works $1,265,630.00 $3,132,190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Rank Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name

1 $1,265,630.00 Mobility Works $2,900,360.00 Fenton Mobility 
Products Inc.

$2,212,560.00 Fenton Mobility 
Products Inc.

$3,636,950.00 Shepard Bros., Inc $6,178,085.00 Shepard Bros., Inc $6,053,200.00 Alliance Bus Group 
Inc.

$17,135,475.00 Shepard Bros., Inc

2 $1,286,630.00 Shepard Bros., Inc $2,976,950.00 Alliance Bus Group 
Inc.

$3,763,600.00 Don Brown Bus 
Sales, Inc.

$6,368,400.00 Don Brown Bus 
Sales, Inc.

$17,729,725.00 Matthews Bus 
Alliance Inc. DBA 
Matthews Buses 
Commercial

3 $1,294,170.00 Matthews Bus 
Alliance Inc. DBA 
Matthews Buses 
Commercial

$3,061,920.00 Don Brown Bus 
Sales, Inc.

$3,817,845.00 Matthews Bus 
Alliance Inc. DBA 
Matthews Buses 
Commercial

$6,461,500.00 Matthews Bus 
Alliance Inc. DBA 
Matthews Buses 
Commercial

$17,998,430.00 Don Brown Bus 
Sales, Inc.

4 $1,377,500.00 Alliance Bus Group 
Inc.

$3,132,190.00 Mobility Works $3,928,080.00 Factory Direct Bus 
Sales

$6,637,245.00 Factory Direct Bus 
Sales

$18,703,685.00 Factory Direct Bus 
Sales

5 $3,615,180.00 Don Brown Bus 
Sales, Inc.

$4,031,622.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 
LLC

$18,819,040.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 
LLC

Bid Rank Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name

1 $3,023,660.00 Factory Direct Bus 
Sales

$2,626,685.00 Matthews Bus 
Alliance Inc. DBA 
Matthews Buses 
Commercial

$6,758,300.00 Matthews Bus 
Alliance Inc. DBA 
Matthews Buses 
Commercial

$5,594,295.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 
LLC

$7,525,021.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 
LLC

2 $3,076,026.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 
LLC

$2,651,600.00 Don Brown Bus 
Sales, Inc.

$6,846,260.00 Factory Direct Bus 
Sales

3 $3,077,720.00 Matthews Bus 
Alliance Inc. DBA 
Matthews Buses 
Commercial

$2,654,200.00 Factory Direct Bus 
Sales

$6,859,150.00 Don Brown Bus 
Sales, Inc.

4 $3,079,934.00 Don Brown Bus 
Sales, Inc.

$2,714,795.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 
LLC

$7,185,255.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 
LLC

LOT H
DRW Cutaway >22 ft. (Electric)

16 Passenger [14A/2WC]

Grand Total For Lot

LOT A
Low Floor Vehicle <10,000 lb.

4 Passenger [3A/1WC]

LOT D
Dual Rear Wheel Cutaway <22 ft.

9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

LOT E LOT G
Dual Rear Wheel Cutaway >22 ft.

16 Passenger [14A/2WC]

LOT B
High Headroom Wagon <10,000 lb.

LOT C
High Headroom Wagon <10,000 lb. 

(Flexible Floor Plan) 
7 Passenger [6A/1WC]

Dual Rear Wheel Cutaway <22 ft.

11 Passenger [10A/1WC]

LOT K
Conventional Style

28 Passenger [26A/2WC]

LOT L

7 Passenger [5A/1WC]

LOT I

20 Passenger [18A/2WC]

Medium Duty Cutaway                    
(Alternate Fuels)

LOT J
Conventional Style 

24 Passenger [22A/2WC]

Low Floor (Front Engine)

25 Passenger [23A/2WC] 35  Passenger [33A/2WC]

LOT F
Low Floor Cutaway

17 Passenger [15A/2WC]

LOT M
Low Floor (Rear Engine)
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