State of New York Executive Department
Office Of General Services
Procurement Services Group
Corning Tower Building - 38th Floor
Empire State Plaza
Albany, New York 12242
http://www.ogs.state.ny.us

CONTRACT AWARD NOTIFICATION

Title

Group 35800 - Traffic Control Equipment I1:
including LED Traffic Signal Modules (Statewide)

Classification Code(s). 46

Award Number

20859 - EE

Contract Period

July 3, 2008 to May 31, 2011

Bid Opening Date

December 19, 2007

Date of Issue

July 3, 2008

Specification Reference :

As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

Contractor Information :

Appears on Page 2 of this Award

Address Inquiries To:

State Agencies & Vendors Political Subdivisions & Others

Name : James E. Malone

Customer Services

Title : Purchasing Officer 1 Phone : 518-474-6717

Phone 518-473-2428 Fax  : 518-474-2437

Fax L 1_518'474'8676 E-mail : customer.services@ogs.state.ny.us
E-mail : james.malone@ogs.state.ny.us

The Procurement Services Group values your input.
Complete and return ""Contract Performance Report™ at end of document.

Description

Traffic Control equipment includes the components required for the installation, operation, control and maintenance
of electronic traffic signal systems which are necessary for safe travel on the streets and highways throughout the
State of New York. This award incorporates Vehicle Detectors, Signal Wiring, L.E.D. Signal Modules, and Portable

Traffic Signals into the commodity.

PR #20859

(continued)



http://www.ogs.state.ny.us/purchase/spg/awards/3580020859Can.htm

GROUP 35800 Traffic Control Equipment Il AWARD PAGE 2
(Statewide)
NOTE: See individual contract items to determine actual awardees.
CONTRACT # CONTRACTOR & ADDRESS TELEPHONE # FED.IDENT .#
PC63963 American Wire Group (954) 455-3050 651129415

1920 East Hallandale Beach Blvd. PH8
Hallandale, Florida 33009

(800) 342-7215 Toll Free
(954) 455-9886 Fax
Robert Dorfman
thhnman@aol.com
Www.buyawg.com

Contractor accepts N.Y.S. Procurement Card for purchases up to $10,000.00
Contractor offers 1% Cash Discount for payment within 10 days of delivery and/or receipt of voucher- net 30.
Contractor will accept orders for less than the stated minimum reel length.

PC63964 Conservation Station, Inc. (919) 932-9201 ext. 11 223328353
WBE 60 Sun Forest Way (888) 870-8800 ext. 11 Toll Free
Chapel Hill, North Carolina 27517 (919)932-9206 or (888) 870-7700 Fax
Matthew T. Bolesky
matt@conservationstatiion.net
www.led.com & www.lumination.com
PC63965 Horizon Signal Technologies, Inc. (610) 687-8975 ext. 302. 232851564
216 Line Road (800) 852 - 8796 ext. 302 Toll Free
Malverne, Pennsylvania 19355 (610) 687-5123 Fax
David S. Krahulec
horizonsignal@msn.com
www.horizonsignal.com
Accepts N.Y.S. Procurement Card for purchases up to $10,000.00
PC63966 Marbelite Company, Inc. (732)292-2100 ext. 101 111856375
P. O. Box 239 -- 1913 Atlantic Avenue (866)609-7270 Toll Free
Manasquan, New Jersey 08736 (732)292-2122 Fax
Joseph Lipari
jlipari@marbsignal.com
www.marbsignal.com
PC63967 0. M. J. C. Signal Technologies, Inc. (319) 236-0200 ext. 101 421361699
P. O. Box 1594 (800) 776-5999 Toll Free
Waterloo, lowa, 50704 (319) 236-1554 Fax
Arlen Yost
arlen@omjcsignal.com
www.omjcsignal.com
Contractor accepts N.Y.S. Procurement Card for purchases up to $15,000.00
PC63968 Pathfinder Traffic, LLC. (585) 394-6777 510612427
SB P. O. Box 473 (888) 704-1303 Toll Free

Canandaigua, New York 14424

(888) 704-1303 Fax

Matthew Schaefer
mschaefer@pathfindertraffic.com
www.mssedco.com
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GROUP 35800 Traffic Control Equipment Il AWARD PAGE 3
(Statewide)

PC63969 Wise Components, Inc. (203) 325-2191 132895657
79 Harborview Avenue (800) 543-4333 Toll Free
Stamford, Connecticut 06902 (203) 325-2198 Fax
Mike Visci

mvisci@wisecomponents.com
Www.wisecomponents.com

Contractor accepts N.Y.S. Procurement Card for purchases up to $15,000.00

Contractor offers 1% Cash Discount for payment within 30 days of delivery and/or receipt of voucher

Cash Discount, If Shown, Should be Given Special Attention.
INVOICES MUST BE SENT DIRECTLY TO THE ORDERING AGENCY FOR PAYMENT.
(See ""Contract Payments' and ""Electronic Payments' in this document.)

AGENCIES SHOULD NOTIFY THE PROCUREMENT SERVICES GROUP PROMPTLY IF THE CONTRACTOR FAILS
TO MEET DELIVERY OR OTHER TERMS OF THIS CONTRACT. PRODUCTS OR SERVICES WHICH DO NOT
COMPLY WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS OR ARE OTHERWISE UNSATISFACTORY TO THE AGENCY SHOULD
ALSO BE REPORTED TO THE PROCUREMENT SERVICES GROUP.

SMALL, MINORITY AND WOMEN-OWNED BUSINESSES:
The letters SB listed under the Contract Number indicate the contractor is a NYS small business. Additionally, the

letters MBE and WBE indicate the contractor is a Minority-owned Business Enterprise and/or Woman-owned Business
Enterprise.

RECYCLED, REMANUFACTURED AND ENERGY EFFICIENT PRODUCTS:

The Procurement Services Group supports and encourages the purchase of recycled, remanufactured, energy
efficient and "energy star" products. If one of the following codes appears as a suffix in the Award Number or is noted
under the individual Contract Number(s) in this Contract Award Notification, please look at the individual awarded items
for more information on products meeting the suffix description.

NOTE TO RS,RP,RA | Recycled EE | Energy Efficient
RM Remanufactured E* | EPA Energy Star
SW Solid Waste Impact ES | Environmentally Sensitive

AUTHORIZED USERS:

When placing purchase orders under the contract(s), the authorized user should be familiar with and follow the
terms and conditions governing its use which usually appears at the end of this document. The authorized user is
accountable and responsible for compliance with the requirements of public procurement processes. The authorized user
must periodically sample the results of its procurements to determine its compliance. In sampling its procurements, an
authorized user should test for reasonableness of results to ensure that such results can withstand public scrutiny.

The authorized user, when purchasing from OGS contracts, should hold the contractor accountable for contract
compliance and meeting the contract terms, conditions, specifications, and other requirements. Also, in recognition of
market fluctuations over time, authorized users are encouraged to seek improved pricing whenever possible.

Authorized users have the responsibility to document purchases, particularly when using OGS multiple award
contracts for the same or similar product(s)/service(s), which should include:

o a statement of need and associated requirements,

o a summary of the contract alternatives considered for the purchase,

o the reason(s) supporting the resulting purchase (e.g., show the basis for the selection among multiple contracts at
the time of purchase was the most practical and economical alternative and was in the best interests of the State).

(continued)
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GROUP 35800 Traffic Control Equipment Il AWARD PAGE4
(Statewide)

PRICE:

General - Price includes all customs duties and charges and is net, F.O.B. Destination, any point in New York
State, as designated by the ordering agency including tailgate delivery. In addition, upon mutual agreement, delivery
locations may be expanded per the “Extension of Use” Clause.

Lower Pricing - The State reserves the right to negotiate lower pricing, or to advertise for bids, whichever is in the
State's best interest as determined by the Commissioner, in the event of a significant decrease in market price of any
product listed. In addition, if the contractor’s normal pricing to the public or to the trade in general is less than the
net/contract pricing with the application of a contract discount, etc., then the normal pricing to the public or to the trade in
general shall also be granted to contract participants.

Any general price reductions passed on to other customers occasioned because of a competitive “softening” of the
market are to be correspondingly offered at the same ratio to all affected States. Prices may be lowered at any time.
Failure on the part of the contractor(s) to promptly accord such industry-wide price reductions on the contracts may
constitute a breach and the contracts with that vendor may be canceled

Price Changes - Contract prices shall be subject to increase or decrease during the contract period in accordance
with the terms of the “Price Adjustment Clause” as found beginning on page 5 of this document. Request for price
changes at any other time will not be granted unless an “Unworkable Price Structure” situation develops (please see
more on this below).

Unworkable Price Structure - Should the price structure utilized by the parties become unworkable, detrimental
or injurious to the State and/or Contractor or result in prices which are not truly reflective of current market conditions,
and the price is deemed unreasonable or excessive by the Commissioner and no adjustment in price is mutually agreeable,
the Commissioner reserves the sole right upon 10 days written notice mailed to the contractor to terminate any contract
resulting from this bid opening. If the contractor is unable or unwilling to meet contractual requirements in whole or in
part based on an unworkable price structure, it shall immediately notify the State of that fact in order that the State may
take appropriate action. Such notification shall be in writing and shall be directed to the Office of General Services,
Procurement Services Group. Such notification shall not relieve the contractor of its responsibilities under the contract.

The State reserves the right to implement changes in price based on unforeseen factors such as dramatic changes in
availability, delivery, costs, etc., for product, supplies, etc., that substantively affect the contractor’s business processes or
that may impact contract pricing. These changes may be accomplished by adjusting the timing and/or frequency of the
“Price Adjustment Clause” as found on page 23, or through other means. Such changes may be based on information
from the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics, industry data, or other sources.

Best Pricing Offer -Price decreases shall take effect automatically during the Contract Term and apply to
orders submitted subsequent to the effective dates of applicable price decreases as follows:

1. Commercial Price List reductions: Where the NYS Net Prices are based on a discount from the

Contractor's list prices and the Contractor lowers its pricing to its customers or to similarly situated

government customers during the contract term; or

2. Special Offers/ Promotions- General: Where the contractor generally offers more advantageous

special price promotions, or special discount pricing to customers during the contract term, and the

maximum price or discount associated with such offer or promotion is better than the discount or

price otherwise available under this contract, such better price or discount shall apply for similar

quantity transaction for the life of the general offer or promotion.

3. Special Offers/ Promotions-Specific: Contractor may offer an Authorized User competitive pricing

which is lower than the Net NYS Price set forth herein at any time during the contract period and

such lower pricing shall not be applied as a global price reduction under the contract pursuant to the

foregoing paragraph.

(continued)
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GROUP 35800 Traffic Control Equipment Il AWARD PAGE5
(Statewide)

PRICE: (continued)

Government Mandated Program Adjustment - An adjustment in product and/or price may be permitted if a
government mandated program, such as a new Federal Highway Administration Specification Standards, take effect and
suitable documentation is furnished to the State and the State determines the requested change is verifiable and is
reasonable. Replacement product would be subject to NYS Department of Transportation testing and approval. Such a
price adjustment may be permitted for only a limited time since such an adjustment would eventually be reflected in the
PPI.

Price Adjustment - All contract pricing is subject to an increase or decrease after September 30, 2008 and every
four (4) months thereafter, with the initial adjustment occurring on October 1, 2008.

The State will not effect any price adjustments, either increases or decreases, until percentage changes of more
than two (2) percent are demonstrated by the Producer Price Index Involved.

The products found in each lot of this bid have been further classified into five (5) categories: Vehicle Detectors,
LED Signal Lamps, Signal Heads, Traffic Signal Cable, Span Wire Cable and Model 179 Controller Equipment. Each of
these categories has been assigned a United States Department of Labor Producer Price Index (PPI) or a recognized
industrial index by which to adjust the contract prices in accordance with industry trends. The price adjustment on each
item will be commensurate with the increase or decrease in the index for the lot in which it resides.

The Lots will be adjusted by the following Producer Price Indices:

Lot Description Price Index Title Index Identifier BASE
Index Value
. Manufacturing of Vehicular and
I Vehicle Detectors Pedestrian Traffic Control Equipment PCU #3342903342902 108.5
The Most Recent Average Spot Settlement Price for the current
s month to date for Copper Futures as per the Comex Trading
I Traffic Signal Cable Division on the New York Mercantile Exchange (NYMEX) 320.13
(November 19, 2007) figure
Model 179 Controller . .
”I'V& Equipment and gﬂezgzzﬁ;t#rT'?gfg‘;\é%T&‘;'laé aﬂ:j ot | PCU #3342903342902 1085
Accessories quip
: . Other Lighting Equipment
V-XI | LED Signal Modules Manufacturing - Primary Products PCU #335129335129P 128.0
X11 | Portable Traffic Signal | Manufacturing of Vehicular and PCU #3342903342902 1085
Pedestrian Traffic Control Equipment

The above chart shows benchmark values for each of the lots upon which the adjustments are calculated.

These values are the most recently published; whether or not indicated as “preliminary”; Producer Price Index
(PPI) for October 2007 as published by the U.S. Department of Labor, or the New York Mercantile Exchange’s Most
Recent Average Spot Settlement price for the current month for Copper Futures on the Comex Exchange on the working
day prior to the date of publication of this IFB on November 21, 2007. Unless removed by the U.S. Department of Labor,
these values will remain constant throughout the term of the contract.

The formula for the price adjustment is as follows:

e  The most recently published (current) price index per category divided by the base index for the classification
group (rounded to 3 decimal places) equals a multiplier. A multiplier greater than one (1) will result in an
increase in price and a multiplier of less than one (1) will result in a decrease in price.

e Take the contract award price and multiply it by the multiplier to get the adjusted price.

e No price adjustment, either increases or decreases, will take place until the multiplier is a number below 0.980
or above 1.020.

(continued)
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GROUP 35800 Traffic Control Equipment Il AWARD PAGE 6
(Statewide)

PRICE: (continued)
Price Adjustment (continued)
Consider a hypothetical example that could take place on February 1, 2009: for Lot | on the contract:

- The Current Index -

Take the most recently published Producer Price Index (PPI1); whether or not indicated as “preliminary”; on
January 31st, 2009, for Manufacturing of Vehicular and Pedestrian Traffic Control Equipment, Series ID: PCU
#3342903342902 which could be 116.7* {*Remember this is a hypothetical example and this figure was made up strictly
for this example!}

DIVIDED (<) BY

- The Base Index for this Classification -

108.5
This figure is the most recently published; whether or not indicated as “preliminary”; Producer Price Index (PPI)
Industry: Manufacturing of Vehicular and Pedestrian Traffic Control Equipment. Series ID: PCU #3342903342902, for
October, 2007 as published by the U.S. Department of Labor prior to the date of publication of this IFB on November 21
2007.

EQUALS (=)

- The MULTIPLIER -

The quotient result (rounded to 3 decimal places) equals a multiplier which will then be applied to the contract price.
A multiplier greater than one (1) will result in an increase in price and a multiplier of less than one (1) will result in a

decrease in price.
In this example the multiplier is +1.076

Awarded Contract Price Per Lotl Item, MULTIPLIED (x) by 1.076 (The Multiplier)
Equals (=) New Adjusted Price Per Item

A Purchasing Memorandum will then be issued by the Procurement Services Group to reflect the price increase or
decrease which will be effective October 1, 2008, and every four (4) months thereafter.
If the any of the referenced indices changes or is removed, an index deemed appropriate by the Procurement
Service Group will be used in its place. In such instance the base would change to that of the new referenced index.
Additional information on the Producer Price Index may be obtained at the U. S. Department of Labor website at:
http://data.bls.gov . Information on the Comex exchange is available at www.nymex.com

Fuel Surcharge - The State will consider the implementation of a fuel surcharge as a result of national or
worldwide situations. The contractor may submit a request for a reasonable fuel surcharge semi-annually on October 1
and April 1 starting in October 2008. The fuel surcharge shall be equal to or less than the charge imposed by the freight
carriers. The request must be accompanied by freight invoices, which show the amount paid to the freight company. The
surcharge shall become effective when it is approved by OGS and posted to the website.

(continued)
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GROUP 35800 Traffic Control Equipment Il

(Statewide)

AWARD PAGE7

LOTI-ITEMS #1-3

Vehicle Detectors as per the Detailed Specifications & as described below.

Manufacturer’s
ITEM . . Standard Manufacturer’s or
# DESCRIPTION Unit Price Package Dealer’s Catalog Order #
Quantity:

1 Microwave Vehicle Detector;

overhead mounted type. $480.00 1 TC26B-NYS
2 Ultrasonic Vehicle Presence

Detector; overhead mounted or

side-of-road (parallel) type

$325.00 1 TC30-NYS

3 12 VVolt AC Power Supply

Detector Card; used in Model

330 Traffic Control Cabinet

(NOTE: NOT for USE in 24V Cabinets)

Manufacturer: MS Sedco

Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

8701 Castle Park Drive, Indianapolis IN
45 Days

Contractor, LOT I: Pathfinder Traffic, LLC.

Traffic Signal & Span Wire Cable as per the Detailed Specifications & as described below..

ITEM Manufacturer’s Manufacturer’s
#4 DESCRIPTION: Unit Price Standard Cost Per or Dealer’s
Signal Control Cable; 600 volt, rated with per foot Package Reel Catalog Order
copper conductors. Quantity: #
a |3 igooon?tucréoerlf 14 AWG stranded, $0.270 1 Reel $270.00 8303
b 5 - Conductor #14 AWG stranded,
1000 ft. reels $0.415 1 Reel $415.00 8305
c 7 - Conductor #14 AWG stranded,
1000 ft. reels $0.568 1 Reel $568.00 8307
d 10 -Conductor #14 AWG stranded,
1000 ft. reels $0.827 1 Reel $827.00 8310
¢ 151600002‘]'?;:;?; #14 AWG stranded, $1.340 1 Reel $1,340.00 8315
f 19 - Conductor #14 AWG stranded,
1000 ft. reels $1.506 1 Reel $1506.00 8319

Manufacturer:
Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

Advanced Digital Cables
94 Eagle Forks Road, Hayseville, NC
21-28 Days

Contractor, LOT 11 - Item 4: Wise Components, Inc.

LOT Il - ITEMS #4-11 (AWARD BY ITEM):

20859a.doc/PSG Team 06/jem
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GROUP 35800 Traffic Control Equipment Il

(Statewide)

AWARD PAGES8

LOT 11 - ITEMS #4-11 (AWARD BY ITEM): (Continued)

Traffic Signal & Span Wire Cable as per the Detailed Specifications & as described below.

Manufacturer’s Manufacturer’s
ITEM | DESCRIPTION: Unit Standard Cost Per or Dealer’s
#5 Messenger Cable Price Package Reel Catalog Order
per foot Quantity: #
5-Conductor #14 AWG stranded in
1000 ft. reels. NO BID
Contractor, LOT Il - Item 5: No Award
Manufacturer’s Manufacturer’s
ITEM DES(.:RIPTION: . Unit Standard Cost Per or Dealer’s
Lead in Cable - Shielded . Package
#6 Price Quantity: Reel Catalog Order
per foot y: #
a 2-conductor #14 AWG Stranded Wire, Shielded,
Put-up on 2,500 foot reels. $0.248 1 Reel $620.00 8780
b 4-conductor #14 AWG Stranded Wire,
Shielded, Put-up on 2,500 foot reels. $0.527 1 Reel $1317.50 8784

Manufacturer:
Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

Advanced Digital Cables
94 Eagle Forks Road, Hayseville, NC

21-28 Days

Contractor, LOT 11 - Item 6: Wise Components, Inc.

ITEM
#7

Manufacturer’s

Manufacturer’s

DESCRIPTION: Unit Standard Cost Per or Dealer’s

Lead in Cable - Un Shielded: Price Package Reel Catalog Order
per foot Quantity: #

4-conductor #14 AWG Stranded Wire, $0.44051 1 Reel $1101.275 TBA

Unshielded, Put-up on 2,500 foot reels.

Manufacturer
Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

Advanced Digital Cables
94 Eagle Forks Road, Hayseville, NC

21-28 Days

Contractor, LOT 11 - Item 7: Wise Components, Inc.

ITEM
#8

Manufacturer’s

Manufacturer’s

DESCRIPTION: Unit Standard Cost Per or Dealer’s

Inductance Loop Wire Price Package Reel Catalog Order
per foot Quantity: #

1 conductor, #14 AWG Stranded, Encased. $0.11013 1Reel $275.325 ADC# 8450

Put-up on 2,500 ft. reels.

Manufacturer:
Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

Advanced Digital Cables
94 Eagle Forks Road, Hayseville, NC

28-35 Days

Contractor, LOT 11 - Item 8: American Wire Group

(continued)
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GROUP 35800 Traffic Control Equipment Il
(Statewide)

AWARD

PAGE 9

LOT 11 - ITEMS #4-11 (AWARD BY ITEM): (Continued)

Traffic Signal & Span Wire Cable as per the Detailed Specifications & as described below.

ITEM | DESCRIPTION:
#9 Span Wire Cable

Copper-weld Steel Wire, as per specification; In
500 ft. reels

NO BID RECEIVED

Contractor, LOT Il - Item 5: No Award

Manufacturer’s

ITEM | DESCRIPTION: Unit S;:Qf;rg Cost Per Mi?‘gzgg:ir S
#10 | Single Conductor, Stranded THHN Wire; Price g Reel
in 500 ft. reels. per foot Quantity Catalog Order #
a 8-gauge black wire
b 8-gauge white wire
NO BID RECEIVED
c 6-gauge black wire
d 6-gauge white wire
Contractor, LOT Il - Item 10: No award
Manufacturer’s
ITEM | DESCRIPTION: Unit Standard Costper | Manufacturer’s
. . Package or Dealer’s
#11 | Bare Copper Ground, Stranded Wire Price : Reel | d
per foot Quantity Catalog Order #

a 6-gauge type (in 315 ft. reels)

b 4-gauge type (in 200 ft. reels)

NO BID RECEIVED

Contractor, LOT Il - Item 11: No Award

LOT Il - ITEMS#12 - 15 (AWARD BY LOT):
Model 179 Controller Equipment -

LOT IV - ITEMSs #16 - 17 (AWARD BY ITEM):
CONTROLLER PARTS
ITEM #16:

Model 416 Memory Module -
ITEM #17:

Model 420 Portable Clock Card-

20859a.doc/PSG Team 06/jem
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GROUP 35800 Traffic Control Equipment Il

(Statewide)

AWARD PAGE 10

LOT V - ITEMS #18-23(AWARD BY LOT):

Vehicle Signal (LED) Modules - Type A - Balls as per the Detailed Specifications & as described below.

Type “A” modules are not designed for use in signals which utilize the Model 215 current monitor.

Unit ) )
Item Description Price Manufacturer’s or Dealer’s
No. =escription Each Catalog Order #
18. | 12” (300mm) Red Ball LED Module - Type "A"
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $47.000
Order Quantity: 6-12> $45.000
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $43.000 TSL-AZR-LXAILS-AL-NCGE
Order Quantity: 25-48> $41.000
Order Quantity: 49+> $39.000
19. | 127 (300mm) Yellow Ball LED Module - Type "A"
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $62.000
Order Quantity: 6-11> $60.000
Order Quantity: 11-24 > $58.000 TSL-AZY-LXAL3-AL-NCGC
Order Quantity: 25-48> $56.000
Order Quantity: 49+> $54.000
20. 12”7 (300mm) Green Ball LED Module - Type "A"
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $60.000
Order Quantity: 6-12> $58.000
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $56.000 TSL-A2G-LX-L3-AL-NCGC
Order Quantity: 25-48> $54.000
Order Quantity: 49+> $52.000
21. | 8” (200mm) Red Ball LED Module - Type "A"
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $37.000
Order Quantity: 6-12> $35.000
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $33.000 TSL-08R-LX-IL3-AL-NCGC
Order Quantity: 25-48> $32.000
Order Quantity: 49+> $31.000
22, 8” (200mm) Yellow Ball LED Module - Type "A"
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $43.000
Order Quantity: 6-11> $40.000
Order Quantity: 11-24 > $39.000 TSL-08Y-LX-IL3-AL-NCGC
Order Quantity: 25-48> $38.000
Order Quantity: 49+> $37.000
23. 8” (200mm) Green Ball LED Module - Type "A"
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $49.000
Order Quantity: 6-12> $47.000 TSL-08G-LX-IL3-A1-NCGC
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $45.000
Order Quantity: 25-48> $44.000

Manufacturer
Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

Leotek Electronics

1330 Memorex Drive, Santa Clara, CA

60 Days

Contractor, LOT V : Marbelite Company, Inc.

(continued)

20859a.doc/PSG Team 06/jem




GROUP 35800 Traffic Control Equipment Il

(Statewide)

WARD PAGE 11

AWARD

LOT VI - ITEMS #24 -26 (AWARD BY LOT):

Vehicle Signal (LED) Modules - Type A - Arrows as per the Detailed Specifications & as described below.
Type “A” modules are not designed for use in signals which utilize the Model 215 current monitor.

Item Flﬂ';z Manufacturer’s or Dealer’s
No. Description Each Catalog Order #
24, 12” (300mm) Red Turn Arrow LED Module Type "A"
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $41.50
Order Quantity: 6-12> $41.50 i i
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $41.50 DRE-RTAAN-17A
Order Quantity: 25-48> $41.50
Order Quantity: 49+> $41.50
25. 12” (300mm) Yellow Turn Arrow LED Module Type "A"
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $41.00
Order Quantity: 6-11> $41.00 i i
Order Quantity: 11-24 > $41.00 DRE-YCAAN-17A
Order Quantity: 25-48> $41.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $41.00
26. 12” (300mm) Green Turn Arrow LED Module Type "A"
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $52.00
Order Quantity: 6-12> $52.00
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $52.00 DRE-GCAAN-17A
Order Quantity: 25-48> $52.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $52.00

Manufacturer:
Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

GE Lumination (Gelcore)

6180 Halle Drive,

Valley View Ohio

28 Days

Contractor, LOT VI : Conservation Station, Inc.

LOT VII - ITEMS #276 (AWARD BY LOT):

Vehicle Signal (LED) Modules - Type A - Bi Modal Arrow as per the Detailed Specifications & as described below.
Type “A” modules are not designed for use in signals which utilize the Model 215 current monitor.

Item gr?éz Manufacturer’s or Dealer’s
No. Description Each Catalog Order #
27. | 12" (300mm) Yellow & Green Bi-Modal Arrow Type A LED Module
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $99.000
Order Quantity: 6-12> $97.000 TSL-12BM-LD-A1-NCGC
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $95.000
Order Quantity: 25-48> $93.000
Order Quantity: 49+> $91.000

Manufacturer:
Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

Leotek Electronics

1330 Memorex Drive, Santa Clara, CA

60 Days

Contractor, LOT VI : Marbelite Company, Inc.

(continued)
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GROUP 35800 Traffic Control Equipment Il

(Statewide)

AWARD PAGE 12

LOT VIII - ITEMS #28 -33 (AWARD BY LOT):

Vehicle Signal (LED) Modules - NYSDOT Standard Type -
as per the Detailed Specifications & as described below.

Item |:l>Jrr|](|:fa Manufacturer’s or Dealer’s
No. Description Each Catalog Order #
28. 12” (300mm) Red Ball LED Module - NYSDOT Standard"
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $48.00
Order Quantity: 6-12> $46.00
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $44.00 TSLAZR-LXAILS-ALNYS
Order Quantity: 25-48> $42.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $41.00
29. 12” (300mm) Yellow Ball LED Module - NYSDOT Standard
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $64.00
Order Quantity: 6-11> $61.00
Order Quantity: 11-24 > $59.00 TSLAZY-LXALS-ALNYS
Order Quantity: 25-48> $57.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $56.00
30. 12” (300mm) Green Ball LED Module - NYSDOT Standard
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $61.00
Order Quantity: 6-12> $59.00
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $57.00 TSLAZG-LXALS-ALNYS
Order Quantity: 25-48> $55.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $54.00
31 8” (200mm) Red Ball LED Module - NYSDOT Standard
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $40.00
Order Quantity: 6-12> $37.00
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $35.00 TSL-08R-LX-IL3-AL-NYS
Order Quantity: 25-48> $33.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $32.00
32. 8” (200mm) Yellow Ball LED Module - NYSDOT Standard
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $46.00
Order Quantity: 6-11> $43.00
Order Quantity: 11-24 > $41.00 TSL-0BY-LX-IL3-ALNYS
Order Quantity: 25-48> $39.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $38.00
33. 8” (200mm) Green Ball LED Module - NYSDOT Standard
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $51.00
Order Quantity: 6-12> $48.00
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $46.00 TSL-08G-LX-IL3-AL-NYS
Order Quantity: 25-48> $44.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $43.00

Manufacturer

Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

Leotek Electronics

1330 Memorex Drive, Santa Clara, CA

60 Days

Contractor, LOT VIII : Marbelite Company, Inc.

(continued)
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LOT IX - ITEMS #34 - 36 (AWARD BY LOT):

Vehicle Signal (LED) Modules - NYSDOT Standard Type - Arrows
as per the Detailed Specifications & as described below.

Unit ,
Item Price Manufacturer’s or
No. | pescription Each Dealer’s Catalog Order #
34. 12” (300mm) Red Turn Arrow LED Module NYSDOT Standard
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $41.00
Order Quantity: 6-12> $38.00
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $36.00 TSL-12RA-MF-AL-NYS
Order Quantity: 25-48> $34.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $33.00
35. 12” (300mm) Yellow Turn Arrow LED Module NYSDOT Standard
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $45.00
Order Quantity: 6-11> $42.00
Order Quantity: 11-24 > $40.00 TSL-A2YA-MFE-AL-NYS
Order Quantity: 25-48> $38.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $37.00
36. 12” (300mm) Green Turn Arrow LED Module NYSDOT Standard
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $47.00
Order Quantity: 6-12> $44.00
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $42.00 TSL-12GA-MF-AL-NYS
Order Quantity: 25-48> $40.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $39.00

Manufacturer:
Manufacturer's Address:

Leotek Electronics

1330 Memorex Drive, Santa Clara, CA

Guaranteed Delivery: 60 Days
Contractor, LOT IX : Marbelite Company, Inc.
LOT X - ITEMS #37 - 38 (AWARD BY ITEM):
Item Igr?clfe Manufacturer’s or
No. Description Each Dealer’s Catalog Order #
37. | 12" X 12" (305mm x 305mm) SINGLE PEDESTRIAN WALKING PERSON Only -
LED MODULE TYPE “A” Only
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $75.00
Order Quantity: 6-12> $70.00 PP12B-NM
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $65.00
Order Quantity: 25-48> $63.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $61.00

Manufacturer:
Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

Leotek Electronics

1330 Memorex Drive, Santa Clara, CA

60 Days

Contractor, LOT X, Item 37 : Marbelite Company, Inc.

Vehicle Signal (LED) Modules—NYS Type A - As per Detailed Specifications & as described below.

(continued)
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LOT X - ITEMS #37 - 38 (AWARD BY ITEM): (continued)

Item gr?(':z Manufacturer’s or
No. Description Each Dealer’s Catalog Order #
38. 12”x 12” (305mm x 305mm ) SINGLE PEDESTRIAN HAND Only
LED Module - TYPE A Only
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $70.00
Order Quantity: 6-12> $65.00 PP12B-EH
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $60.00
Order Quantity: 25-48> $58.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $56.00
Manufacturer: Leotek Electronics
Manufacturer's Address: 1330 Memorex Drive, Santa Clara, CA
Guaranteed Delivery: 60 Days
Contractor, LOT X, Item 38 Marbelite Company, Inc.:

LOT XI - ITEMS #39 - 40 (AWARD BY ITEM):

Vehicle Signal (LED) Modules—NYS Type A- as per the Detailed Specifications & as described below.

Item FL>Jrr|](I:"[3 Ma’nufactu rer’sor
No. Description Each Dealer’s Catalog Order #
39. 12”7 x 12”7 (305mm x 305mm) "Man/Hand" Bi-Modal Pedestrian
LED Module - Type "A" Only
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $104.00
Order Quantity: 6-12> $101.00 TP12H-HM-NCGC
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $99.00
Order Quantity: 25-48> $97.50
Order Quantity: 49+> $96.50

Manufacturer:
Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

Leotek Electronics
1330 Memorex Drive, Santa Clara, CA

60 Days

Contractor, LOT XI, Item 39 Marbelite Company, Inc..

Item éjr?(':g Manufacturer’s or
No. Description Each Dealer’s Catalog Order #
40. 16” x 18” (410 mm x 450 mm) (Size A) "Man/Hand" Bi-Modal
Pedestrian LED Module (McCain, ICC & IDC housings) - Type "A"
only
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $88.00
Order Quantity: 6-12> $88.00 PS7-CFC1-26A-24
Order Quantity: 13 -24 > $88.00
Order Quantity: 25-48> $88.00
Order Quantity: 49+> $88.00

Manufacturer:
Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

GE Lumination (Gelcore)
6180 Halle Drive, Valley View Ohio

28 Days

Contractor, LOT XI, Item 40 : Conservation Station Inc.

(continued)
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LOT XII - ITEMS #41 - 43 (AWARD BY LOT):

Portable Solar Powered Traffic Signal System (Two Trailers) as per the Detailed Specifications & as described below.

Item Igr?clfa Manufacturer’s or
No. Description Each Dealer’s Catalog Order #
41. | Portable Solar Powered Traffic Signal System -
(Two Trailers - Master & Drone)
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $45,561.70 QPNW234
Order Quantity: 6-12> $44,999.00

Manufacturer:

0. M. J. C. Signal, Inc.

Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

403 Chestnut Street, Waterloo, lowa
60 Days A/R/O

Contractor, LOT XII, Item 41 : O. M. J. C. Signal, Inc.
Item FL>Jrr|](I:"[3 Manufacturer’s or
No. Description Each Dealer’s Catalog Order #
42. Portable Solar Powered Traffic Signal Trailer -
Master Trailer Module
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $24,000.00 SQ3TS
Order Quantity: 6-12> $24,000.00
Manufacturer: Horizon Signal Technologies Inc.
Manufacturer's Address: 225 Wood Corner Road, Latitz, Pennsylvania

Guaranteed Delivery:

30 Days A/R/O

Contractor, LOT XII, Item 42 : Horizon Signal Technologies Inc.

Item ;Jr?ég Manufacturer’s or
No. Description Each Dealer’s Catalog Order #
43. Portable Solar Powered Traffic Signal Trailer -
Drone Trailer Module
Order Quantity: 1-5 > $18,519.40 QPNW234
Order Quantity: 6-12> $18,154.40

Manufacturer:
Manufacturer's Address:
Guaranteed Delivery:

0. M. J. C. Signal, Inc.
403 Chestnut Street, Waterloo, lowa

60 Days A/R/O

Contractor, LOT XII, Item 43 : O. M. J. C. Signal, Inc.

(continued)
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CONTRACT PERIOD AND EXTENSION/RENEWAL:

General - It is the intention of the State to enter into a contract for the term as stated on the Invitation for Bids
except, that per the terms of the Contract Period and Extension/Renewal clause of the Invitation for Bids, the
commencement and termination dates appearing on the Invitation for Bids have been adjusted forward unilaterally by the
State for this contract by two calendar months, as indicating said change on this Contract Award Notification.

Short Term Extensions - In the event the replacement contract has not been issued, any contract let and
awarded hereunder by the State, may be extended unilaterally by the State for an additional period of up to one
month upon notice to the contractor with the same terms and conditions as the original contract including, but not
limited to, quantities (prorated for such one month extension), prices, and delivery requirements. With the
concurrence of the contractor, the extension may be for a period of up to three months in lieu of one month. However,
this extension terminates should the replacement contract be issued in the interim.

Contract Renewal - If mutually agreed between the Procurement Services Group and the contractor, the contract
may be renewed under the same terms and conditions for an additional period(s) not to exceed a total contract term of five
(5) years.

PERIODIC RECRUITMENT:

The State reserves the right to consider additional vendors beginning February 1, 2009 and at six month intervals
thereafter during the course of the contract or at any time determined by the State to be in its best interest. Vendors shall
be required to submit an original bid document which may include an addendum containing additional applicable
statutory requirements currently in effect at the time of the new bid solicitation. Bids shall be evaluated under similar
terms and conditions. Once awarded a contract, a vendor may not resubmit a bid for future consideration until the
original bids have been evaluated and contracts awarded.

NOTE TO CONTRACTOR:
This Contract Award Notification is not an order. Do not take any action under this contract except on the basis of
purchase order(s) from the agency or agencies.

MINIMUM ORDER:

Minimum order for this offering varies by lot.

There is no minimum requirement for controllers, signal modules, and their accessories. Contractors have quoted
multiple prices on the primary products in these lots to account for varied purchasing needs. Supplemental accessories in
these lots will have no minimum order.

Minimum Order for all other lots will be based on the manufacturers’ standard packaging, therefore, minimum
orders in Lot Il are based on stated standard wire reel lengths.

All parties should be aware that these quantities could change if the manufacturers packaging changes over time.
In the event of such change, it is the responsibility of the contractor to notify the Purchasing Officer of record, as to the
changes in a timely manner. A purchasing memo will then be published to announce any changes in packaging which
impact the minimum order amount.

Contractor may elect to honor orders for less than the minimum order. For such orders, at the contractor’s option,
shipping costs from the contractor’s address (as stated in bid) may be added to invoice with a copy of the freight bill.
Shipping costs are to be prepaid by contractor and such orders are to be shipped on an F.O.B. destination basis. All such
orders must be shipped by the most economical method for the proper delivery of the product unless special instructions
are stated on the order by the agency.

(continued)
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PURCHASE ORDERS AND INVOICING:
Orders under this contract are to be submitted directly to the contractor.

General — All purchase orders, invoices and vouchers should include the contract number and a line by line listing
of separate charges.

Purchase Orders — Purchase orders are to include the following information :
» Award or Contract Number

» Product code/manufacturer number and description.

» Contract price: by unit and extension to total.

» Delivery Instructions

Invoices - Contract users are instructed not to process invoices without needed information. Invoices must be
detailed and include all of the following:
»  Contract Number
»  Purchase Order Number
»  Product code/manufacturer number/ Item Number
e Preferably a manufacturer’s code or identifying number
e Should not be something that is “unique” to dealer or distributor.
e Should be something that can be tracked by a third party.
» Line item breakdown of all charges:
o Delivery charges (if applicable) in the event of a less than minimum order purchase.
Failure to comply may result in lengthy payment delays.
NOTE TO AGENCY:
NYS agencies and/or political subdivisions whose receiving facilities cannot accommodate entrance of an over the road
trailer with a height of 13'-6" must specify on their purchase order - "Maximum trailer height for delivery to this location is
.”(insert height in this space).

"OGS OR LESS" GUIDELINES APPLY TO THIS CONTRACT:
Purchases of the products included in the Invitation For Bids and related Contract Award Notification are subject
to the "OGS or Less" provisions of Section 163.3.a.v., Article XI, of the New York State Finance Law. This means that
State agencies can purchase products from sources other than the contractor provided that such products are substantially
similar in form, function or utility to the products herein and are:

1. lower in price
-and/or-
2. available under terms which are more economically efficient to the State agency (e.g. delivery terms, warranty
terms, etc.).

Agencies are reminded that they must provide the State contractor an opportunity to match the non-contract
savings at least two business days prior to purchase. In addition, purchases made under "OGS or Less" flexibility must
meet all requirements of law including, but not limited to, advertising in the New York State Contract Reporter, prior
approval of the Comptroller's Office and competitive bidding of requirements exceeding the discretionary bid limit.
State agencies should refer to Procurement Council Bulletin "OGS or Less Purchases" for complete procedural and
reporting requirements.

(continued)
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DELIVERY:

General - Delivery is expressed in number of calendar days required to make delivery after receipt of a purchase
order (ARO). Product is required as soon as possible.

Purchase Order Instructions - Delivery shall be made in accordance with instructions on purchase order from
each agency. If there is a discrepancy between the purchase order and what is listed on the contract, it is the contractor’s
obligation to seek clarification from the ordering agency and, if applicable, from the Office of General Services,
Procurement Services Group. (SEE ALSO SEPARATE CLAUSE ON “PURCHASE ORDERS AND INVOICES”.)

Shipping Dates And Delivery Time -

» Contractor shall provide written acknowledgement of orders within five (5) business days after receipt of order
which will include an anticipated shipping date of each order

» If shipment will not be made within the delivery time, the contractor is required to notify the agency in writing
at least two weeks prior to the latest date of the original delivery obligation. This notification must include the
reasons for the delay and the latest date the product will be shipped. Should the delay not be acceptable to the
using agency, appropriate contract default proceedings will be initiated. Failure to supply timely written
notification of delay may be cause for default proceedings.

»  All correspondence on shipping dates and delivery time shall be directed to the ordering agency's contact
person.

Special Instructions for New York State Department of Transportation Deliveries - Deliveries shall be made
to the Division of Operations and Maintenance Highway, inside the yard facility at destinations indicated on purchase
order. Advance notice of delivery, in writing, shall precede each delivery, and shall be issued so as to arrive at the
delivery point at least 48 hours before the delivery is made. Delivery will be accepted only between the hours of 9:00
a.m. and 3:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, excluding Holidays. Duplicate copies of all packing lists, shipping notices,
etc. must be sent to the following address at the time of shipment:

New York State Department of Transportation
Traffic Signal Laboratory
16 Avis Drive
Latham, NY 12110
ATTN: John Litteer
(518) 783-7746
FAX - (518) 783-7828
e-mail to: jlitteer@dot.state.ny.us

Expansion of Delivery Points - Upon mutual agreement, delivery locations may be expanded per the "Non-State
Agencies Participation in Centralized Contracts" and "Extension of Use" clauses incorporated herein.

Delivery Condition - Contractor shall be responsible to make no shipment of the product that will be exposed to
conditions during transit, detrimental to the product. Product must be delivered strictly in accordance with specifications
and shall be "Ready for Use.”

Delivery Certification - Contractor shall secure a signed receipt from agency certifying to delivery of
product. In the event deficiencies are later noted and a properly signed receipt is not available, contractor will be
responsible.

(continued)
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LIQUIDATED DAMAGES:

In the event of a delay or default in any delivery, providing such delay or default is not directly attributable to a
material fault of the ordering agency, the agency shall be entitled to and shall assess against the vendor as liquidated
damages, a sum calculated as follows:

One-hundred dollars ($100.00) dollars per day to compensate for delay, and other losses inconveniences attendant
upon’such delay from the of the grace period, commencing from the time delivery was due under thecontract. A grace
period of seven (7) calendar days commencing on and including the contract date for delivery shall be extended to the
vendor prior to the assessment of such liquidated damages. Notice is hereby given to the vendor that despite the
extensions of the grace period herein specified, time shall be and is of the essence in regard to the delivery of these
products to the using agency.

Furthermore, notice is hereby given that, where the delay in delivery is directly attributable to the manufacturer of
the traffic control equipment, the vendor remains responsible for and the using agency may assess such liguidated
damages. Such manufacturer-based_delay in delivery beyond 30 days may also constitute grounds for the State to
terminate, for its cause and convenience, the contract at no expense or cost to the State at the State's sole option.

Liquidated damages, if assessed, shall be deducted from the purchase order price for each shipment delivered
against such purchase order.

CONTRACT PAYMENTS:

Payments cannot be processed by State facilities until the contract products have been delivered in satisfactory
condition or services have been satisfactorily performed. Payment will be based on any invoice used in the supplier's
normal course of business. However, such invoice must contain sufficient data including but not limited to contract
number, description of product or service, quantity, unit and price per unit as well as federal identification number.

State facilities are required to forward properly completed vouchers to the Office of the State Comptroller for audit
and payment. All facilities are urged to process every completed voucher expeditiously giving particular attention to those
involving cash discounts for prompt payment.

If the contract terms indicate political subdivisions and others authorized by law are allowed to participate, those
entities are required to make payments directly to the contractor. Prior to processing such payment, the contractor may be
required to complete the ordering non-State agency's own voucher form.

See also "Contract Billings™ in Appendix B, OGS General Specifications and separate clause above on
“PURCHASE ORDERS AND INVOICING”.

ELECTRONIC PAYMENTS:
The Office of the State Comptroller (OSC) offers an "electronic payment” option in lieu of issuing checks. To
obtain an electronic payment authorization form visit the OSC website at www.osc.state.ny.us or contact them by e-mail
at epunit@osc.state.ny.us or by phone at 518-474-4032.

(continued)
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PRODUCT DISCONTINUATION AND SUBSTITUTION:

In the event a specified manufacturer’s product listed in the Contract becomes unavailable or cannot be supplied
by the Contractor for any reason (except as provided for in the Savings/Force Majeure

Provision of Appendix B, General Specifications) a product deemed in writing by the Office of General Services to
be equal to or better than the specified product must be substituted by the Contractor at no additional cost or expense to
the Authorized User.

It is the vendor’s responsibility to inform the Office of General Services, Purchasing Officer, in a timely fashion.
The notification should include the date of loss of availability and the current inventory level for the product. The
contractor shall provide to OGS PSG, complete information on the replacement product including, but not limited to: a
Specification List, Function and Feature list and Comparison of Performance between the new and old product. Upon
approval by the Office of General Services

Unless otherwise specified, any substitution of Product prior to the Commissioner’s written approval may be cause
for cancellation of contract. In the event that a contractor is unable to provide a replacement, it is the State’s right to
cancel the contract.

REQUEST FOR CHANGE:
Any request by the agency or contractor regarding changes in any part of the contract must be made in writing to
the Office of General Services, Procurement Services Group, prior to effectuation.

OVERLAPPING CONTRACT ITEMS:
Products/services available in this contract may also be available from other New York State contracts. Agencies
should select the most cost effective procurement alternative that meets their program requirements and maintain a
procurement record documenting the basis for the selection.

RECALLS:
The contractor must immediately notify the Office of General Services, Procurement Services Group of any recalls
pertaining to product on contract.

POOR PERFORMANCE:
Agencies should notify Procurement Services' Customer Services promptly if the contractor fails to meet the
requirements of this contract. Performance which does not comply with requirements or is otherwise unsatisfactory to the
agency should also be reported to Customer Services:

Office of General Services Tel: 518/474-6717
Procurement Services Group Fax: 518/474-2437
Customer Services Coordination E-mail: customer.services@ogs.state.ny.us

37th Floor Corning Tower
Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

PSG's DISPUTE RESOLUTION POLICY:

It is the policy of the Office of General Services’ Procurement Services Group (PSG) to provide vendors with an
opportunity to administratively resolve disputes, complaints or inquiries related to PSG bid solicitations or contract
awards. PSG encourages vendors to seek resolution of disputes through consultation with PSG staff. All such matters
will be accorded impartial and timely consideration. Interested parties may also file formal written disputes. A copy of
PSG’s Dispute Resolution Procedures for Vendors may be obtained by contacting the person shown on the front of this
document or through the OGS website (www.ogs.state.ny.us).

(continued)
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PERFORMANCE REQUIREMENTS:

Customer Support - The contractor shall provide toll-free telephone support/assistance at no extra charge to all
customers

Discrepancies - The contractor shall resolve all order and invoice discrepancies (e.g., shortages, breakages,
etc.) within five business days from notification.

Product Returns - Problem Products - Products returned because of quality problems, duplicated shipments,
outdated product, etc., shall be picked up by the contractor within five business days after notification with no
restocking charge and shall be replaced with specified products or the agency shall be credited/refunded for the full
purchase price.

Product Returns, Agency Error - Standard stock products ordered in error by agencies must be returned for
credit within 15 days of receipt. Product must be in resalable condition (original container, unused). There shall be no
restocking fee if returned products are resalable.

Price Lists and Catalogs -Contractor shall be required to furnish, without charge, catalog and price lists identical
to those accepted with their bid, including any changes (additions, deletions, etc.) pursuant to the contract, to all
authorized users which request them. Catalogs and price lists provided must reflect all products excluded from the
resultant contract either through the omission of those portions or by obvious indications within the catalogs and price
lists. Fulfillment of any request must be made within 14 calendar days of the request.

Catalogs and price lists may be furnished in either hard-copy or electronic format. If available in both formats,
they shall be furnished in the format preferred by the requesting authorized user. Upon request the contractor shall assist
authorized users in the use of catalogs and price lists. Price lists provided to contract users under this contract should
contain Net Prices reflecting the proper discounts for appropriate product lines.

Sale Flyers - At the contractor's option, sale catalogs, and flyers based on the awarded catalog, that offer
further price reductions, may be offered to contract users. Also, at the contractor's option, catalogs/price lists developed
for a specific customer's specialized requirements may be offered.

Report of Contract Purchases - Contractor shall furnish a report containing both state agency and authorized non-state
agency contract purchases by the fifteenth of the month following the end of each six month period.
The reports shall be in the following format:

Item

Total Dollar

Product Description Sold to/Shipped to Quantity Unit Price Value

The report is to be submitted to the Office of General Services, Procurement Services Group, Tower Bldg., Empire
State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242, to the attention of the individual shown on the front page of the Contract Award
Notification and shall reference the Group Number, the Invitation for Bids Number, Contract Number, sales period, and
contractor's name.

Additional related sales information, such as monthly reports, and/or detailed user purchases may be required and
must be supplied upon request.

Failure to submit the required report may be cause for disqualification of contractor for future contracts.

(continued)
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QUICK CONTACT CHART

Contractors have designated the following contacts expediting orders and inquiries in both normal business hours as well as in

the event of an emergency occurring after business hours or on weekends and holidays:

PC# Contractor: American Wire Group
Lead Contract Administrator: Robert Dorfman, President
Lot #: Il Item 8 Order Inquiries and Expediting After Hours Emergency Contact
Name: Robert Dorfman - SAME -
Title: President

Telephone Number:

Toll Free Telephone Number:
Fax Number:

Cellular Phone Number:
E-Mail Address:

Company’s Normal Business Hours:

(954) 455-3050
(800) 342-7215
(954) 455-9886
(954) 298-5548
THHNMAN@aol.com

9:00 A. M. to 5:00 P. M. (Eastern Time), Monday thru Friday

Phones are manned 24 hours a day.

PC#

Contractor: Conservation Station

Lead Contract Administrator
Lot #s: VI, and XI-ltem 40

Matthew T. Bolesky, Vice President -Sales

Order Inquiries and Expediting

After Hours Emergency Contact

Name:

Title:

Telephone Number:

Toll Free Telephone Number:
Fax Number:

Cellular Phone Number:
E-Mail Address:

Company’s Normal Business Hours:

Matt Bolesky

Vice President - Sales

(919) 932-9201 Ext. 11

(888) 870-8800 Ext. 11

(919) 932-9206 / (888) 870-7700
(919) 698-2914

matt@conservationstation.net

- SAME -

8:00 A. M. to 5:00 P. M. (Eastern Time), Monday thru Friday

PC#

Contractor: Horizon Signal Technologies

Lead Contract Administrator
Lot #: XII - Item #42

David S. Krahulec, Vice President
Order Inquiries and Expediting

Chief Operating Officer
After Hours Emergency Contact

Name:

Title:

Telephone Number:

Toll Free Telephone Number:
Fax Number:

Cellular Phone Number:
E-Mail Address:

Company’s Normal Business Hours:
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Robert Corse

Regional Sales Manager
(610) 478-4886

(800) 852-8796 ext 143
(717) 721-9080

n/a

rcorse3333@aol.com

John A. Yingst (Andy)
Technical Support
(800) 852-8796 ext. 138
(800) 852-8796 ext. 138
(610) 687-5123
(484)571-8757

rcorse3333@aol.com

8:00 A. M. to 4:00 P. M. (Eastern Time), Monday thru Friday
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QUICK CONTACT CHART (Cont’d)

PC #

Contractor: Marbelite Company

Lead Contract Administrator
Lot #s: V, VII, VIII, IX, X
& Xl-Item #39

Joseph Lipari, President

Order Inquiries and Expediting

After Hours Emergency Contact

Name:

Title:

Telephone Number:

Toll Free Telephone Number:
Fax Number:

Cellular Phone Number:
E-Mail Address:

Company’s Normal Business Hours:

Joseph Lipari
President
(732)292-2100 ext 101
(866) 609-7270

(732) 292-2122

(732) 740-1129

jlipari@marbeliteco.com

- Same -

8:00 A. M. to 5:00 P. M. (Eastern Time), Monday thru Friday

PC#

Contractor: O. M. J. C. Signal Technology

Lead Contract Administrator
Lot #s:XII - Items 41 & 43

Arlen Yost, President
Order Inquiries and Expediting

After Hours Emergency Contact

Name:

Title:

Telephone Number:

Toll Free Telephone Number:
Fax Number:

Cellular Phone Number:
E-Mail Address:

Company’s Normal Business Hours:

Arlen Yost
President

(319) 236-0200
(800) 776-5999
(319) 236-1554
(319) 230-4486

arlen@omjcsignal.com

- SAME -

9:00 A. M. to 4:00 P. M. (Eastern Time), Monday thru Friday

PC#

Contractor: Pathfinder Traffic, L.L.C.

Lead Contract Administrator
Lot #: 1

Matthew Schaefer, Owner
Order Inquiries and Expediting

After Hours Emergency Contact

Name:

Title:

Telephone Number:

Toll Free Telephone Number:
Fax Number:

Cellular Phone Number:
E-Mail Address:

Company’s Normal Business Hours:
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Matthew Schaefer
Owner

(585) 394-6777
(888) 704-1303
(888) 704-1303
(585) 703-9851

mschaefer@pathfindertraffic.com

- SAME -

8:00 A. M. to 5:00 P. M. (Eastern Time), Monday thru Friday

(continued)
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(Statewide)

AWARD PAGE 24

QUICK CONTACT CHART (Cont’d)

PC #

Contractor: Wise Components, Inc.

Lead Contract Administrator
Lot #: Il Items #4,6,7,

Mike Visci - Sales Manager
Order Inquiries and Expediting

After Hours Emergency Contact

Name:
Title:

Telephone Number:

Toll Free Telephone Number:

Fax Number:
Cellular Phone Number:
E-Mail Address:

Company’s Normal Business Hours:

20859a.doc/PSG Team 06/jem

Michael Visci
Sales Manager
(203) 325-2191
(800) 543-4333
(203) 325-52198
(203) 223-2336

mvisci@wisecomponents.com

- SAME -

8:00 A. M. to 5:00 P. M. (Eastern Time), Monday thru Friday

* k* k k%

(continued)
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State of New York
Office of General Services
PROCUREMENT SERVICES GROUP
Contract Performance Report

Please take a moment to let us know how this contract award has measured up to your expectations. If reporting on more
than one contractor or product, please make copies as needed. This office will use the information to improve our contract
award, where appropriate. Comments should include those of the product’s end user.

Contract No.: Contractor.

Describe Product* Provided (Include Item No., if available):

*Note: “Product” is defined as a deliverable under any Bid or Contract, which may include commodities (including printing),
services and/or technology. The term “Product” includes Licensed Software.

Excellent Good Acceptable Unacceptable

o Product meets your needs

o Product meets contract specifications

e Pricing

CONTRACTOR

Excellent Good Acceptable Unacceptable

Timeliness of delivery

Completeness of order (fill rate)

Responsiveness to inquiries

Employee courtesy

Problem resolution

Comments:

(over)

Agency: Prepared by:

Address: Title:

Date:

Phone:

E-mail:

Please detach or photocopy this form & return by FAX to 518/474-2437 or mail to:

OGS PROCUREMENT SERVICES GROUP
Customer Services, 37th Floor
Corning 2™ Tower - Empire State Plaza
Albany, New York 12242

* * X% * *x

(continued)
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