Bid Opening Results For:

[FB NUMBER 22699
BID OPENING 5/23/2013
GROUP NUMBER 38708

PURCHASING OFFICER ~ Beverly L Moore

TELEPHONE (518) Y%~ 2 14>

DESCRIPTION
Scientific Equipment and Related Accessories
In-Breath Alcohol Testing
(Statewide)




State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services — New York State Procurement
Corning Tower - 38" Floor
Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

(E-Mail or Facsimile Bid Submissions Are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING TITLE: GROUP 38708 - SCIENTIFIC EQUIPMENT AND RELATED
DATE: May 23, 2013 ACCESSORIES IN-BREATH ALCOHOL TESTING (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AM :
Classification Code(s): 41 & 42

INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
' 22699 As Incorporated Herein
CONTRACT PERIOD: August I, 2013 through July 31, 2018
DESIGNATED CONTACTS
Beverly L. Moore, Contract Management Specialist Jill McCabe, Purchasing Team Leader
E-mail: beverly.moore@ogs.ny.gov E-mail: jill. mccabe@ogs.ny.gov

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITTATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard
Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and §139-k
(Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, bidder affirms that it
understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-
i (3) and §139-j (6) (b). Information may be accessed at:

hitp://ogs.ny.gov/aboutOgs/regulations/defaultSFL_139j-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax Hdentification Number: | NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Nei Tse Sxefal Necurity Nupther) (See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)
61-1205273 .
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate box =~ XX Small Business 0O Minority Owned [0 Women Owned
(check all that apply). 240 #Employees Business Business
Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
_ CMI, Inc.
D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):
Street City State Zip County
316 East 9th Street, Owensboro, KY 42303 daviess
[f applicable, place an “x™ in the appropriate box 0O Manufactured Within ¥ Manufactured Outside
. (check all that apply). New York State New York State

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and retumn this page only.
OO WE ARE UNABLE 19 BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE

Bidder’s Signature; £, Printed or Typed Name: Top Settles
Title: Managery Marketine & Sales Date: May 21, 2013
Phone : ( 270) 685 -6362 ext ( ) Toll Free Phone : ( ) - ext { )
Fax :{270) 685 -6678 ext ( ) Toll Free Fax () - ext( )
| E-mail Address: wtsettles@alcoholtest.com Company Web Site: www.alcoholtest.com
HORNEWNORESTATE PROCUREMENT LSE ONLY
PRH 226599 LIT: B MEMO: 3 EETE CITHER = MISSINGPAGES
(Continued)

22699i_Revised.docx/blm | S



State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services — New York State Procurement
Corning Tower - 38" Floor
Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

(E-Mail or Facsimile Bid Submissions Are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING TITLE: GROUP 38708 — SCIENTIFIC EQUIPMENT AND RELATED
DATE.: May 23, 2013 ACCESSORIES IN-BREATH ALCOHOL TESTING (Statewide)

TIME: 11:00 AM
Classification Code(s): 41 & 42

INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22699 As Incorporated Herein
CONTRACT PERIOD: August 1, 2013 through July 31, 2018
DESIGNATED CONTACTS
Beverly L. Moore, Contract Management Specialist Jill McCabe, Purchasing Team Leader )
E-mail: beverly.moore(@ogs.ny.gov A E-mgil: . jill.mccabe@ogs Ay-gov

The bid must be fully and propetly executed by an authorized person. By, slgmng you certlfy your Xpress authorlty to sign on behalf of
yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this. INVITATI@N FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard
Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Fmance Law §139-j and §139-k
(Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, bidder affirms that it
understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacs as required by State Finance Law §139-
i {3) and §139-j (6} (h). Information may be accessed at:

htip://ogs.ny.gov/aboutOgsiregulations/defanltSFL._139j-k.asp

Bidder’s Federal Tax Identification Number: ' NYS Vendor Identification Number:
{Ba Not Use Social Sacurity Number) {Sen “New York State Vendar File Registration” clause)
23-2139091 1000008907
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate box Smal! Business O Minority Owned & Women Owned
(check all tlmt apply): _ 18 #Employees Business Business

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
Guth Laboratories, Inc.

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable);

Streelon North 67th Street  C%arrisburg Stateps  Zip 47999 COUY hin
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate box O Manufactured Within ¥ Manufactured Outside
(check all rhat apply). New York State New York State

<. ”

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
0 WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE

Bidder’s Signatm'f?-‘—"‘? % Printed or Typed Name: Ted L. Pauley

Title: President Date: 5 /27 //3
Phone : (717 ) 564 - 5470 ext { ) Toll Free Phone : ( 800 ) 233 - 2338 ext( )
Fax  : (717 ) HR4 . ORE§ ext { ) Toll Free Fax () - ext( )
E-mail Address:  fipaulev@avithiahs.com Company Web Site:
FORNEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY
[ PR & 22699 LIt O _MEMO & LET O OIHER i MISSING PAGES
(Continued) '
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State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services — New York State Procurement
Corning Tower - 38" Floor
Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

(E-Mail or Facsimile Bid Submissions Are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING TITLE: GROUP 38708 — SCIENTIFIC EQUIPMENT AND RELATED

DATE: May 23, 2013 ACCESSORIES IN-BREATH ALCOHOL TESTING (Statewide)

TIME: 11:00 AM

Classification Code(s): 41 & 42

INVITATION FOR BIDS NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22699 As Incorporated Herein

CONTRACT PERIOD: August 1, 2013 through July 31, 2018
DESIGNATED CONTACTS

Beverly L. Moore, Contract Management Specialist Jill McCabe, Purchasing Team Leader
E-mail: beverly.moore@ogs.ny.gov E-mail: jill.mccabe@ogs.ny.gov

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard
Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and §139-k
(Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate, By signing, bidder affirms that it
understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to perm1ss1b]e contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-
j (3) and §139-j (6) (b). Information may be accessed at:

http:/fogs.ny.gov/aboutOgs/tegulations/defaultSFL_139j-k.asp

Bidder’s Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)
43-0906533 1000009340
If applicable, place an “x™ in the appropriate box 0O Small Business O Minority Owned {0 Women Owned
(check all that apply): #Employees Business Business

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: Intoximeters. Inc

D/B/A. - Doing Business As {if applicable):

Sweet 5081 CraigRoad O st, Louis Stae \ig AP 63146 County ¢ Louis
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate box 0O Manufactured Within & Manufactured Outside
{check all that apply): New York State New York State

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
0O WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE

Bidder’s Signature: ‘ ! t ! \ Printed or Typed Name: ~ Chris Dalton
Title: President Date: 5' a,b / }3
Phone : (314 ) 429 - 4000 ext( ) Toll Free Phode : ( 800) 451 - 8639 ext ( )
Fax (314) 429 - 4170 ext( ) Toll Free Fax : ( ) - - oext( )
E-mail Address sales@intox.com Company Web Site; www.intox.com : :
B FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY R

[P.R. # 22699 LIT O MEMO O LET O OTHER O MISSING PAGES |

(Continued) : T
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Price Pages - Lot |
GROUP 38708 - Scientific Equipment Related Accessories In-Breath Alcohol Testing

Bidder's Price Page Summary

Statewide Estimated Manufacturer Catalog

Iltem Number Bidder Unit List Price NYS Unit Net Price Extended Price Reference Number

Quantity/Units

Address Of Manufacturing Plant

Lot| - Item 1 No Bid 50 -

Lot | - Item 2 No Bid 50 -

Lot - Item 3 No Bid 50 -

Lot | - ltem 4 Intoximeters 300| $ 8,495.00 | $ 7,025.00 2,107,500.00 |50-0140-00 2081 Craig Rd, St. Louis, MO 63146

Lot - Item 5 No Bid 50 -

Lot - Item 6 No Bid 50 -

Lot |- Item 7 No Bid 50 -

Lot |- Item 8 CMI 50| $ 6,625.00 331,250.00 |I-8000 316 East 9th Street, Owensboro KY 42303
Lotl-Item9 Intoximeters 75| $ 515.00 | $ 309.00 23,175.00 |12-0210-00 2081 Craig Rd, St. Louis, MO 63146

Lot |- Item 10 Intoximeters 75| $ 545.00 | $ 329.00 24,675.00 |40-0010-00 2081 Craig Rd, St. Louis, MO 63146
Lotl-Item 11 Intoximeters 75| $ 715.00 | $ 650.00 48,750.00 [13-0360-10 2081 Craig Rd, St. Louis, MO 63146
Lotl-Item12 |No Bid 75 -

Lot!-Item 13 |No Bid 75 -

Lotl-Item14 |CMI 75| $ 330.00 24,750.00 |S-D2 316 East 9th Street, Owensboro KY 42303
Lotl-Item15 |CMI 75| $ 299.00 22,425.00 |S-D5 316 East 9th Street, Owensboro KY 42303
Lot!-Item 16 |No Bid 600 -

22699 Price Page Summary Web

Attachment 1 of 8
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Bidder's Price Page Summary Price Pages - Lot |
GROUP 38708 - Scientific Equipment Related Accessories In-Breath Alcohol Testing

Statewide Estimated Manufacturer Catalog
Item Number Bidder Quantity/Units Unit List Price NYS Unit Net Price Extended Price Reference Number Address Of Manufacturing Plant
Lot|-Item 17 |No Bid 75 $ -
Lot |- Item 18 Guth 75| $ 795.60 | $ 795.60 | $ 59,670.00 |AS-3410-MT 590 N 67TH ST, HARRISBURG, PA 17111
Lot |- Item 19 Guth 75| $ 580.50 | $ 580.50 | $ 43,537.50 [AS-1104-MT 590 N 67TH ST, HARRISBURG, PA 17111
Lot | - Item 20 Guth 75| $ 94950 | $ 949.50 | $ 71,212.50 [AS-2110-DR 590 N 67TH ST, HARRISBURG, PA 17111
Lot - ltem 21 Guth 5 $ 855.00 | $ 855.00 | $ 4,275.00 |AS-12V5-DP 590 N 67TH ST, HARRISBURG, PA 17111
Lot|-Item?22 |No Bid 50 $ -
Lot|-Item23 |No Bid 50 $ -

22699 Price Page Summary Web Attachment 1 of 8 20f2



Bidder's Price Page Summary Price Pages - Lot Il
GROUP 38708 - Scientific Equipment Related Accessories In-Breath Alcohol Testing

Number of Units per

Statewide Estimated Manufacturer Catalog Bidder'sStandard Address Of
Item Number Bidder Quantity/Units Unit Price Extended Price Reference Number Package Manufacturer Name  Manufacturing Plant
590 N. 67TH ST,
HARRISBURG, PA

Lot Il - Item 24 [Guth 100,000| $ 0.19|$ 19,000.00 |[GM-0100-00 100/ BOX GUTH 17111
2081 Craig Road, St.
Intoximeters 100,000| $ 0.25|% 25,000.00 |23-0010-00 200]Intoximeters Louis, MO 63146

2081 Craig Road, St.
Lot Il - Item 25 |Intoximeters 20,000] $ 014 | $ 2,800.00 |23-0040-00 200]Intoximeters Louis, MO 63146

2081 Craig Road, St.
Lot Il - Item 26 [Intoximeters 20,000 $ 014 | % 2,800.00 [23-0050-01 200]Intoximeters Louis, MO 63146

2081 Craig Road, St.
Lot Il - Item 27 |Intoximeters 20,000| $ 022|$% 4,400.00 |23-0000-00 200(Intoximeters Louis, MO 63146

2081 Craig Road, St.
Lot Il - tem 28 |Intoximeters 20,000 $ 016 | $ 3,200.00 |23-0120-00 200|Intoximeters Louis, MO 63146

316 East Ninth Street,

Lotll - Iltem 29 |CMI 20,000 $ 0.16 | $ 3,200.00 15030 250|CMI, Inc. Owensboro, KY 42303
Lot Il - Item 30 [No Bid 1,000 $ -
Lot Il - Item 31 [No Bid 20,000 $ -

22699 Price Page Summary Web Attachment 1 of 8 lof1l



Bidder's Price Page Summary Price Pages - Lot I
GROUP 38708 - Scientific Equipment Related Accessories In-Breath Alcohol Testing

Statewide Address Of
Estimated Manufacturer Catalog Manufacturing
Item Number Bidder Specification/Description Number of Bottles Quantity/Cases Unit Price Extended Price Reference Number Manuf. Name Plant
Reference Standard |Per Detailed Specification in 590 N 67TH ST,
Lot lll - Item 32 |Guth |- Liquid Section 1.2.3 (case lots) (500 ml) 16 3,750 $ 4901$% 294,000.00 [PM-XXXX-XX GUTH HARRISBURG, PA
Same as Iltem 32, but Less than 2 $ 14.25
case lots - packaged 2 4 $ 12.73
bottles/pack (500 ml). These 6 $ 11.63
prices will not be considered in 8 * $ 1067 * * * *
the financial evaluation of bid 10 $ 9.77
ranking. 12 $ 885
14 $ 7.98

22699 Price Page Summary Web Attachment 1 of 8 lofl



Bidder's Price Page Summary Price Pages - Lot IV
GROUP 38708 - Scientific Equipment Related Accessories In-Breath Alcohol Testing

Statewide Estimated Manufacturer Catalog
Item Number No. of Liters Quantity/Cylinders Unit Price Extended Price Reference Number Manufacturer Name Address Of Manufacturing Plant

Lot IV - Item 33 |Guth 105 50 $ 9850 | $ 4,925.00 [DG-U020-10 CALGAZ 81 CHESAPEAKE DR., CAMBRIDGE, MD
Intoximeters 108 50 $ 109.00 | $ 5,450.00 [22-0790-00 Airgas 3500 Bernard Street, St. Louis, MO 63103
CMI 50 $ 316.00 | $ 15,800.00

Lot IV - Item 34 |Guth 105 50 $ 98.50 | $ 4,925.00 [DG-U080-10 CALGAZ 81 CHESAPEAKE DR., CAMBRIDGE, MD
Intoximeters 108 50 $ 109.00 | $ 5,450.00 |(22-0780-00 Airgas 3500 Bernard Street, St. Louis, MO 63103

Lot IV - Item 35 |Guth 105 50 $ 98.50 | $ 4,925.00 |DG-U100-10 CALGAZ 81 CHESAPEAKE DR., CAMBRIDGE, MD
Intoximeters 108 50 $ 109.00 | $ 5,450.00 (22-0840-00 Airgas 3500 Bernard Street, St. Louis, MO 63103

Lot IV - Item 36 |Guth 105 50 $ 9850 | $ 4,925.00 |DG-U180-10 CALGAZ 81 CHESAPEAKE DR., CAMBRIDGE, MD
Intoximeters 108 50 $ 109.00 | $ 5,450.00 |(22-0885-00 Airgas 3500 Bernard Street, St. Louis, MO 63103

Lot IV - Item 37 |Guth 105 50 $ 98.50 | $ 4,925.00 |DG-U250-10 CALGAZ 81 CHESAPEAKE DR., CAMBRIDGE, MD
Intoximeters 108 50 $ 109.00 | $ 5,450.00 (22-0886-00 Airgas 3500 Bernard Street, St. Louis, MO 63103

Lot IV - Item 38 |CMI 105 1,000 $ 85.00 | $ 85,000.00 |340233 ILMO 7 Eastgate Drive, Jacksonville, Illinois 62650
Guth 60 1,000 $ 98.75 | $ 98,750.00 |DG-U100-60 CALGAZ 81 CHESAPEAKE DR., CAMBRIDGE, MD
Intoximeters 55 1,000 $ 99.00 | $ 99,000.00 |22-2400-00 Airgas 3500 Bernard Street, St. Louis, MO 63103

22699 Price Page Summary Web Attachment 1 of 8 lofl



