Bid Opening Results For:

I[FB NUMBER 22346
BID OPENING 4/20/2011
GROUP NUMBER 32100

PURCHASING OFFICER  Beverly L Moore

TELEPHONE (518) 474-7273

DESCRIPTION
Calcium Chloride Flake and Pellet
(Readvertisement of IFB 22232, Bid Opening Date
03/15/2011)
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)




GROUP 32100 - CALCIUM CHLORIDE FLAKE & PELLET
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=2

Bidder

Slack Chemical Co., Inc.

LOT 1. TRUCKLOAD DELIVERY BY ZONE

CALCIUM CHLORIDE, FLAKE in 50# moisture-proof bags:

Estimated
OGS Zone Quantity
Item # No. Tons
1 1 70
2 2 25
3 3 15
4 4 15
5 5 15
6 6 15
7 7 20
8 8 210
9 9 25
10 10 40
11 1 30

**% Lot 1 77-82% Calcium Chloride, Minimum Truckload Quantity is:

Flake~

Slack cannot secure the percentage Product Name:

requested, therefore, the 837 (as
requested in Lot2) was bid and
MSDS was submitted.

Address of plant where manufactured:

Manufacturer:

Number of days to make delivery after receipt

of purchase order for DELIVERY:

(continued)

OGS
Item #

10

11

42000:&:

Delivered Price
Per Ton

$435.84
$ 435.84
$.435.84
$.435.84
$ 495.84
$.516.84
$.435.84
$ 435.84
$ 455.90

$ NO BID

$NO BID

“Fons.

Oxy Chen

(Dow)

Dowflake
Oxy Chem

tra
Dow)

Occidental Tower, 5005 LBJ Freeway

Dallas, TX 75244

2-3

DAYS

10

11

2l

KT PAGE 16
Bidder
Scotwood Thdustrvies
OGS Delivered Price
Item # Per Ton

5. 2P . 0O
5. . 00
5 350 - OO
$35L. HO
3. 2000
$%50.00
$ .00
$351 .00
$35g- DD
s Dol .00
s_30[.00

Tons.

Calcium Chiovide Fladee_

Tan(in Quingy uan TrtH. TrccdiﬂgCD .

S8 Topiok BLDEG. 3

TARTWAN RD., HEXT D\sTRUCT

TIANTIN

3-5H DAYS

ET PAGE 16

Bidder
Dot Seasonal “’Proc\oc,j@\
e .
0GS Delivered Price
Item # Per Ton
| s 399
2 S
3 5. 3 90
4 5. S 12
5 s 319
N 1 E
: 599
8 5 260
9 5 599
10 s 399
1 5.5 70
22H  qons,

Flakes of Fire |
,D&F‘b &aﬁorxﬂ( K@ J‘vu{;‘f /:"C»

7§O ’gio?:m')[i"i /c[ AU’Q
C/l"Péor\ A/j—07@fq

- DAYS




GROUP 32100 - CALCIUM CHLORIDE FLAKE & PELLET
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
Sal Chemical

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

g

Bidder

Slack Chemical Co., Inc.

LOT 2. TRUCKLOAD DELIVERY BY ZONE
CALCIUM CHLORIDE, FLAKE in 50# moisture-proof bags:

Estimated
OGS Zone Quantity
Item # No. Tons
12 1 130
13 2 25
14 3 15
15 4 15
16 5 15
17 6 . 15
18 7 45
19 8 65
20 9 95
21 10 40
22 11 65
Minimum Truckload Quantity is:
Product Name:
Manufacturer:

Address of plant where manufactured:

Number of days to make delivery after receipt
of purchase order for DELIVERY:

(continued)
22346i/T06blm

OGS Delivered Price
Item # Per Ton
12 $ 521.87
13 $_477.96
14 $_462.95
15 ¢ 452.78
16 $_444.29
17 $_452.99
18 § 521.59
19 $_490.59
20 $_477.58
21 s_No Bid
22 $ No Bid
40,000 Tons.
Dowflake
Oxy Chem

1600 S Madison Ave.

Ludington, MI 49431

4-5

DAYS

OGS

Item #

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

42000

Delivered Price
Per Ton

$
$

435.84
435.84
435.84
435.84
495.84
516.84
435.84
435.84
455.90

NO BID

NO BID

Fons-

Dowflake Xtra

Oxy Chem (Dow)

Occidental Tower, 5005 LBJ Freeway

Dallas, TX 75244

2-3

DAYS

ET

PAGE 17

Bidder

Thatcher Company of New York
P. 0. Box 118
Williamson, NY 14589

OGS
Item #

12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

22

22

Delivered Price
Per Ton

$_ NoBid
$ No Bid
$496.20
$ 495.09
$.493.93
$495.09
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid

Tons

Calcium Chloride Flakes,

Anhydrous Calcium Chloride 94-97% Mini-Pellets

Occidental Chemical Corporation

Ludington, Michigan

U.S.A.

Within 3 to 5 pAYs




GROUP 32100 — CALCIUM CHLORIDE FLAKE & PELLET PAGE 17

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE Dot Sengora] Capdyck ‘

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX \ae .

=D DD DD D

LOT 2. TRUCKLOAD DELIVERY BY ZONE

CALCIUM CHLORIDE, FLAKE in 50# moisture-proof bags:

Estimated

OGS Zone Quantity OGS Delivered Price

Item # No. Tons Item # Per Ton
12 1 130 12 $ 3 E Z
13 2 25 13 5 .5 7
14 3 15 14 $ 3 ‘7 ‘/
15 4 15 15 5 3 1Y
16 5 15 16 $ 3 (7
17 6 15 17 $ 3 l? Z
18 7 45 18 $ 3 C; ;
19 8 65 19 $ 3 67 ‘71
20 9 95 20 $ 3 (7 Z
21 10 ' 40 21 5 > 72
22 11 65 22 $ 3(/?1

Minimum Truckload Quantity is: Q‘ 2. L/ Tons.

Product Name:
Manufacturer:

Address of plant where manufactured:

Number of days to make delivery after receipt
of purchase order for DELIVERY:

(continued)
223461/T06blm

F/‘}kér mﬁ ,[f!"f |
Darl Seasonq / o docts Inc,

75 o @K/;?a m’ﬁe/a/ //U{
Clitteon AT 079/

5 DAYS

PAGE 17

Bidder
FLOR-DRI SUPPLY CO. INC.

5450 W. JEFFERSON AVE.

DETROIT, MI 48209-3114
OGS Delivered Price
Item # Per Ton

12 $ 3 65, ol
13 s 35 7. 20

14 s357 20
15 s 357 22
16 $ 7.20
17 s 357 20
18 s 362,00
19 s 362, 00
20 5362 .00

21 s 281, 00
22 $H76, 00

2 Z' (/ Tons. |
Dow Fenme XTrRM

Jeoo S, miAp/sor’
LuweZed, WML 4943/

7 DAYS

FLOR-DRI SUPPLY CO. INC.
5450 % JEFFERSON AVE,
DETROIT, MI 48209-3114




GROUP 32100 - CALCIUM CHLORIDE F LAKE & PELLET

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

e "

Bidder

Slack Chemical Co., Inc.

LOT 3. TRUCKLOAD DELIVERY BY ZONE
CALCIUM CHLORIDE, PELLET in 50%# moisture-proof bags:

Estimated
OGS Zone Quantity OGS Delivered Price
Item # No Tons Item # Per Ton
23 1 90 23 $_499.60
24 2 15 24 $_499.60
25 3 30 25 $_499.60
26 4 35 26 $_499.60
27 5 45 27 $ 559.60
28 6 15 28 $ 580.00
29 7 45 29 $_499.60
30 8 75 30 $_499.60
31 9 15 31 $ 519.60
32 10 115 32 $ NO BID
33 11 120 33 $_NO BID
Minimum Truckload Quantity is: 42000 3 Fons:
Product Name: Peladow
Manufacturer: Oxy Chem (Dow)

Address of plant where manufactured:

Number of days to make delivery after receipt
of purchase order for DELIVERY:

{Arstine AN

Occidental Tower, 5005 LBJ Freeway

Dallas, TX 75244

2-3

DAYS

LET

PAGE 18

ne:
er:

ed:

ipt
Y:

1ed)

Bidder

Scofwvod Industrie S

0GS Delivered Price
Item # Per Ton
23 s 4Al -00
24 s L -00
25 s YRl 00
26 s Y24p. 0D
27 s_ 4. 0D
28 5. 42. 0O
29 sHA DO
30 s Y2l- 0O
31 s Y240 00
32 s 455.00
33 3. 445-00
AR5  tons
Excel
Vitro Chemicod

Curvetcra A Gardiq

KiIn 94 Goutcia

Nuerd Laxedo, Mey | cd

3-5  pays

PAGE 18

Bidder

P. O. Box 118

Thatcher Company of New York

Williamson, NY 14589

OGS
Item #

23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32

33

22

Delivered Price
Per Ton

s NoBid
s NoBid
5 485.67
$.484.57
548340
$484.57
s NoBid
s NoBid
s NoBid
sNoBid
s NoBid

Tons.

Calcium Chloride Flake,

Anhydrous Calcium Chloride 94-97% Mini-Pellets

Occidental Chemical Corporation

Ludington, Michigan

U.S.A.

Within 3 t0 5 pavs
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GROUP 32100 - CALCIUM CHLORIDE FLAKE & PELLET

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions) ET PAGE 18
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Biddep ‘
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE F é“%% %Sﬁ%gfgofvofi % C. Bidder
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX . .
DETROIT, MI 48209-3114 Sal Chemical

Y G

LOT 3. TRUCKLOAD DELIVERY BY ZONE
CALCIUM CHLORIDE, PELLET in 50# moisture-proof bags:

Estimated
OGS Zone Quantity OGS Delivered Price
Item # No Tons Item # Per Ton OGS Delivered Price
o Item # Per Ton
23 I 90 23 s 417. 9 ”
5.576,82
24 2 15 24 s YO. 00 N
$ 532.92
25 3 30 25 s Y19.00 ’s 517.91
§ 2141
26 4 35 26 s 410, 00 26
5_507.73
27 5 45 27 5 410,08 2
$.499.25
28 6 15 28 s 4/0.89
28 § 207.94
29 7 45 29 s.413. 69
29 $_576.54
30 8 75 30 s 413,08
30 $_545.54
31 9 15 31 $ 69 i
' $_532.53
32 10 115 32 s 423,00 5 .
. $ No Bid
33 11 120 33 $ 4L/' ﬂ ﬂ
, 33 $ No BId
Minimum Truckload Quantity is: 2’ Z, y/ Tons. 40,000
2 Tons.
Product Name: /) E LHDO .
roduct Name / 2% Peladow
Manufacturer: { Wﬁ_’ %’?
Address of plant where manufactured: / é o0 S YL/ @/5&;1/ 1600 S Madison Ave
L‘M&W Ludingt
#943/ ngton, MI 49431
Number of days to make delivery after receipt
of purchase order for DELIVERY: Z DAYS 45
— ___DAYS
FLOR.
5451? DRI SUPPLY Co. Inc
0 W. JEFFERSON AVE,
OIT, MI 482093114
(continued)

223461/TO6bIm




GROUP 32100 - CALCIUM CHLORIDE FLAKE & PELLET

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 18

ET

PAGE 18

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

2 DD D D

Bidder

BL/J/MM%L/ CW)K@{)

Bidder

DQ.C‘—\' gec\fﬁxﬂ(;\{ Q\"O(&JC.{Z\ \{\C .

LOT 3. TRUCKLOAD DELIVERY BY ZONE

CALCIUM CHLORIDE, PELLET in 50# moisture-proof bags:

0GS
Item #

23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30
31
32

33

Estimated
Zone Quantity

No Tons

1 90

2 15

3 30

4 35

5 45

6 15

7 45

8 75

9 15

10 | 115

11 120

Minimum Truckload Quantity is:
Product Name:
Manufacturer:

Address of plant where manufactured:

Number of days to make delivery afler receipt

of purchase order for DELIVERY:

(continued)

223461/T06blm

OGS Delivered Price
Item # Per Ton

% s_ 505
24 5. OIS
25 s OIS
% s OlF
27 5. D35
% s D35
29 $ J[:_Z% ()
30 s S/5
31 s D15
32 s 510
33 s 515

&O Tons.

Poladow)

Oty Ohom

l ikl
Li/{ 1 ({%”u / f\ el fﬁf

‘ - {"i DAYS

0GS Delivered Price
Item # Per Ton
23 s H20
24 A
25 s 4o
26 5. 420
2 s 4418
28 s 420
29 s Ao
30 s 398
31 $_ 420
32 s 39
3 s 579

22. 4 Tons.
Pellets of Fice
DPuart Seasonal

ﬁ)’oal velbs //‘[

JSo f/agm~ ét:'/cl e

Cl H;; ~ /\/ f

o702

3 DAYS




