Bid Opening Results For:

[FB NUMBER 20999
BID OPENING 8/7/2007
GROUP NUMBER 31504

PURCHASING OFFICER  Joseph Hodder

TELEPHONE (518) 474-3668

DESCRIPTION

Bituminous Concrete Cold Patch
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)




GROUP 31504 —- BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 30 |

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

e .

Amenia Sand & Gravel, Inc.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M " Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)
20999i.doc/T06jh

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

§ 63.75

$_ No Bid

$__No Bid

$_No Bid

s No Bid

$_No Bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_No_Bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1** Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

307 Leedsville Road, Amenia, NY 12501

Dutchess County
# 10147 (Port Ewen)

I'CH
iions)

PAGE 30

Bidder

Buffalo Crushed Stone, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$_69.10

$__N/a

$ N/
$ N/a

$ N/A

$ 2. A( )0 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$__.18 perNet Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1** Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Lancaster Erie

[CH PAGE 30
ions)

Bidder

Buffalo Crushed Stone, Inc.

#__10106

*Price F.0O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

g 69.10

$_N/a

N/A

N/A

&2

&2

N/A

$2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_.18 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1¥ Kilometer

CITY /COUNTY
Cheektowaga. Frie

4 10096




GROUP 31504 —- BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=D D D =22 =

Argady Acrhadt A~
heseesutes Coee-

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M - Plant Mix

15402.2020M Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only uniess
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)
20999i.doc/T06jh

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Mefric Ton

bl- 00

f1.25

- R - B - S - - ]

$ Z 80 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_-2 £ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

Pn(v:jc oﬂm“a 1Z;_‘{ - hlhy NY - Mband
. 1bool © Coud

PAGE 30

PAGE 30

PAGE 30 'CH
é j ons)

Bidder
,ﬁzwh%&s’ébw@ (g7 RS

Frriz, NEw! Soek 1 Sffo

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

s S7. 2
s 97 Z
s g0 %
s 74 %
s . %

o
$ oZ- = per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ - z# per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1 Kilometer

CITY /COUNTY
v N — orerdd £banr™

4 s00 43

Bidder

Barre Stone Products, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

g 60.00/MT

$ NB

$ NB

$_NB

$_NB

$1.25  perNet Metric Ton Kilometer

$ .30 perNetMetric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Albion/QOrleans

v

#_10306




T0: 15184865628 P.5-19

GROUP 31504 - BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH PAGE 30 |

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions) ‘CH PAGE 30 'CH PAGE 30
: ions) ions)
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder _
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE Barrett Paving Materials,Inc. Bidder Bidder BLADES
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX 4530 Wetzel Road BR BITUMINOUS PROD., INC. Construction Products Corporation
= = s = Liverpool, N¥ 13090 4 7610 County Route 65
P.0. Box 590
Moreh--H4543

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

. ) o
T i
15402.2010M Plant Mix 5 $59.91 $49.75 . $75.00
15402.2020M Cold Mix $No Bid $.59.50 | - $NB

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix $No Bid $79.90 5 NB

15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix 38 Bid 5.68.50 §86.00
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix 588.00 $73.00 $NB

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
$.1.50 _ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

o Klometer : g per et Mtric Ton Kilometeg ’ - $2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
$__O_:,?__5___ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
1+ Kilometers $_:_2;§;.___ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer after the 1 Kilometer $.20 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

after the 1 Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY VESTAL, NY _ BROOME CO. CITY / COUNTY
Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County): Jamesville,NY -Onondaga 10350 Hornell {Steuben Co.)
# s
NYS DOT Facility Number: # 10349 #10327
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

ed)
1)

(continued)
20999i.doc/To6jh
08/07/07 TUE 09:11 [TX/RX NO.8317] [do0os5



CH PAGE 30

GROUP 31504 — BITUMINCUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
ons)

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE B ett i i Barrett Paving Materials, Inc.
arr Paving Materials, Inc.

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX P.0. Box 400 P.0. Box 400

_ s S = = = Washington Mills, NY 13479 Washington Mills, NY 13479

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching *Price F.O.B. Plant _ *Price F.O.B. Plant
Item Material Type 3 per Net Metric Ton per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M - Plant Mix $ _68.00 $_58.00
15402.2020M Cold Mix $ No Bid $_58.00
15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix $ No Bid $ 88.60
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix $ 81.00 $_No Bid
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix $ No Bid $_88.00
TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery) |
-
0-1 kilometer $No Bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer $.1.80__  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
1+ Kilometers $No Bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer ‘ $0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer after the 1* Kilometer
CITY / COUNTY CITY / COUNTY
Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County): City of Binghamton - Broome County Boonville, NY - Lewis County
NYS Rt. 12
NYS DOT Facility Number: # 10180 #_ 10138
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)
20999i.doc/TO6jh

PAGE 30

Bidder

Barrett Paving Materials; Inc.
P.0. Box 400

Washington Mills, NY 13479

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$_58.00

$ 58.00

$_88.00

$ No Bid

$ 88.04a:l

$1.80 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1 Kilometer
CITY /COUNTY

Litchfield, NY - Herkimer County
\ 363 Rasbach Road

# 10323




GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONC RETE COLD PATCH

PAGE 30

(Al State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
Barrett Paving Materials, Inc.

26572 NYS Rt. 37
Watertown, NY 13601

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

i — Y

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M Cold l\/;ix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402,2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple [ocations.

{continued)
20999i.doc/T06jh

*Price F.O.B. Plant

per Net Metric Ton
$  NB
$___57.50
§ NB
$___NB
$ NB

s 0.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

5 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1** Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Watertown Facility, Watertown, NY
Jefferson ounty

#10231/10277

PATCH
livisions)

Bidder

Barrett Paving Materials, Inc.
379 Ferris Road
Constable, NY 12926

ted)

*

b
b

Price F.O.B. Plant

per Net Metric Ton
NB

37.50

NB

NB

NB

)

5

0.50 . perNet Metric Ton Kji lometer

0.25 per Nel Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1" Kilometer

———— e

CITY /COUNTY

Westville, Franklin County

Ferris Road, Constable, NY

#

10139

CH PAGE 30
ions)

Bidder .
Barrett Paving Materials, Inc.

7971 State HWY 56
Norwood, NY 13668

- ¥Price F.O.B. Plant

pet Net Metric Ton
$__NB
$__57.50
$ NB
$ _NB
$__NB

$_0-50  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

§ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY /COUNTY

Norwood Facility, Norwood, NY

St. Lawrence County
# 10137/10261

o



GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

—le——

Bidder _
VESTAL ASPHALT, INC.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M ) Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)

20999%i.doc/T06jh

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

§ 63.49

$ No Bid

$.No Bid

g 82.49

$_1.75  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$__-25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Sangerfield/Oneida

*CH

ions)

Bidder

SENECA STONE CORP.

430204

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$

$ 60.65

$

$

$ 85.50

$ .60 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
$ - 30 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

after the 1% Kilometer
CITY / COUNTY

FAYETTE, NY SENECA

"CH
ions)

PAGE 30

Bidder
VESTAL ASPHALT, INC.

#

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$ No Bid

§63.49

$ No Bid

$ No Bid

$82.49

$1.75  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ +25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY /COUNTY
Vestal/Broome

4 0903




GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH o _ PAGE 30

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX Suyit-Kote Corp.

W. Oneonta, NY
e Qe s s S s S e

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching *Price F.O.B. Plant
Item Material Type per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M Plant Mix ¢ No Bid
15402.2020M  Cold Mix g °8.00
15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix g_ No Bid
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix $ No Bid
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix $ 84.00

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer $_2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

1+ Kilometers $_0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County): W. Oneonta, NY Otsego Co.
NYS DOT Facility Number: # 30902

(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)
20999i.doc/T06jh

'CH PAGE 30
jons)

Bidder

Suit-Kote Corp.
Jamestown, "NY:ii ‘<

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$ No Bid
$ No Bid

¢ No Bid

$ No Bid
$ 84.00

$_2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

CITY /COUNTY

Jamestown, NY Chautauqua Co.
" 30501

‘CH
ions)

PAGE 30

Bidder

Suit-Kote Corp.
McGraw, NY

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

§ 60.00

$ 58.00
85.00

g 77.00

$_80.00

b3 2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Polkville, NY Cortland Co.

# 10237 :




GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH

PAGE 30

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

N

Bidder

SCATT MATERIALS CORP.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
~ (required for Items 15402.2010M,
. 2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)

20999i.doc/T065h

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$_ _N/B
$ N/B

$__$118.50

$ NIR
N

$ ¢118 5O
$118.

$ N/B__ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_n/B . per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
__Ba_y_She-pe-,——Nél—/—S-u—ﬂf—Olk

# 10-293

.TCH
isions)

PAGE 30

Bidder

Suit-Kote Corp.
Watertown, NY

*Price F.0.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$

No Bid

$

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

84.00

CITY / COUNTY

$2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

Watertown, NY Jefferson Co.

1)

430703

‘CH PAGE 30
ons)

Bidder

Suit-Kote Corp.
Watkins Glen, NY

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$ No Bid

$ 58.00

$ No Bid
$ No Bid

$.84.00

$2.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ 0.25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1 Kilometer
CITY /COUNTY

Watkins Glen, NY Schuyler Co.

#_ 30603




GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

" PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE

-Spec. Stockpile Patching
Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix
15402.2020M Cold Mix
15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
=D DD DD DD

Bidder

LA fHTERAY

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stackpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

20999i.doc/T06jh

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$
$

$ 3.7

$

$

$ o 7 5 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer -

5 - 3‘5— per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

A//ak/mg €. Lrey Tasc..

CITY / COUNTY !

SHAERS LY V7~ 4 (/ f/w///'/é’/@f‘/)
yw JOULS b

PAGE 3

TCH
sions)
Bidder
PECKHAM MATERIALS CORP
20 HAARLEM AVENUE
WHITE PLAINS, N 10603
*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton
$
$
s 7375
$
3
$ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
$ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer
CITY / COUNTY
Happis Rd. BEpsrn - Lﬂ}'%’%fffm
s JO07/7 2

2d)

'CH

PAGE 30

ions)

Bidder

T leta New YorK Toc.

d)

*Price F.O.B. Plant

per Net Metric Ton
s Nobid

s M Bid

$ 113.55
$_ M B4

s No B4

$ Ao Bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
$ NoBid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

after the 1% Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Tilean W. Nyack Agphelf - NMyeck NY Roc

4 10I1s8




GROUP 31504 - BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(ANl State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

TCH
sions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

A

Bidder
Po&\*&\e, Store CQ\'P .

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M _Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)
20999i.doc/T06jh

*Price F.O.B. Plant

per Net Metric Ton
$ NT
$ NE
$ £9.00
$ AT
$ AS

$ ]*_\ B per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_ W B per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Bidder

FECKIGr fa7 €d LS

_SM@Oa-_So_dﬂ%‘ Ny
AN,

#_100lb

*Price F.O.B. Plant

per Net Metric Ton
s__ (4,00
$
3
$
$

$ % ! per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
$_¢ 30 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY _
Lowion faLd, LIRS AL PN

# /DZ”D/ /DD/L/

CH

ons)

Bidder

Pecktar frrco g

4

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$

s £3.00

$1 Z) per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ 30 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

CATs KILL Grleepye
s JOLES

PAGE 30



55938252 T-919 PB36/857 F-260

GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH L PAGE 30 [CH . PAGE 30
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions) rions) [CH P
! A
’ : | iions) GE 30
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder  NASSAU ASPHALT SUPPLY CORR Bidder . ]
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE dblg  RASON ASPHALY Northern Bitumineus Mix, Tl TR

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
= D D D =

RO. BOX 530
OLD BETHPAGE, NY 11804

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Medified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)

20999i.doc/T065h

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

s B% =

; 85 %

s 13 g2

s No v

s No %W

$_6_%__ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer -

49
$ O — _ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Meluile . SuErelk lounty
4 03071

32 S\wK Road

Fullen, Ny 3009

08/03/07 FRI 14:11

*Price F.0.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$ no bid
5 no_bid
s 9245
$_po bid
$_na bid

$_nan bid per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_nd lﬂé per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
sfter the 1* Kilometer

/?9 ck Ars ?ﬂ\/é'ﬂ’lék/ 74

CITY / COUNTY
Fol\ton / Os:.beao
4_lop L2

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

&8.00

Ar—

N R - Y

$ 88 .00

$ ey

per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ — per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1** Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

[TX/RX No 8299] [do3s

Srormvi//s
4 wNfa

Dvrehess

2.

4




Zoo[ [8V09 ON Xd/XL]l BS:€T NOR L0/90/80

G'Roﬁr 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

I S G

(Ali State Agencies and Poﬁﬁuﬂ Subdivisions)

Bidder N .JBRUNFLL & SON INC.
AN19 RT, 22 o
PLATTSBURGH, NY 12901

PHONE (518) 561-1290

|

FA i - 45

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTTTIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE EID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. ) Stockpile Patching
Item, Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix
15402.2020M Cold Mix
' 15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Meodified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATIES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stoclpile or Supply Location (include Cily & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(cequired for Ttems 15402.2010M,
© 2030M and 2040M)

*Tnclude prising for one supply locstion anly unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)

205951.docsT06h

*price F.O.B. Plaut
per Net Metvic Ton

$
b

114,02

&5 [

$ 172 perNet Metric Ton Kilometer

¢ +298  LerNet Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1¥ Kilometer -

CITY /COUNTY o (iwron County
o8 RY.2Z  PIMSBURGH, V.

4 30707

TCH
isions)

PAGE 30

ALS

Bidder

Lafarge
Lockport Quarry

400 Hinman Road, Lockport

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$

$

§ 94.03

$ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

after the 1% Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Lockport, Niagara Co.

716 692 0613 P.004
FCH PAGE 30
ions)

Bidder

Midland Asphalt Materials Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant

#10101

~ per Net Metric Ton

3

$ 62.25

$ 99.00

$

$

$__ perNet Metric Ton Kilometer
$ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

after the 1* Kilometer
CITY / COUNTY

Allegany, NY Cattaraugus Co.

#__ 30505

08/07/07 TUE 10:49 [TX/RX NO 83201 [doo4



GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(AN State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 30

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

— -

T MG, (€

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M . Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)
20999i.doc/T06jh

*Price F.0.B. Plant

per Net Metric Ton
$
$
$
$
s 76.85

$J:55 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

s O 2 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer -

after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

SKBW/ERTBLES [ 8484 DAT+1

4 /005

CH
ons)

PAGE 30

Bidder

JAMESTOWN MACADAM, INC.

Walden Avenue
P.O.Box 518

Celoron, New York 14720-0518

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$

s 82.45
$__99.00
$

$

$_ 2.91 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ .13 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Jamestown, Chautauqua

# 10260

\ICH PAGE 30
isions)
Bidder
Dowm GausHald-

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

s No %\’D

s No Bio
$ 74.00
5_ No @)\D
No®1D

&3

$ N E 5 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
$ NE per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

after the 1 Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Cilere Mnlls, Wayeen

# \_OO\‘:)




GROUP 31504 - BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 30

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

R I

Bidder

T.Mm UsS.,~¢

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M _ Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.20 10M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

s
$
s 91,95
$
$

$ 2,55 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ & | %' per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
afier the 1% Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
CBorny ondl s

4 10206

(continued)

20999.doc/ TG

CH
ons)

[CH
ions) PAGE 30

Bidder

T, Srve

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

L.qs”

® B e

s 910,95

$_ OS5  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

s &, / 6) _per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1** Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Bupiof ERIC
4 /0250, /0106, /oo 9e

Bidder

L.ma.s, see

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

-
$ ﬂ( 95  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ ﬂ X 51 ~ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Lo Bungl/ g a Cans
s J0/6")




GROUP 31504 —~ BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH S PAGE 30
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions) '

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= DD D=2 2 =

Bidder
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.

P.0O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M Cold Mix

15402.2030M - Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

52.00

$
$
$
$
$

$_1.00 . per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Oriskany Falls, NY Oneida

# 10034

(continued)

20999i.doc/T06jh

[CH PAGE 30

ions)

Bidder .

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513

Jamesville, NY 13078

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$__52.00

LI - T Y

$_1.00 . perNet Metric Ton Kilometer

$_0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Jordanville, NY Herkimer

# 10288

ICH PAGE 30
sions)

Bidder

Hanson Aggregates New York, - Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

~ *Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$_52.00

A e s

$_1.00 . perNet Metric Ton Kilometer

$_0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

St. Johnsville, NY Montgomery

#__ 10039




GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions) -

PAGE 30

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=

Bidder

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M Cold i\ﬁix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)

20999%i.doc/T06jh

*Price F.O.B. Plant

per Net Metric Ton
$
$ 52.00
$
$
$

$.1.00 . per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$.0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Skaneateles, NY Onondaga

# 10052

ions)

[CH " PAGE 30

Bidder

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513

Jamesville, NY 13078

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

52.00

® B A A e

$_1.00 . perNet Metric Ton Kilometer

$_0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Ogdensburg, NY

# 10134

St. Lawrence

I'CH PAGE 30

sions)

Bidder

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513

Jamesville, NY 13078

_ *¥Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$
$_52.00

$
$

$_1.00 . perNet Metric Ton Kilometer

$_0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

# 10133

Watertown, NY Jefferson



GROUP 31504 ~ BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

TCH
sions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

e O

Bidder

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513 ,
Jamesville, NY 13078

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M Cold Mi.x

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)
209991.doc/T06jh

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$ 52.00

$
$_80.00

$

$

$.1.00 . per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1™ Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Honeoye Falls, NY Livingston

4 10053

Bidder :

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513 :
Jamesville, NY 13078

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$
§ 52.00

$_80.00

$
$

$_1.00 . perNet Metric Ton Kilometer

$_0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Oaks Corners, NY Ontario

# 10054

[CH
ions)

PAGE 30

Bidder

P.O.

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc,

Jamesville, NY 13078

Box 513

ued)

S Y ST S Y

“*Price F.0.B. Plant

per Net Metric Ton

52.00

$' 1.00 . per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
South Lansing, NY Tompkins

#_10067




GROUP 31504 - BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH - PAGE 30 TCH " PAGE 30 ‘CH PAGE
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions) ' sions) ions) , 30
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder Bidder Tidaes

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

— -

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)
20999i.doc/T065h

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

g 52.00

$
§ 80.00

$
$

$.1.00 . perNet Metric Ton Kilometer

$_0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY /| COUNTY
-Stafford, NY Genesee

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.0. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

# 10289

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$ 52.00

$
$__80.00
$
$

$_1.00 . perNet Metric Ton Kilometer

$.0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1 Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Scottsville/Rochester Monroe

# 10087

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc.
P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078

. *Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

g 52.00

$
$ 80.00

$

$

$.1.00 . per NetMetric Ton Kilometer

$_0.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Rochester, NY Monroe

# 10066




GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 30 |

'PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

== 22 =2 =

Bidder

lj OANGL @103 M

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec.
Item

15402.2010M
15402.2020M
15402.2030M
15402.2040M

15402.2050M

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

20999i.doc/T06jh

Stockpile Patching
Material Type

Plant Mix

Cold Mix

Plant-Mixed Modified Mi*
Fiber Reinforced Mix

Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

(continued)

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$

N

$

58.50

$
$

N

NB

$

0.7

3 |.o0 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

' 9‘ 8 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

§_7 O

after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNIT

Moo [Oubon

#

2020\

‘CH i PAGE 30
ions)

Bidder

[fl()/unaa/ @w&j 74ﬂ<—

| *Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

5 MR
5 NB
5 N
5 A
s, 0™

$ \ 00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ ¢ 9 % per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

V\)( e.42 Wesk S««A Lu\(n ‘ ‘Qmsse\ oel

#

TCH PAGE 30
sions)

Bidder

GERIKTT  ASCHRCT
PR=QUCTS (INC.

ed)

. *Price F.O.B. Plant

- per Net Metric Ton
s Nlg
s N e
5. 93.82
$ N/B
s 93.%2

R |
$ 1. per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ S per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1** Kilometer

CITY /COUNTY
S PRANGYWALE ) ERI\E cO.

4 [Clo3




_ GROUP 31504 - BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 30

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

——-

Bidder

Dutchess Quarry&Supply
49 Arborio Rd. PO Box 651

Pleasant Valley, NY 12569

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)

20999i.doc/T06jh

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$
$46.250

$.0.90  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ 0.63  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY /COUNTY
Pleasant Valley, NY

410161, 10254

PAGE 30

Bidder

Hownaw Bnes, e

*Price F.O.B. Plant

per Net Metric Ton
$ U’ & .
$ A

A
s N
%05&7

&

&

$ 1.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ - ;8 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

TCH PAGE 30
sions)

Bidder

w oNaL BReS, e,

e ) og\

A weryp I

" *Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$ MNB
5. S&.50
$ B
5 N
$ 0.

s_ \.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

5 2 o) per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1 Kilometer

CITY /COUNTY
7&1\5\'6 (c\aﬂ\ /N/)AC\(;W\ e
y H020% S 3




PAGE 30 J

GROUP 31504 - BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH CH
. (All State Agencies & Political Subdivisions) ons) [CH PAGE. 30
iions)
" Bidder
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= oD D D = =

Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting ¢o., Inc.

Dowomire Probuers Lomparst | e

Cobleskill Stone Products,Inc.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

*Price F.O.B. Plant

ISt;:rcl:. Sﬁ);l;?il: };\a;:;hmg g;clz :t.(lt\)/igtﬁl::lz’gn per Net Metric Ton *Price F.O.B. Plant

; X per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M Plant Mix $_NO BID B $ -

$ .
15402.2020M Cold Mix ¢ NO BID 43.00 i -
15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix $ NO BID ¥ nB
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix $_73.50 - : -
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix $_NO BID $__BB ‘ -
TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
- $& per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

0-1 kilometer

$1.40 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_-30 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ .18 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_3.00 _ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

1+ Kilometers clric
) after the lst Kilometer_ after the 1% Kilometer $ 0‘50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
st .
, CITY / COUNTY CITY / COUNTY after the 1 Kilometer
Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County): Coblesill/Schoharie,Howes Cave/Schoharie Chemung, Chemung County, New York CITY / COUNTY
| _ As BELOW
NYS DOT Facility Number: # 10177 #_ 10131
(required for Items 15402.2010M, # 10303
2030M and 2040M)
STocepie LocaTion {oorsty -
*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for muitiple locations. GATES Moweoe
Penpiew Monroe
WALWORTH waTuEe
MANCHESTER ONTARLO
Avon LIVINGSToR
LERY GeENESEE

(continued)
20488i1.doc/T06jh : : .
. )



GROUP 31564 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH v ‘ PAGE

{Ali State Agencies and Political Subdivisions) -

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
-PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

- 2 = =

Bidder _
Chenenje (oncrete Coep !

A

Che NA&ng> As p[za,i«r ?/o‘a?u

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTTTIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULZD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)
209991.doc/T065h

*Price F.O.B. Plant

er Net Metric Ton
5 L6-T5
$ N B

$ N2

s 7H Hs”
$

$.F.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$___+4©  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

NoRwich PN- - C. henanyo

TCH PAGE 30
ons)

Bidder

L_Cobleskill Stone Products.Inc,

¢ 1018

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$_NO BID
$_NO BID

$ NO BID

s 78.00
$ NO BID

$1 -_40 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_- 30 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Prattsville/Green,Oneonta/Otsego

Hancock/Delaware
#10177

TCH

ions)

Bidder

Cobleskill Stone Products,Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$ NO BID
¢ NO BID

s NO BID

g 71.25

$ NO BID

$1.40 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_-30 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer

CITY /COUNTY
Schoharie/Schoharie

4 10177

nued)

PAGE 30



GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH' ' : PAGE 30 'CH PAGE 30

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions) FCI:) PAGE 30 ons)
sion
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder (| russe> BlaeKfor _ ' | T
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE n CD‘ B l Bidder R . ! w,b pu HLy SToe eo
; |lAdivisiony ©F A Qolarvsso 28 STATE Whhorey S
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX ) . St ne CO Inc. AT Yo SR
=D DD D DD 2 = b SO e : : |CountyL1ne 0 ? : Towo
NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.
Spec. Stockpile Patching *Price F.O.B. Plant EDo *Pri
: ; . Price F.O.B. Plant : rice F.O.B. Plant
Item Material Type per Net Metric Ton per Net Metric Ton per Net Metric Ton
: o0
15402.2010M Plant Mix $ 55.0 $ 54,90 . . $ L.‘b . SO
. e | — ,
15402.2020M Cold Mix $ 55: . $ ) $ ktb X 50
15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix $ g 76.75 $
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix $ $ v $
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix $ $ ‘ . $
TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer $ .00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer g 1.75 S50
‘ $___ '~ perNet Metric Ton Kilometer $_* ~Y per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
1+ Kilometers $_¢ 35 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer 24 ) . 2 O . .
. sty $__ 2% per Net Metric Ton Kilometer $_>» &Y per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer it prashi
after the 1% Kilometer after the 1% Kilometer
CITY /COUNTY '
o o or Sup] ud CITY / COUNTY CITY / COUNTY
tockpile or Su Location (include City & County): :
kp pply ( ty ty) Town of Newstead, Erie County ONSTe gAY DNewxGomeny
NYS DOT Facility Number: # ‘ 10097,8,275 ‘ '
(required for Ttems 15402.2010M, # il | #__1OL6l
2030M and 2040M)
*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)
20999i.doc/T06jh



; GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH - PAGE 30

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions) [CH PAGE 30 'CH PAGE 30
ions) , ions)
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder ' Bidd . -
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE 1dder Bidder
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX .
Callanan Industries, Inc. Callanan Industries, Inc. | callanan Industries. Inc
= = = =S =D = : ’ .
NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.
Spec. Stockpile Patching *Price F.O.B. Plant . ]
Item Material Type per Net Metric Ton *P;ciri' (lelleBt nzlﬁ‘lgn . *Pnc;I F(I\)/[B Pl%nt
=== ber INet Metnic lon per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M Plant Mix $ 55.75 $ 58.00 s 49.75
15402.2020M _Cold Mix $ No Bid '
$_No Bid $__ No Bid
15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix $__82.75 $ 82.75 s Mo Bid
e O bl
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix $ No Bid $ No Bid ¢ No Bid
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix $_No Bid $_No Bid S No Bid
, _ o Bi
~N N <
TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer ‘ $__.50  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer - $ .50  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer $__<50  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
. . 25 . .
1+ Kilometers $__-20 nggehf:?ﬂigigomem $_ <25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer $__ .25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
. i after the 1** Kilometer after the 1 Kilometer
CIIy /COUNTY . CITY / COUNTY CITY / COUNTY
Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County): Dream Lake Road, Washington County Bridgeville, Sullivan Road kvill
| ; Clockville, Ingalls Corners Road,
| NYS DOT Facility Number: #_10003 (Pattersonville) 4 Sullivan County Madison County
(required for Items 15402.2010M, . 10147 (Port Ewen) # 10176, 10005
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)
20999i.doc/T06jh d)



GROUP 31504 — BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH

PAGE 30

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

Bidder

Callanan Industries, Inc.

NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.

Spec. Stockpile Patching

Item Material Type
15402.2010M Plant Mix

15402.2020M _ Cold Mix

15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix

TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer

1+ Kilometers

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number:
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for multiple locations.

(continued)

20999i.doc/T06jh

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$ No Bid

$_ No Rid
$ 104.50

$_ No_Bid
$_ No Bid

$__3.00 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$_0.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Brockport Quarry, Monroe County
4 10308

PAGE 30

Bidder
Callanan Industries, Inc. hi,)

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$_53.75

$ No Bid

~$_80.75

$ No Bid

$__No Bid

$__.50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$__.25__ per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

Eagt Kingston, Rt. 32, East Kingston

Ulster County
# 10147

[CH
jions)

PAGE 30

Bidder

Callanan Industries, Inc.

)

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$ 53.75

$_No Bid
$__80.75

$_ No Rid

$_No Bid

$__.50  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$__ 25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

e —

after the 1% Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY

—Yillage of Wynantskill, 620 Main Av
Wgnantskill, Rensselaer County

#__ 10003 (Pattersonville)



GROUP 31504 - BITUMINOUS CONCRETE COLD PATCH PAGE 30
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX Callanan Industries, Inc.
— i '
NOTE: ALL CONSTRUCTION AND MATERIALS
QUANTITIES SPECIFIED ARE IN METRIC UNITS,
AND SHOULD BE BID ACCORDINGLY.
Spec. Stockpile Patching *Price F.O.B. Plant
Item Material Type per Net Metric Ton
15402.2010M Plant Mix $_53.75
15402.2020M Cold Mix $_ No Bid
15402.2030M Plant-Mixed Modified Mix $_80.75
15402.2040M Fiber Reinforced Mix $_ No Bid
15402.2050M Cold-Mixed Modified Mix $__No Bid
N
TRANSPORTATION RATES (Hauling/Delivery)
0-1 kilometer $__.50  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer -
1+ Kilometers $_ 25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

Stockpile or Supply Location (include City & County):

NYS DOT Facility Number;
(required for Items 15402.2010M,
2030M and 2040M)

*Include pricing for one supply location only unless
pricing is identical for muitiple locations.

(continued)

20999i.doc/T0Gjh

after the 1* Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Ravena, R, 9W, Albanv County

# 10003 (Pattersonville)

TCH
sions)

PAGE 30

Bidder

Callanan Industries, Inc.

1ed)

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

$__53.75

$__No Bid
$ 80.75

$ 67.25

$__No Bid

$_ .50 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$ .25 per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

after the 1** Kilometer

CITY / COUNTY
Port Ewen, Salem Road, Ulster County

#_10147

‘CH ' PAGE 30
ions)

Bidder

Callanan Industries, Inc.

*Price F.O.B. Plant
per Net Metric Ton

g 49.75

$ No Bid
s 78.75

$ No Bid

$_ No BRid

$ .50  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer

$___.25  per Net Metric Ton Kilometer
after the 1% Kilometer
CITY / COUNTY

Pattersonville, Rt. 53, Pattersonvi

Montgomery County
#__10003 !






