Bid Opening Results For:

[FB NUMBER 20976
BID OPENING 7/31/2007
GROUP NUMBER 32100

PURCHASING OFFICER  Karol Garrison

TELEPHONE (518) 486-1564

DESCRIPTION

Snow /Ice Control Agents
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)




GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 31

If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.

209761.doc/T06/keg {continued)

GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS PAGE 31
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX ﬂ W
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GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(Al State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= D> D > = =

Bidder
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PRICE PER PRICE PER

GALLON GALLON

4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE
MINIMUM  MINIMUM NAME COLOR

LOTI-LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE -

CORROSION INHIBITED

OPTION 1 - DELIVERED
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ITEM ITEM

NO. ZONE NO.
1. 1 1.
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should

make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid

NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER

OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
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GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 31

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
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Bidder

P Enviranmental WO

LOT I - LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE -
CORROSION INHIBITED

OPTION 1 - DELIVERED

OGS OGS
ITEM " ITEM
NO. ZONE NO.
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2 2 2.

3 3 3.

4 4 4.
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid]
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
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(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU

HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should

make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid

NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER

OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
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GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 31

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

PREPARING YOUR BID.

BE SURE YOU

HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=R D

LOT I - LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE -
CORROSION INHIBITED
OPTION 1 - DELIVERED
PRICEPER PRICE PER
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
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PAGE 32

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
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Bidder

SWP Envicanmental LLL .

LOT H - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE-
CORROSION INHIBITED
OPTION 1 - DELIVERED

PRICE PER PRICE PER
OGS OGS GALLON GALLON
ITEM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE
NO. ZONE NO. MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
12. 1 122 $_.155 QLY QP Plus 20 Clar or Boe.
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If submutting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
209761.doc/T06/keg (continued)

87./3172087

168: 00 8457831787 NEW YORK BITUMINOUS PAGE B6/4b
GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS PAGE 32
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copics of approptiate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
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PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
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GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 32

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE

Bidder
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
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GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 32

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
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LOT II - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE-
CORROSION INHIBITED
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NO. ZONE NO. MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
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GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 32

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
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Popmas &wsdn%

02p)

LOT 1I - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE-
CORROSION INHIBITED

OPTION 1 - DELIVERED
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ITEM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE
NO. ZONE NO. MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.

20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued)

GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 32

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=

Bidder

LOT II - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE-
CORROSION INHIBITED

OPTION 1 - DELIVERED

PRICE PER  PRICE PER
0GS OGS GALLON  GALLON
ITEM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE
NO. ZONE NO.  MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
12. 1 2. $ 0% 045 Me\\ém% Clace
13. 2 13. $ 0153 035 MAtewads Clowe
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If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.

209761.doc/T06/keg (continued)




GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 32

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

O D > D =

Bidder

SWP Environmental LLC.

LOT H - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE-
CORROSION INHIBITED
OPTION 1 - DELIVERED

PRICEPER PRICE PER
OGS OGS GALLON GALLON
ITEM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL. PROD DYE
NO. ZONE NO. MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
12. 1 122§ .835 1.035 SWP FG Clear
13. 2 13. $ .825 1.005 SWP FG Clear
14. 3 14. ¢ -807 .897 SWP FG Clear
15. 4 15. $ -768 .818 SWRl'FG Clear
16. 5 16, § /68 .868 SWP FG Clear
17. 6 17 § -768 .818 SWP FG Clear
18. 7 188 §$ .887 1.107 SWP FG Clear
19. 8 19. $ -915 1.115 SWP FG Clear
20. 9 20 $ .867 1.047 SWP FG Clear
21. 10 21, § -995 1.207 SWP FG Clear
22. 11 2 % 995 1.207 SWP FG Clear
If submutting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
209761.doc/T06/keg (continued)
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GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 32

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

g

Bidder

SWP

Environmental LLC.

LOT I - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE-
CORROSION INHIBITED

OPTION 1 - DELIVERED

PRICEPER PRICE PER
OGS OGS GALLON GALLON
ITEM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE
NO. ZONE NO. MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
12. 1 122 $ -905 1.105 SWP Hydro Clear
13 2 13. § -895 1.075 SWP Hydro Clear
14. 3 14. s -877 .967 SWP Hydro Clear
15. 4 15. $ -838 .888 SWP Hydro Clear
16, 5 16, § -838 .938 SWP Hydro Clear
17. 6 17 ¢ -838 .888 SWP Hydro Clear
18. 7 18. § -957 1.177 SWP Hydro Clear
19. 8 190 $ .985 1.185 SWP Hydro Clear
20. 9 20, § 937 1.117 SWP Hydro Clear
21. 10 21, $ 1.065 1.277 SWP Hydro Clear
22. 11 ' 22 $ 1.065 1.277 SWP Hydro Clear

If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
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GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 32

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE

=

SURE YOU

Bid(ljrﬁ_ -
2t

‘D SALES, INC..
i{ON STREET
W YORK 12015

LOT 1 - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE-
CORROSION INHIBITED

OPTION 1 - DELIVERED

OGS
ITEM

NO. ZONE

[a—y

12.
13.
14.
15.
16.

R R I TR *) W O, U N FO R N

— e
O

22.

If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.

209761.doc/T06/keg

PRICE PER PRICE PER
OGS GALLON  GALLON
ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL  PROD
NO.  MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR - CLe”™
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(continued)
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PAGE 33 i ! s
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
rraz Yol s " SR Yo e o S [ L5,
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX SWP Environmental LLC. =9 _ i ;\3 }%J{—R%(HS
D DD D D =2 == ATHE S, M_W YQ 12
LOT II - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE- LOT I - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE-
CORROSION INHIBITED CORROSION INHIBITED
OPTION 2 - DELIVERED TO THE LOCATIONS OPTION 2 - DELIVERED TO THE LOCATIONS
SPECIFIED BY THE AGENCY IN THE SPECIFIED BY THE AGENCY IN THE
SPECIFIED QUANTITIES IN CONJUNCTION SPECIFIED QUANTITIES IN CONJUNCTION
WITH A MINIMUM 200 TON PER HOUR PORT- WITH A MINIMUM 200 TON PER HOUR PORT-
ABLE PUG MILL MIXING PLANT. WITH AN ABLE PUG MILL MIXING PLANT, WITH AN
ADJUSTABLE LIQUID FLOW COI:ITROLLER, ADJUSTABLE LIQUID FLOW CONTROLLER,
AND A QUALIFIED OPERATOR TRAINED BY AND A QUALIFIED OPERATOR TRAINED BY
THE CONTRACTOR. THE PUG MILL WILL THE CONTRACTOR. THE PUG MILL WILL
HAVE A SPLIT HOPPER DESIGN SO THAT IT HAVE A SPLIT HOPPER DESIGN SO THAT IT
MAY RECEIVE DIFFERENT BLENDS OF MAY RECEIVE DIFFERENT BLENDS OF
AGGREGATE AND SALT TO PRODUCE A AGGREGATE AND SALT TO PRODUCE A
HOMOGENOUS BLEND OF AGGREGATES HOMOGENOUS BLEND OF AGGREGATES,
SALT AND LIQUID AS DESIRED BY THE P’UR- SALT AND LIQUID AS DESIRED BY THE PUR-
CHASING AGENCY. THE PURCHASING CHASING AGENCY. THE PURCHASING
AGENCY WILL PRdVIDE A MINIMUM OF AGENCY WILL PROVIDE A MINIMUM OF
TWO LOADERS/OPERATORS TO ASSIST IN TWO LOADERS/OPERATORS TO ASSIST IN
THE MIXING PROCESS. FOR OPTIMAL THE MIXING PROCESS. FOR OPTIMAL
MIXING THREE LO ADERS/OPERATORS WILL MIXING THREE LOADERS/OPERATORS WILL
SUBSTANTIALLY INCREASE DAILY PRODUC- SUBSTANTIALLY INCREASE DAILY PRODUC-
TION TION.
PRICE PER PRICE PER
0GS 0GS GALLON . GALLON | oGS OGS~ GALLON  GALLON e
ITEM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE ITEM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE -~ BLoc )
NO ZONE NO. MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR RO ZONE NO. MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR - CL2A4.
' 23 [ 3 / YO o o/

23. 1 23. $ 1.359 NB SWP_Plus 30 Blue/Green : 2.3 . // Lé—»w /jCLT;{?OV&
24, 2 24, ¢ 1.359 NB SWP Plus 30 Blue/Green 24 2 214 $ /43 f O I 2l [0
25. 3 25. ¢ 1.209 NB SWP Plus 30 Blue/Green 25. 3 PAREE
26. 4 2. § -948 NB SWP Plus 30 Blue/Green 26 4 2. $
27 5 27§ -938 NB  SWP Plus 30 Blue/Green 27. 3 27. %

25 2 T
28 6 28§ .908 NB SWP Plus 30 Blue/Green 28. 6 wos ~
29, 7 20, ¢ 1.397 NB SWP Plus 30 Blue/Green 29 / 2.3 : ~

3 ‘

30. 8 30, $ 1.521 NB SWP Plus 30 Blue/Green 30. 8 30. 8 l"’ LHO
31 9 31, $ 1.209 NB SWP Plus 30 Blue/Green 31 9 3% . ":

3. 10 2%/, ‘%5 /ASE
32. 10 32 $__NB NB
3 " 33§ NB NB 33. 11 ¥, $LYE ) (O

) . 209761.doc/T06/keg (continued)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= A — - R R

If Sl S S e

LOT {I - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE-
CORROSION INHIBITED

OPTION 2 - DELIVERED TO THE LOCATIONS
SPECIFIED BY THE AGENCY IN THE
SPECIFIED QUANTITIES IN CONJUNCTION
WITH A MINIMUM 200 TON PER HOUR PORT-
ABLE PUG MILL MIXING PLANT, WITH AN
ADJUSTABLE LIQUID FLOW CONTROLLER,
AND A QUALIFIED OPERATOR TRAINED BY
THE CONTRACTOR. THE PUG MILL WILL
HAVE A SPLIT HOPPER DESIGN SO THAT IT
MAY RECEIVE DIFFERENT BLENDS OF
AGGREGATE AND SALT TO PRODUCE A
HOMOGENOUS BLEND OF AGGREGATES,
SALT AND LIQUID AS DESIRED BY THE PUR-
CHASING AGENCY. THE PURCHASING
AGENCY WILL PROVIDE A MINIMUM OF
TWO LOADERS/OPERATORS TO ASSIST IN
THE MIXING PROCESS. FOR OPTIMAL
MIXING THREE LOADERS/OPERATORS WILL
SUBSTANTIALLY INCREASE DAILY PRODUC-
TION.

OGS OGS
ITEM ITEM
NO. ZONE NO.
23. 1 23.
24, 2 24,
Z5. 3 2s.
26. 4 26.
27. 5 27.
28. 6 28.
29, 7 29.
30. 8 30.
31 9 3L
32 10 32.
33. 11 33.
20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued)

C e hen s e

PRICE PER PRICE PER

GALLON  GALLON

4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE
MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
S_[J50  sehd) ameest e
5 /10 B0 GEE e
$ /00 LA M Lmn
s_0. 9% AL BAE clem
s 0,990 P AN L’ig/{:g:ﬂ LLei
5_/,090  wup B e
$ /.l iy e cieita
$ /.24 L) o2 o
$ /050 ol kﬁ»fﬁqiq CLEfn
s /300 Y G e
$ [ 3%‘ L hy ‘ﬁ?&ﬁ LI

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

> = = = D =D

Bidder

[ NS, T <

LOT H - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE-
CORROSION INHIBITED

OPTION 2 - DELIVERED TO THE LOCATIONS
SPECIFIED BY THE AGENCY IN THE
SPECIFIED QUANTITIES IN CONJUNCTION
WITH A MINIMUM 200 TON PER HOUR PORT-
ABLE PUG MILL MIXING PLANT, WITH AN
ADJUSTABLE LIQUID FLOW CONTROLLER,
AND A QUALIFIED OPERATOR TRAINED BY
THE CONTRACTOR. THE PUG MILL WILL
HAVE A SPLIT HOPPER DESIGN SO THATIT
MAY RECEIVE DIFFERENT BLENDS OF
AGGREGATE AND SALT TO PRODUCE A
HOMOGENOUS BLEND OF AGGREGATES,
SALT AND LIQUID AS DESIRED BY THE PUR-
CHASING AGENCY. THE PURCHASING
AGENCY WILL PROVIDE A MINIMUM OF
TWO LOADERS/OPERATORS TO ASSIST IN
THE MIXING PROCESS. FOR OPTIMAL
MIXING THREE LOADERS/OPERATORS WILL
SUBSTANTIALLY INCREASE DAILY PRODUC-

TION.

0GS 0GS
ITEM ITEM
NO. ZONE NO.
- . 23.
va. 5 24.
’s. 3 25.
26, 4 26.
- 5 27.
- 6 28.
29, 7 2.
10, g 30.
- 9 31
32. 10 32.
33. 1 33.

209761.doc/T06/keg (continued)
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PRICE PER PRICE PER

GALLON GALLON

4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE
MINIMUM  MINIMUM NAME COLOR

iy St o eoama——ott
e ——

ML e
$_ /05y 20 50 w7 Clom
$ LOXD L0 Dug) m.&@zﬁp sl
s 0.97C Al ” %*fow cLena
$_().%49¢ 180 IR cem
$ :nl(za.‘,, ’/) ? //le:;ﬂ Jubb /z&&;;/il,/l‘
$ /, 010 Milyi? @ {g‘ e
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$ /140 fihif mﬁ,‘"@“’ CLe A
$ .94 Mty >
$ [ X0 Yol
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX .
I1 l/}/) H 4'5‘ \7 R g" /(4/;.—

- -

LOT I - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE-
CORROSION INHIBITED

OPTION 2 - DELIVERED TO THE LOCATIONS
SPECIFIED BY THE AGENCY IN THE
SPECIFIED QUANTITIES IN CONJUNCTION
WITH A MINIMUM 200 TON PER HOUR PORT-
ABLE PUG MILL MIXING PLANT, WITH AN
ADJUSTABLE LIQUID FLOW CONTROLLER,
AND A QUALIFIED OPERATOR TRAINED BY
THE CONTRACTOR. THE PUG MILL WILL
HAVE A SPLIT HOPPER DESIGN SO THAT IT
MAY RECEIVE DIFFERENT BLENDS OF
AGGREGATE AND SALT TO PRODUCE A
HOMOGENOUS BLEND OF AGGREGATES,
SALT AND LIQUID AS DESIRED BY THE PUR-
CHASING AGENCY. THE PURCHASING B
AGENCY WILL PROVIDE A MINIMUM OF Reoec mierc
TWO LOADERS/OPERATORS TO ASSIST IN
THE MIXING PROCESS. FOR OPTIMAL
MIXING THREE LOADERS/OPERATORS WILL
SUBSTANTIALLY INCREASE DAILY PRODUC-

TION.
PRICE PER  PRICE PER
OGS OGS GALLON  GALLON
ITEM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE
NO. ZONE NO. MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
23. 1 3.8 [,J00 PRI 2?4{/: feue
2. 2 4. 8 LO70  awBd BES qiue
25. 3 25. $ [ oLO Lo i) fﬁ’“&i [Lue
26. 4 26. $ .99 210y Do neus
27. 5 27 $_ . 9%0 Nt e _peve
28. 6 28. $ f L0490 o o) //5475‘; Alue
29. 7 29. 8/, L60 My A f:“»“?, fevs
30. 8 0. S L/90  whtD  SAne g
31. 9 3. $ 0% Lo Netks
32. 10 32. 8 [0 MBI g
33. 1 33, $./. 240 Ao i) Bt

20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX T S e
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE New \{O( e D rmiuous === _,
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX i
@ o> = > D o \’%'CUL;LCA’S C\;D(D

. LOT III - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE
: WITH ORGANIC BASED PERFORMANCE _ p

LOT I - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE ENHANCER (OBPE) 106 R Goner
WITH ORGANIC BASED PERFORMANCE
ENHANCER (OBPE) OPTION 1 - DELIVERED
OPTION 1 - DELIVERED PRICE PER PRICE PER

OGS OGS GALLON  GALLON

OGS E'Z"ffo‘;“ 21;15501;?: ITEM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE
?T(,;ESM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL. PROD DYE NO. ZONE NO. MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
MINIMUM NAME COLOR ,
NO._ ZONE NO.. MINIMUM 45. 1 a5, s Lo / J2C /(’ciﬁfwy Sl
4. ! 45. % j 46. 2 46. 8 [, 020 [ JC Bl SAowe
46. 2 46, § 47. 3 471. 8 LGS YALD) Yaor s A
- ; a7 s . .. 4 8. 80,557 Lold gesloe proc.
Qb, Ay A Y]
48. 4 48 § ® 49. 5 49.  $ .%¢H 4.0 LChone  fagun
49. 5 49. $,_7/j—@ 50. 6 50. S p.GL7 LHO  KEfber  Agads
5. p 50. $ 51, 7 518 4,029 (250  i&lbae Sl
st 7 s1. s K 52. 8 5208 [ (IX L2 b Pidwn
sLOlp Vrdpusnd 2 leny/ ' 2 ot [l
52. 8 52. ‘sl < ﬁlf%&_r\ll\\/\&_m _Lﬂa_%ueM 53. 9 53. $ (.07 JJ6¢ LG [
53, § .09 Medkdound Ubl : Y o p
3. S v LS Bl Mebidnon 208 (lend 4. 10 sa. 8 L7 LYK e ok
. » 55' 5 L3 ® ;‘ 15 Mel\nownd 2.8, Cleox” 55. 11 ss. s /7Y /. 370 ELR iy, /gl
55. n T Tee— S ] If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
I submitting more than one offer, bidder should . make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
ERINGS PER
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFE DoER OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER Bl .
20976i.doc/T06/keg, (continued) 20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

- -5

Bidder

.Ic /3}?,(;{25 i‘ f/(/",

LOT Il - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE
WITH ORGANIC BASED PERFORMANCE
ENHANCER (OBPE)

OPTION 1 - DELIVERED

OGS OGS
ITEM ITEM
NO. ZONE NO.
45, 1 45.
46. 2 46.
47. 3 47.
48. 4 48.
49. 5 49,
50. 6 50.
51. 7 51
52. 8 52.
53. 9 53.
54. 10 54.
55. 1t 35.

If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.

20976i.doc/TO6/keg {continued)

mpee o

PRICE PER PRICE PER

GALLON GALLON

4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE

MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
0, 9610 [.01o  mite o™ Blew o
$2.9710 1410 i Bl
$2. Y050 [ 170 e -0 flowe
$0, 9571 V2 R 1 - R 1Y
$.0, 9850 L3¢ i < Hipuo
$0.9710 / A0 YL
$O0.9700 LAY e o dpadw
$/.062e 00 L oo
s0. 41ry  _Ljlo M
$ /o 1 M [ 230 Mg o7 Bpow?
$ / oL [.320 i Gl

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED Y % : : L .

OUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX T s La. |
o B B~ S~ N~ I~
LOT 11 - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE
WITH ORGANIC BASED PERFORMANCE
ENHANCER (OBPE ' , -

( ) Crcifen. pl hwo
OPTION 1 - DELIVERED

PRICE PER PRICE PER
0GS OGS GALLON  GALLON
ITEM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE
NO. ZONE NO. MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
: N , et
45. I 45, s 0.9 LO0  mign  Acce
46. 2 6. $_1.97 [0 AFEE pee
a7, 3 418 (0,44 [ 10 S g
a8, 4 48. 5./, 7 L.06o G g
49. 5 49. 8 .94 J, 030 Skl e
N oy [ YLTaRT
50. 6 50. 80,977 [ 240 GEEY s
51, 7 51 % 4, ‘]7 2 [ 20 Lf;gt;%;‘ Gide
R - AAQR

52. 8 52. 8 [, UL A e 280 /%mqtn% AL
< < P ; R Crd!
53. 9 53 $_ (.47 1110 ﬂ?im%?q AL
. P S, A LAt
54. 10 54, § / i 2:'/ [0 e e
55. 1 ss. s /0199 /340 SRR pus

If submitting more than one offer, bidder should
make copies of appropriate page and submit with bid
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER
OGS ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.

20976i.doc/TO6/keg

(continued)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
BE SURE YOU

PREPARING YOUR BID.

HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

2D R D D =

Bidder

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
BE SURE YOU

PREPARING YOUR BID.

HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= R D D 0D

Bidder

LOT I1I - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE
WITH ORGANIC BASED PERFORMANCE
ENHANCER (OBPE)

OPTION 2 - DELIVERED TO THE LOCATIONS
SPECIFIED BY THE AGENCY IN THE
SPECIFIED QUANTITIES IN CONJUNCTION
WITH A MINIMUM 200 TON PER HOUR PORT-
ABLE PUG MILL MIXING PLANT, WITH AN
ADJUSTABLE LIQUID FLOW CONTROLLER,
AND A QUALIFIED OPERATOR TRAINED BY
THE CONTRACTOR. THE PUG MILL WILL
HAVE A SPLIT HOPPER DESIGN SO THAT IT
MAY RECEIVE DIFFERENT BLENDS OF
AGGREGATE AND SALT TO PRODUCE A
HOMOGENOUS BLEND OF AGGREGATES,
SALT AND LIQUID AS DESIRED BY THE PUR-
CHASING AGENCY. THE PURCHASING
AGENCY WILL PROVIDE A MINIMUM OF
TWO LOADERS/OPERATORS TO ASSIST IN
THE MIXING PROCESS. FOR OPTIMAL
MIXING THREE LOADERS/OPERATORS WILL
SUBSTANTIALLY INCREASE DAILY PRODUC
TION.

OGS
ITEM

NO. ZONE

56.
57.
58.
59.
60.
61.
62.
63.
64.
65.
66.

O N R W~

[
—

20976i.doc/T06/keg

OGS
ITEM
NO.

PRICE PER
GALLON
4000 GAL
MINIMUM

j e

PRICE PER
GALLON
2000 GAL
MINIMUM

PROD
NAME

DYE
COLOR

56.
57.
58.
59.
60.
61.
62.
63.
64.
65.
66.

(continued)

$ 1Yo

A/{) '%: 19

$ /200

DO 6/ )

S L AR s ae

Moby

Mo e

54 ')%c\:
$/,27 ¢
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e -0 Adpu

$ /12«2,(}

vo bt

P L R Y NP2

to b

AV Ll

$ kit p
$_/i 2¢ 0

2080

$ jHl ©

K /55 47

Pt o S

$ /i 2(/’

g

MO AR i

$ /510

2500

T AAdar

PHe0 0 Aacuyes

$ /450

AL

PAN-O L L

LOT III - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE
WITH ORGANIC BASED PERFORMANCE
ENHANCER (OBPE)

OPTION 2 - DELIVERED TO THE LOCATIONS
SPECIFIED BY THE AGENCY IN THE
SPECIFIED QUANTITIES IN CONJUNCTION
WITH A MINIMUM 200 TON PER HOUR PORT-
ABLE PUG MILL MIXING PLANT, WITH AN
ADJUSTABLE LIQUID FLOW CONTROLLER,
AND A QUALIFIED OPERATOR TRAINED BY
THE CONTRACTOR. THE PUG MILL WILL
HAVE A SPLIT HOPPER DESIGN SO THAT IT
MAY RECEIVE DIFFERENT BLENDS OF
AGGREGATE AND SALT TO PRODUCE A
HOMOGENOUS BLEND OF AGGREGATES,
SALT AND LIQUID AS DESIRED BY THE PUR-
CHASING AGENCY. THE PURCHASING
AGENCY WILL PROVIDE A MINIMUM OF
TWO LOADERS/OPERATORS TO ASSIST IN
THE MIXING PROCESS. FOR OPTIMAL
MIXING THREE LOADERS/OPERATORS WILL
SUBSTANTIALLY INCREASE DAILY PRODUC-
TION.

oGS
ITEM

NO. ZONE

56.
57.
58.
59.
60.
61.
62,
63.
64.
65.
66.

WX N R W N e

—_— -
-

20976i.doc/T06/keg

OGS
ITEM
NO.

PRICE PER
GALLON
4000 GAL
MINIMUM

[Ce

PRICE PER

GALLON
2000 GAL
MINIMUM NAME COLOR

14
E; 6: onE

PROD

DYE

56.
57.
58.
59.
60.
61.
62,
63.
64.
65.
66.
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR PANY’S NAME IN THE BO T ,
ERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN X LM wl.S, ING
= =D D D D O
LOT Il - LIQUID MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE
WITH ORGANIC BASED PERFORMANCE
ENHANCER (OBPE)
OPTION 2 - DELIVERED TO THE LOCATIONS
SPECIFIED BY THE AGENCY IN THE
SPECIFIED QUANTITIES IN CONJUNCTION
WITH A MINIMUM 200 TON PER HOUR PORT-
ABLE PUG MILL MIXING PLANT, WITH AN
ADJUSTABLE LIQUID FLOW CONTROLLER,
AND A QUALIFIED OPERATOR TRAINED BY
THE CONTRACTOR. THE PUG MILL WILL
HAVE A SPLIT HOPPER DESIGN SO THAT IT
MAY RECEIVE DIFFERENT BLENDS OF
AGGREGATE AND SALT TO PRODUCE A
HOMOGENOUS BLEND OF AGGREGATES,
SALT AND LIQUID AS DESIRED BY THE PUR-
CHASING AGENCY. THE PURCHASING
AGENCY WILL PROVIDE A MINIMUM OF
TWO LOADERS/OPERATORS TO ASSIST IN
THE MIXING PROCESS. FOR OPTIMAL _
MIXING THREE LOADERS/OPERATORS WILL CHCGerL
SUBSTANTIALLY INCREASE DAILY PRODUCH M9 eet
TION.
PRICE PER  PRICE PER
OGS OGS GALLON GALLON
ITEM ITEM 4000 GAL 2000 GAL PROD DYE
NO. ZONE NO. MINIMUM MINIMUM NAME COLOR
Cpeviet 4.
56. 1 s6. s [, 2%0 A4 P A%l Quee
57 2 57 $ /240 Y eI
: By Do o
58. 3 58. 8 /200 165 ) Moo 3L
. & 3 -
59. 4 59.  $_L./¥0 A6 b /Q’Bif’cﬁ ALus
60. 5 60. $ /190 veBi)  FEalE  Gees
; B s P ‘r!
61. 6 61. $ /. 2%0 Mo fie? Z’L‘G{- e Peuvi
Yy . CALBen
62. 7 62. $_4 o0 o0 magee BidE
A Spc Gl B
63. 8 63. $ /410 20 6 migee s
; P &i’k 3 T
64, 9 6. $ [ 260 il HERE e
65. 10 65. $./,9/0 Mo e ol
] C Aol o
66. i 66. $.1950 U v T

20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder . PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE Cargill, Incorporated- INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX International Salt Co., LLC
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX Deicing Technology
N
= D D D D =
LOT 1V- TREATED SALT
LOT IV- TREATED SALT
' ) Item OGS Price/ Stockpile Product Type 1=CI
Item OGS Price/ Stockpile Product Type 1=CI N ) P yp
No. County Item  Unit Locations Name  Type 2=OBPE =0 County ltem Ién;t 34 Lxﬁzg)tlons N?me Bl"l(;ype —
57.01 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 78 Albany 78 $ : /T any ce one 2
78. Albany 78. $ /Ton ’ : on
45.86 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 No Bid
79. Allegany 79. $ /Ton & © 7. Allegany : 79. $ /Ton
: ) ' , 72.98 Pt.New. Ice B'Gone 2
20, Bronx, Kings, Queens, New York, Richmond 80, 7§.24 /Irgrrllsulg, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 80. Bronx, Kings, Queens, New York, Richmond 80. $ /Ton
gl Broome ol 4%.40 /Ifgr?Sing’ NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 81. Broome ’1. $NO B/’l%n
No Bid N/A N/A No Bid
82. Cattaraugus 82. $ /Ton / / N/A 82. Cattaraugus 82. $ /Ton
. No Bj
83. Chautauqua 83. Nﬂ? Blc}Ton N/A - N/A N/A 83. Chautauqua 83. $ /ll%n
45.34 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 g No Bid
84. Chenango 84. $ /Ton 84. Chenango 84. $ /Ton
No Bid N/A N/A N/A . No Bid
85. Clinton 85. $ /Ton 85. Clinton 85. $ /Ton
60.09 Lansing, NY ClearL h d dei 1 : 60.04 Albany Ice B'
86. Columbia 86. $ /Ton & ane enhance ercer 86. Columbia 26, $ /Ton Y Gone 2
50.13 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 No Bid
87. Delaware 87. $ on 87. Delaware 87. $ /Ton
. ing, NY Cl L nhanced deicer 1 . '
88. Dutchess 88 6§ 64 /IT%I?Slng eariane e 88. Dutchess 88. $65 65/T0n Albany Ice B'Gone 2
No Bid N/A N/A N/A .
89.  FEric 8. $ _ /Ton 89.  Erie go.  gvo Bid
63.77 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 72.07 '
90. Essex 90. $ /Ton 8 90. Essex 90. 3 /Ton Albany Ice B'Gone 2
i No Bid N/A N/A N/A No Bid
91.  Franklin 91.  °§ " "Ton 91.  Franklin oL s Ilon
9. Greene 9. 5?.41 /Irzglrlls:mg, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 9. Greene 0. $59'76/T0n Albany Ice B'Gone 2
) 58.57 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 No Bid
93. Hamilton 93. $ /Ton 93 Hamilton 93 $ Ton
) 49.47 Jansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 No Bid
94. Herkimer 94. Eg /IF on 94, Herkimer 94. 3 /Ton
If submitting more than one offer, bidder should make If submitting more than one offer, bidder should make
copies of appropriate page and submit with bid. copies of appropriate page and submit with bid.
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER OGS NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER OGS
. N
[TEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER. ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.

20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued) 209761 doc/T06/keg (continued)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

DD D D = =

Bidder

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

LOTIV- TREATED SALT

[tem

No.  County

78. Albany

79. Allegany

80. Bronx, Kings, Queens, New York, Richmond
81. Broome

82. Cattaraugus

83. Chautauqua

84. Chenango
85. Clinton

86. Columbia

87. Delaware
88. Dutchess
89. Erie

90. Essex
91. Franklin
92. Greene
93, Hamilton

94, Herkimer

If submitting more than one offer, bidder should make
copies of appropriate page and submit with bid.

NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER OGS
ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.

20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued)

0GS
Item

78.

79.

80.

81.

82.

83.

84.

85.

86.

87.

88.

89.

90.

91.

92.

93.

94.

Price/

Unit
$65.90
$ /Ton

$45.55
$ /Ton

Stockpile
Locations

Product Type 1=CI
Name

Type 2=0OBPE

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice B'Gone/2

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

$81.45
$ /Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

57.97
/Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

$49 Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

$53.63
$ /Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

61.64
/Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

77.96
/Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

$72.87
$ /Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

65.43
/Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

73.06
3 /Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

$47%on

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

$76.42
$ /Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

72.64
/Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

62.28
/Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

$65.38
$ /Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

62.73
/Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Ice

B'Gone/2
B'Gone/?2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2

B'Gone/2

GROUP.HHW—SNOWWCECONTROLAGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 38

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=D DD D D

Bidder

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

LOTIV- TREATED SALT

Item 0GS
No.  County Item
78. Albany 78.
79. Allegany 79.
80. Bronx, Kings, Queens, New York, Richmond 80.
81. Broome 81.
82. Cattaraugus 82.
83. Chautauqua 83.
84. éhenango 84.
85. Clinton 8s.
86. Columbia 86.
87. Delaware 87.
88. Dutchess 88.
89. Erie 89.
90. Essex 90.
91. Franklin 9l.
92. Greene 92.
93. Hamilton 93.
9. Herkimer 94,
If submitting more than one offer, bidder should make

copies of appropriate page and submit with bid.

NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OF FERINGS PER OGS

ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.

20976Ldocff0&keg (continued)

Price/ Stockpile  Product Type 1=CI
Unit Locations Name Type 2=0OBPE

ﬁ6l.%¥onHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic /]

é4l.§%onHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

f77.3%onHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

%53.3%0nHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

$45.75 Hampton Co .
$_/Ton _© 07 horners, NY/Blue Magic/1

g49.§¥onHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

§57.§%0nHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

§73.%?0nHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

§68.§%onHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

§61.6%0nHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

369.9?0nﬁampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

§43.%%onHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

$72.%%Onﬂampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

gGS.@%anampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

gSS.%% nHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1
o

361.%%0nHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

58.7%0nHampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1
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GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS PAGE 38
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX. - o

INSERTED YOUR ¢ P Envicanmentol UL
LOT 1V- TREATED SALT

Item OGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Type 1=CI
No.  County Item  Unit Locations Name  Type 2=OBPE
78. Albany 78. $3M .qq/'ron -4 - |

79.  Allegany 79, $405Ton _|-Y 1-Q |

80. Bronx, Kings, Queens, New York, Richmond 80. $39 % Ton -\ 1-Q \

81.  Broome 8. $423¥on _)-\ - |

82. Cattaraugus 82. $49.%%Ton -4 [ -Q |

83.  Chautauqua 8.  ${830%ron I-N {-Q |
84. Chenango 84. $ qq-a?ﬁon -4 |- ]

85.  Clinton 85.  $15%¥Ton _|-Y -Q |

86.  Columbia 86.  $lQ%0Ton (-4 -9 )

87. Delaware 87. $599Ton |- Y - l

88. Dutchess 83. $(0. 8V Ton -y [-Q \

89,  Erie 8.  $45i19ten -4 1= |
90. Essex 90. $1.%%1on  |-Y 1-Q |
91, Franklin o, s Pron |-4 (-9 |
92. Greene 92. $563Ton |-Y4 [-Q |
93 Hamilton 93.  $plo.\9Ton _|-Y -\
94. Herkimer 924. $5?>-qch" on _|-Y |- |
If submitting more than one offer, bidder should make SS‘QQKQ‘ le lecodions:
copies of appropriate page and submit with bid. L bouglond ' NY.
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER 0GS |2, LO-0S Q. N
ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER 3. BultaloTay.

4. O%demﬁbuﬁ%\ \\)

209761.doc/T06/keg

Froeduct Noame.:

(continued) | SUAP Tre o e

2D Meaclone Enhancoedt Deicer

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX J‘ /1 i A d). Yz
=D S DD D D =%
LOT IV- TREATED SALT Bl is MpeHe Soef
Item OGS Price/ Stockpile Product Type 1=CI
No.. County [tem Unit Locations Name  Type 2=0OBPE
X HImaiew g
78.  Albany 78.  $57.§Rlon wALERS AR fype
DO s %w_:f
79.  Allegany 79.  $39.5%Ton anuing by repe
' e o
80. Bronx, Kings, Queens, New York, Richmond 80. $7)s,0f}'l" on oS ’s”/a-(i(r TP d
e HBPIADY fouer 4
81. Broome 81. S‘/b, 2"%l'(m COANEE 5 Fvle i
oy ATt Beos
82. Cattaraugus 82. $ 4.4 Ton blals  Tace  Tipe |
y Hrmpave B
83. Chautauqua 83. $‘7'/.737/T0n conAg iy T f
) JRP R f’jg«;f:
84. Chenango 84, SHYAITon caalds  Some  T0E |
°e Blas
85.  Clinton 85.  $B.59Ton corms % rrird
L Heanope e
86.  Columbia 86.  $5193Ton cawers Liie  Tiped
‘ MR fve
87. Delaware 87. $52.04/Ton fpnwrns ot TIE(
/ey dae
88.  Dutchess 88.  $59.9%Ton [glss  Spcr WL
o AAmaETes fee”
89.  Erie 89.  $715¥Ton anters LY r
g /f/f,ﬂl/?,/ k] %};‘:’
90. Essex 90. $é[ Witon waves  “mr  TIPEY
,, [1amow e
91.  Franklin o1.  $3599%mon cawas TS Tl
o AR e
92.  Greene 92.  $I20Ton angns  TES rwe
Gy ?ﬁ;ft
93. Hamilton 93, $‘§7f.7éfl"on (o b/els Coer TR
, e N
94, Herkimer 94. $ ‘f‘I:L/}T on Avels ot AT

If submitting more than one offer, bidder should make
copies of appropriate page and submit with bid.

NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER OGS
ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.

20976i.doc/TO6/keg {continued)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX ﬂ o S/ m‘;’// -
= > = = = ‘
LOT IV- TREATED SALT Nite Séel
ftem OGS Price/ Stockpile Product Type 1=CI
No.. County Item  Unit Locations Name  Type 2=0BPE
HFEET N
78. Albany 78. $5~é~‘f}1‘on 2 ) & TE )
AR JHBEH v
79, Allegany 79. $41 45 Ton _coptits  grer  f WE 2
: O AT il
80. Bronx, Kings, Queens, New York, Richmond 80. $ &40 /Ton o3 gphd TYPE ).
i IHDEDY e ,
81. Broome 81. $99. 94/ Ton convets gyt TYE L
- Viri: 222 JigC
82. Cattaraugus 82. $'5.43Ton oty cpet TYHEL
. HIADD
83.  Chautauqua 83.  $954Ton (pwery  cper I L
PR ey
84. Chenango 84. $5L.91 /Ton ¢cotwe?s <l THPE L
’ ; Vi T
85.  Clinton 85. st Hiron cowes Gaer TP 2L
N Vi o 7YIBEL
86. Columbia 86. $ 6 9 /4 fron Lo Aets spet P
s JYHEC
87. Delaware 87. $5ledf/Ton Loltsoty sput  TWEL
FEG 2 2 Y 214
88. Dutchess 88. $(3.4 YTon conpsry Spet UL
. JAPTRe sl ;
89.  Erie 89.  $H.ChTon (oawens cpet T L
. JIAPAT L FHAg
90.  Essex 90.  $E5.70/Ton comyens spel TIWED
> ifdmrsw  snsesl
91. Franklin 91. ${5’ W/T on (Mg sa SHL TYHE)
‘ SIS g v
92. Greene 92. 55’2:”%# on gl cuet TWEZ
, Itndion jnpe
93. Hamilton 93. $jﬁ LTon w5 Cpet 7)///(7 9
4 A e
94. Herkimer 94. B F¥Ton coneds cmr THE L
If submitting more than one offer, bidder should make
copies of appropriate page and submit with bid.
NO MORE THAN 3 PRODUCT OFFERINGS PER OGS
ITEM # ARE PERMITTED PER BIDDER.

209761.doc/T06/keg (continued)
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GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS PAGE 39
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE Cargill, Incorporated - INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX International Salt Co., LLC
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX Deicing Technology e
oD D D D D
LOTI1V - TREATED SALT
LOTIV -TREATED SALT
Item OGS Price/ Stockpile  Product Type 1=CI
Item OGS Price/ Stockpile Product Type 1=CI No. County Item  Unit Locations Name  Type 2=0OBPE
No._ County Item Unit Locations Name Type 2=0BPE No Bid
54.66 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer | 95. Jefferson 95. $ /Ton
95. Jefferson 95. $ /Ton No Bid
) 54.60 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer | 96. Lewis . 96. $ /Ton
96. Lewis 96. $ /Ton No Bid
. i i 97. Madison 97. $ /Ton
97 Madison 97, ${+7 6()/T£.nezr181ng, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer } No Bid
. i i 98. Monroe 98. $ /Ton
93, Monroe 98, ${+7 33/T(I)JI<15ms:Lng, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer |
5 N 9 3;71.25/T Pt.New. ICe B'Gone 2
: ) assau .
99, Nassau 99. %\Io B]/‘ilon N/A N/A N/A Bi on
No Bid  N/A N/A  N/A 100.  Ni 100. °
100.  Niagara 100. §$ /Ton / lagara &{: B{’Son
) o Bi
. 4?.89 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 101. Oneida 101. $ /Ton
101. Oneida 101. /Ton No Bid
2.42 ing, i
102. Onondaga 102, 3? 4 /T%gns:mg NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 102. Onondaga 102. $NO Bé]d"on
103. Ontario 103. §3.43/T%gmsing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 103. Ontario 103. $ /Ton
: 72.79 Pt.New. Ice B'Gone 2
104, Orange 104. §6.60/T%51n81ng, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 104. Orange 104. $ /Ton
No Bid
105.  Oswego 105. §4-861lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 105.  Oswego 105.  $ /Ton
. . No Bid
106. Otsego 106. §9.38/Tlo.€ns1ng, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 106. Otsego 106. $ /Ton
- ) 69.30 Alban Ice B'Gone 2
107, Putnam 107, §4.20/T%€n51ng, NY ClearLane enhanced dedicer 1 107. Putnam 107. $ /Ton )4
. i i 7.85 !
108, Rensselacr 108, $52 64/T%§n81ng, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 108.  Rensselaer 108, g Ton Albany Ice B'Gone 2
] . , 67.47 Pt.New. lce B'Gone 2
109 Rockland 109, $67 42/T%§ms1ng, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 109. Rockland 109, $ /Ton
No Bid N/A N/A  N/A No Bid
110. St. Lawrence 110. $ /Ton 110. St. Lawrence 110. $ /Ton
54.36 I, ing, ; 59.21 Alban Ice B'Gone 2
” Saratoga 11 3 /Tgr?81ng NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 111 Saratoga 111 $ /Ton Y
52.50 Lansing, NY ClearLane h d dei 57.86 Alban lce B'Gone 2
112. Schenectady 112. § /Ton & enhance efcer 1 112. Schenectady 2. $ /Ton 4
52.76_Lansing, NY Cl L h i . !
113. Schoharie 113. $ /Ton 8 earlane emhanced deicer 1 113. Schoharie 113. go 70/T0n Albany Ice B'Gone 2
40.11 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced dei 1 No Bid
114.  Steuben 4. § Ton 8 e deteer 114.  Steuben 114. $ /Ton

209761.doc/T06/keg (continued) 20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= D D D

Bidder

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

LOT IV - TREATED SALT
Item

No.  County

9s. Jefferson

96. Lewis

97. Madison

98. Monroe

99. Nassau

100. Niagara

101. Oneida

102. Onondaga
103. Ontario

104. Orange

105. Oswego

106. Otsego

107. Putnam
108. Rensselaer
109. Rockland
110. St. Lawrence
1t Saratoga
112. Schenectady
113. Schoharie
114, Steuben

20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued)

OGS
Item

95.

96.

97.

98.

99.

100.

101.

102.

103.

104.

105.

106.

107.

108.

109.

110.

1L

112

113.

114.

Price/
Unit

$59.Q¥

Stockpile
Locations

Name

Product Type 1=CI
Type 2=0OBPE

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice

$6l 93
/Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$56 85

Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$“5 *Pon

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

79.56
$ /Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$49 61

Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$59.2P

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$53 86
/Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$45 76

Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

No Bid
3 /Ton

$53 51
/Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$$65'%%n

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

No Bid
$ /Ton

63.14
$ 3 /Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$69 45

Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

7.0
$$6 /%%n

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$68.51
$ /Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$61 15
/Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$65 90
/Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Ice

$46 61

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice
/Ton

B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2

B'Gone/2

B'Gone/2

B'Gone/2

B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2

B'Gone/2

GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 39

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=D D D D D

Bidder

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

LOT IV - TREATED SALT

[tem OGS
No.  County Item
9s5. Jefferson 9s.
96. Lewis 96.
97. Madison 97.
98. Monroe 98.
99. Nassau 99.
100. Niagara 100.
101. dneida 101.
102. Onondaga 102.
103. Ontario 103.
104. Orange 104
105. Oswego 105.
106. Otsego 106.
107. Putnam 107.
108. Rensselaer 108.
109. Rockland 109.
110. St. Lawrence 110.
1. Saratoga 111.
112, Schenectady 112,
113. Schoharie 113.
114. Steuben 114.

20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued)

Price/
Unit

$55 97
____/Ton

57.93
/Ton

Product

Stockpile

Locations

Hampton

Name

Corners,

Type 1=CI
Type 2=0BPE

NY/Blue

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

gSZ.SS

on

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

$4l 03
/Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

75.56
/Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

4% 6ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

$2° - Ron

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

49.86
/Ton

41. 76
___/Ton

§66°9%on

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

49.51

/Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

61.07
$ __/Ton

$71.05
on

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

Hampton

$59 14
__/Ton

§65 ¥0n
$63./

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

Corners,

NY/Blue

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

$64.51
$ /Ton

Hampton

Corners,

NY/Blue

57.15
/Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Blue

61.90
__/Ton

$42 61
/Ton

Hampton

Corners, NY/Blue

Hampton

Corners, NY/Blue

Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1
Magic/1

Magic/1

Magic/1
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

DD D D D

Bidder

f NS e

LOT IV - TREATED SALT
Item OGS
No.  County Item
95. Jetferson 95.
96. Lewis 96.
97. Madison 97.
98. Monroe 98.
99. Nassau 99.
100, Niagara 100.
101. Oneida 101.
102. Onondaga 102.
103. Ontario 103.
104. Orange 104.
105. Oswego 105.
106. Otsego 106.
107. Putnam 107.
108. Rensselaer 108.
109. Rockland 109.
110. St. Lawrence 110.
(R EN Saratoga 111
112. Schenectady 112,
113. Schoharie 113,
114. Steuben 114,

20976i.doc/TO6/keg

{continued)

Price/ Stockpile Product Type 1=Cl
Unit Locations Name  Type2=OBPE
Hippreo - Bees

L7 - o Al .
$4L93ron cianaas “Sar  T10E |
" rrores @w/g; ,
$5/, 99 Ton powaens ZRE TwE ¢

‘ Aan%Fc o ﬂ_{,ﬁ%z;

) (5 - h
$4Z: L2ron (e s et I ey
- Adros Guee
$%" 39/1" on _palickd /Z}gff FHE
. Homioior B o
$75.4Ton coppas “eay TV L

. P 2 Giu_’fa
$‘%f. f-}//l" on _(Ledyens Z’.;’f; Ty
o PFIYTD %”Ug; .
$'7%=7_3/T on (YRAVENY s Ty
Lo hr a2 ﬁcu‘:‘{
$H.20Ton ponymms CRE T
. 1Ty Beve
$4: % Ton comvan, oot (Y
y A1 Bl
sOATon convers s
. e Aees
$37.99ron cwneens /%Y{fr Iy
o timpgeo  Bees
$hil {rTon COAV Y AL IYor {
s FIRDID s (/Jﬂc;;‘é
$ é]ﬂf’l‘on LAV FY St Tyfe |
. Ha iy Bees
ol G nrtote
$51957Ton conwms apr Tl
, /15500 'Z""f
$3 26iTon conw2mg gg‘,ﬁ Y i
$55.¥Ton conmens Gt s
, TG
$5é-‘fﬁ/’l" on JUANEAS %ﬁ T8 (
o Ve 2o N
$5.Isiton Cutains  YRE 1k
. e Ao .
$ 0 on poanagy TEE T
- A Bers
$}f1,‘f“l7ron convins WY T

GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS PAGE 39
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX - - ;
INSERTE Tl des. e
= = =
LOT 1V - TREATED SALT
Item OGS Price/ Stockpile  Product Type 1=Cl
No. County Item  Unit Locations Name  Type 2=0BPE
) AR )
95, Jefferson 95.  $534¥Ton cuwwdds  Spr  TykE T
e TAMPRC gl
96.  Lewis 9.  $55 ¥ /Ton powers  gpet [ HE
[18me fprie-
97. Madison 97. $40. LhTon coadls  Shut THE ©
AP el
98. Monroe 98. $ . Xrton contets L THE 2
i Haurae g
99, Nassau 99, $ ’}3/: 0 /Ton oonddls chet TN %2
RN oo VA
100.  Niagara 100.  $43,49Ton oINS ?33‘ THe
3 Ve i S
101.  Oneida 1. $59¥3Ton agens /fM I¥ez
/ R N s A
102.  Onondaga 102.  $444%/Ton c‘;f;l:’l//?jﬂ,i <2’£r T2
AAIYTI VI
103.  Ontario 103, $9%3Ton calues Zf;or T
20 AARGY AL
104. Orange 104. $ AP /Ton colts SAE 7)//757/
. H AT M BN )
105.  Oswego 105.  $43 YTon (it it 7)%71
v Hagie e
106. Otsego 106. $5% (] /Ton (ol weds St TWE L
A8 Vst Ry e
107.  Putnam 107.  $ 30 Ton powers spr  THFEL
.. Vete A
108.  Rensselaer 108.  $§9.457Ton 0ot cpr TV
o0 ARATIY 1 toeid '
109.  Rockland 109. 840 /Ton (MWed smy  TYEL
TS iy
110. St Lawrence 110, $A4¥Ton oavsts mr  [We72
AT
[11.  Saratoga 1. $949%7Ton piwens  Zpct  TYEDL
L Hw8ron Al
112 Schenectady 112, $2545/Ton Ak gpt TYe7
. . pANGIe ST
113.  Schoharie 3. % Ton cwrvms  spr TWea
o AN e
114.  Steuben 114, sHB¥ron s ca) T

20976i.doc/T06/keg

{continued)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

Bidder

FOP Enviconmentol L0

e

LOT IV - TREATED SALT

Item OGS Price/ Stockpile Product Type 1=CI

No.  County Item  Unit Locations Name  Type 2=OBPE

95 Jefferson 95.  $59WTon _|-Y [~ \

9.  Lewis 9%.  $505Ton _ |4 |-Q |

97, Madison 9. s ¥Yrton (-4 [-Q {

98.  Monroe 98 $33%%Ton _ |-\ |-D \

99.  Nassau 99, $%VTon _|-Y - |

100.  Niagara 0o,  $9ron -4 -

101, Oneida o $49Wrn (-4 |- )

102 Onondaga 12, $43%Ton |-4 |- |

103.  Ontario 1. $&Hron |-Y |- |

104.  Orange 104.  $50.9%Ton | -4 |- |

105.  Oswego 105.  $45.%Ton \-4Y |- )

106.  Otsego 106, $52%on | -4 |-Q |

107.  Putnam 107 $@A%%on -4 Q)

108.  Rensselaer 108.  $55%%Ton _|-4 -9 \

109.  Rockland 109, s\ Pton -4 |- ]

110. St Lawrence 110.  $0%VTon |~Y4  1-Q )

111,  Saratoga L. $50%Ton |-\ -0 |

112, Schenectady 12 $55QTon -\ \-9 |

113, Schoharie 13 $3NTen |- -5 )

114, Steuben 4. $0.%9Ton _|-4 |- |
Stockpile locotiong _
Ludoogond NY. 20 Bullale WY,

209761.doc/T06/keg

(continued)

2. Lcmsi.f\%, NY.

Preduct Name.
LSRR Treoded
) {\ \Dr\r‘\r\ NE Eel VN | i\.’)ﬂ“ ne

Y. C)%d@/ﬁfsmr%, [\




GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS PAGE 40
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GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS PAGE 40
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder . PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE Cargill, Incorporated- INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX International Salt Co., LLC
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX Deicing Technology = o o = o> =
D DD D
LOTIV - TREATED SALT
LOTIV -TREATED SALT
. ‘ Item OGS Price/ Stockpile  Product Type 1=Cl
Item OGS Price/ Stockpile  Product Type 1=CI No. County ftem  Unit Locations Name  Type 2=OBPE
No.  County Item  Unit Locations Name  Type 2=OBPE 75.16 Pt.New. Ice B'Gone 2
No Bid Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 115. Suffolk 115. $ /Ton
115. Suffolk 115. $ /Ton No Bid
54.05 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 116. Sullivan 116. $ /Ton
116. Sullivan 116. $ /Ton .
; 63.67 '
57.12 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 117. Ulster 117. $ /Ton Albany Ice B'Gone 2
117. Ulster 117. $ /Ton ,
: 63.94 Alban Ice B'Gone 2
59.74 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 118. Warren 118. $ /Ton 4
118.  Warren 118. $____ /Ton 62.88 Alba Ice B'G 2
. . n
) 57.59 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer t 119.  Washington 119.  § /Ton y [lce one
119.  Washington 119. % /Ton No Bid
i : 120. W .
120. Wayne 120. $41.8;/'Tolﬁar131ng, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer \ ayne 120 56 uG/Ton s :
69.77 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer | 121.  Westchester 121, $ ° /Ton t.New. Ice B'Gone 2
121. Westchester 121. 3 /Ton
8.75 I ing, . o Bi
122, Cayuga & Seneca 123, $3 ;Tonansnlg NY ClearLane enhanced deicer |\ 122. Cayuga & Seneca 122. §‘ ./'-lion
41.86 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 123 Chemung & Tioga 123 ?0 BI/?‘on
123. Chemung & Tioga 123. 5 /Ton . . NPT
i
42.45 Lansin NY ClearLane enhanced deicer 1 i
124.  Cortland & Tompkins 124, 5 "7 /Ton B 124. Cortland & Tompkins 124 go 58/T°n Alb e B'G
. . any Ice one 2
21.58 Lansing, NY Cl L i
125. Fulton & Montgomery 125. $ /Ton sing earlane enhanced deicer | 125. Fulton & Montgomery 125. $ /Ton
No Bid N/A N/A N/A No Bid
126.  Genesee & Orleans 126. $ /Ton 126.  Genesee & Orleans 126. Ii B./gon
. . o I
42.00 Lansing, NY ClearLane enhanced deicer
127. Schuyler & Yates 127. % /Ton 8 { 127. Schuyler & Yates 127. $ /Ton
No Bid N/A N/A N/A o ' No Bid
128. Livingston & Wyoming 128. % /Ton 128. Livingston & Wyoming 128. $ /Ton
S Mix C . ‘ L . .
State Mix Method As Required by Specification Item: crew M honveyor State Mix Method As Required by Specification Item: pug mill and/or stacking conveyor
Name of Refinery: Cargill Salt Name of Refinery: Sociedad Punta de Lobos
Location of Refinery: Lansing, NY Location ofReﬁnery: Port of Patillos, Chile
Location of Mine: Lansing, NY Location of Mine: Port of Patillos, Chile

20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued) 20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued)




GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS
(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 40

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

™D DD D D

Bidder

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

LOT IV - TREATED SALT

[tem

No.  County
115. Suffolk
116. Sullivan
117. Ulster
118. Warren

119. Washington

120. Wayne

121. Westchester

122. Cayuga & Seneca
123, Chemung & Tioga
124. Cortland & Tompkins

125. Fulton & Montgomery

126. Genesee & Orleans
127. Schuyler & Yates

128. Livingston & Wyoming

State Mix Method As Required by Specification Item:
Name of Refinery:
Location of Refinery:

Location of Mine:

20976i.doc/T06/keg (continued)

OGS
Item

15,
116.
117.
118.
119.
120.
121.
122.
123.
124.

125.

126.
127.

128.

Product Type 1=CI
Name Type 2=0BPE

Price/ Stockpile
Unit Locations

$83.?4 Hampton Corners, NY/Ice
$ Ton

59.47
$$

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice
/Ton

64.73
$$ /

Ton

.1
$$65 /TZ)n

$71.66
$ /Ton

$47.95
$ /Ton

$69.45
$ /Ton

$54.65
b /Ton

$54.31
$ /Ton

$57.70
/Ton

$61.16
$ /Ton

$46.54
$ /Ton

$48.20
$ /Ton

44.69
$$

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice

Hampton Cormers, NY/Ice

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice

Hampton Corners, NY/Ice
/Ton

Conveyor Spravying

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

Hampton Corners, NY

Hampton Cornmers, NY

B'Gone/?2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/?2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/?2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2
B'Gone/2

B'Gone/2

GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 40

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID.

=D D D D D

BE SURE YOU
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

HAVE

Bidder

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

LOT 1Y - TREATED SALT

Item
No.

115.
116.
117.
118.
119.
120.
121.
122
123.
124.

125.

126.
127.

128.

County

Suffolk

Sullivan

Ulster

Warren

Washington

Wayne

Westchester

Cayuga & Seneca
Chemung & Tioga
Cortland & Tompkins

Fulton & Montgomery

Genesee & Orleans
Schuyler & Yates

Livingston & Wyoming

20976i.doc/T06/keg

State Mix Method As Required by Specification Item:

Name of Refinery:
Location of Refinery:

Location of Mine:

(continued)

OGS
Item

115.

116,

117.

118.

119.

120.

121.

122.

123.

124.

125.

126.

127.

128.

Price/
Unit

%79 ) 3/%“on

Product
Name

Stockpile
Locations

Type 1=CI
Type 2=OBPE

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

3?55 ) 4/’7I'on

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

$6O ) 7/%"011

Hampton Cormers, NY/Blue Magic/1

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

%61 .13
/Ton
6

g & 6/61"on

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

43.95
/Ton

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

%65 ) 4/5F0n

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

$50.65
$ /Ton

Hampton Cormers, NY/Blue Magic/1

%50 ) 3}Ton

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

53.70
/Ton

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

57.15
/Ton

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

42.54
/Ton

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

44.20
/Ton

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

40.69
/Ton

Hampton Corners, NY/Blue Magic/1

Conveyor Spraying

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

Hampton Corners, NY

Hampton Corners, NY




GROUP 32100 -SNO
(Al State Agencies and P

W/ICE CONTROL AG ENTS
olitical Subdivisions)

PAGE 40

PLEASE USE BLACK INK O

PREPARING YOUR BID.

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’

=:=5===::

R TYPEWRITER WHEN
BE SURE YOU HAVE

§ NAME IN THE BOX

Bidder

14 M5 WA

LOT IV - TREATED SALT

Item
No.

115.
116.
117.
118.
119.

120.

121

122.

123.

124.

125.

126.

127.

128,

Counl

Suffolk

Sullivan

Ulster

Warren
Washington
Wayne
Westchester
Cayuga & Seneca
Chemung & Tioga
Cortland & Tompkins

Fulton & Montgomery

Genesee & Orleans
Schuyler & Yates

Livingston & Wyoming

State Mix Method As Required by Specification Item:

209761.doc/T06/keg

OGS
Item

115.
116.
117.
118.
119.
120.
121.
122,
123.
124.

125.

128.

Name of Refinery:

Location of Refinery:

Price/ Stockpile Product
Unit Locations Ngme
 HmpEe E

§7L43Ton o> GAT
Hrppdios  feoc

$47.957Ton (oMLY e
Haor  BLes

$54.y/Ton _COAUELS g

Y e

‘ S AvE
Sf’qﬂiﬂ' on (OGS /5’» ’,?f;‘
[HvaAGe /6/7&/%:; '

$3 )49/ Ton JoUlS oas
PN Vi il Beoe
$4 J5UTon COMICS A
\ Jangroe 807,

$4050Ton _coui/vls e
. Sals  Beel
sH Prron _anLees rand
N [HARPTIC ,3;;5‘
$'7l‘ﬂ/}ron COAAIAS el

) P HANTEL  BLF
g,;%’g%/'r on cgWelb ﬁ?ﬁ’?’g‘,’[

ammor ECE

$3Z OiTon cfWihs sl

AmPRY  BLE

$%4‘fﬁlon LANVETS '7;’“2 0
af e i AR A
$¥ .55 mon oS o

conv Vel ) SPUT

Type 1=Cl
Type 2=0OBPE

e
[Yeet

e T

1,3) cNACHA JROCH Gpe b

_peieiy et 2l

S DT coaLens MY
e et T

Location of Mine: JFAMP VY Loy s AN

(continued)

vy corgdn Ll

GROUP 32160 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 40

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=y =3 = =D D O

o

T, S5 F#

LOT IV - TREATED SALT

Item
No.. Coun
115. Suffolk

116. Sullivan

117. Ulster

118. Warren

119. Washington

120. Wayne

121. Westchester

122. Cayuga & Seneca
123. Chemung & Tioga
124. Cortland & Tompkins

125. Fulton & Montgomery

126. Genesee & Orleans
127. Schuyler & Yates

128. Livingston & Wyoming

State Mix Method As Required by Specification ltem:
Name of Refinery:
Location of Refinery:

Location of Mine:

20976i.doc/TO6/keg {continued)

OGS Price/ Stockpile Product Type 1=Cl

Item Unit Locations Name  Type 2=0BPE
o Hameov
115.  $4.p /Ton Lopdls e lagfrr/’ 1 TV
AmOe  IAC

116, $elu4esTTon cohell  SHLT _TnE?
, HAiRe A
117, Sﬁ%‘_!ﬁff on _ oAU Sifet” /Wﬁ 7
) HAmbor G g
118, $40.L66Ton convas ot T
, AP W -
119. S_Q-f{_{/_fl‘on ("&Zﬂgg m% 1 Ty
AT JHHEL
120 $4/49/Ton wa% gpet T it
vo Himprse  macie ~ .
121, § 8.0 /Ton Loy Sret ez
N itaaps  MpEic
122. $‘]¢l}lémon CRAIERS Si-}éf [} Z% 7z
s Heppior MAG .
123, s Trron colems _sret YL
Hamirov /PAGHC i
124, $49.4FTon s 594t e
o HRmORe VUi "
s, $504FTon corvas St _THEL
o Hanera)  mnet
126, $40.501Ton LA spor” T
v ; gl 1D
7. $31.9¥Ton cowas  spet 1NN
A

7L
128. wévg/lon oAV mﬁﬂ& 7 I~

(o 10 VBN SPART
Laenicer Lock Spet

} oy conwals MV

s




GROUP 32100 - SNOW/ICE CONTROL AGENTS

(All State Agencies and Political Subdivisions)

PAGE 40

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
BE SURE YOU HAVE

PREPARING YOUR BID.

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= D D D D

Bidder

P Eaviconmentral WL

LOT IV - TREATED SALT

Item
No._

115.
116.
117.
118
119.
120.
121.
122,
123.
124.

125,

126.
127.

128

County

Suffolk

Sullivan

Ulster

Warren
Washington
Wayne
Westchester
Cayuga & Seneca
Chemung & Tioga
Cortland & Tompkins

Fulton & Montgomery

Genesee & Orleans
Schuyler & Yates

Livingston & Wyoming

State Mix Method As Required by Specification Item:

209761.doc/T06/keg

Name of Refinery:
Location of Refinery:

Location of Mine:

(continued)

Produet Norae.

b SLP Treoted
@ Uearlone Enhanced Deiter
OGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Type 1=CI
Item  Unit Locations Name  Type 2=OBPE
115, $90.9YTon {4 -2 |
116, $538VTon _\-4) |- |
117 $5999Ton _|-4  |-9 |
118, $41.9Ton |-Y 19 \
119 L1 %STen -4 |- |
120 $492%%Ton | -4 I-Q |
121 $%0./%Ton -4 -3 )
122, $409VTon _|-Y -Q ]
123, s4iQVron | -Y [~ l
124 $40%Ton |- (-2 |
125, $53WTon |- |- |\
126, sy Y9Ton (-4 = |-Q |
127, s4plTon | =Y - i
128.  $3).8VTon | -4 -9 |

S0 e /P\xo

O
SLDP/QQLP%\\\

wo sland 1\ /\oms'mn N/ authlo /0 (EJ’\Sbuu‘(
dood ot lansingg e foutole oot

stecpile oeotions :
FUN!

a. Lﬁns\f\% NY,

O Mactis N/ 1ans) OGS [Cedecieh Ontario -

Conad ol

ond | NY, 3, Bullole N9
Y. D%Xansbu%, N



