Bid Opening Results For:

IFB NUMBER 20940
BID OPENING 7/24/2007
GROUP NUMBER 32100

PURCHASING OFFICER  Karol Garrison

TELEPHONE (518) 486-1564

DESCRIPTION

Treated Salt
(DOT and Others)




GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT
(DOT & OTHERS)

PAGE 34

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=R D D D

Bidder

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

/1

/1

/1

/1

/1

/1

/1

/1

/1

/1

/1

/1

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM.
Filed Finished Specify

OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Type
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name 10R2
Albany 1 12,000 1 $58.90 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue /1
Optional la la $ /Ton
Allegany 2 1,600 2 $38.55 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 2a 2a 3 /Ton
Broome 3 250 3 $50.97 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 3a 3a $ /Ton
Cattaraugus 4 650 4 $42.75 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 4a 4a $ /Ton
Cayuga 5 2,500 5 $47.65 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional Sa 5a $ /Ton
Chautauqua 6 1,000 6 $46.63 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 6a 6a $ /Ton
Chemung 7 900 7 $45.39 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional Ta 7a $ /Ton
Clinton 8 200 8 $70.96 /Ton Hampton Cormers, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 8a 8a $ /Ton
Columbia 9 200 9 $65.87 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 9a 9a § /Ton
Cortland 10 1,500 10 $50.70/Ton  Hampton Cornmers, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 10a 10a § /Ton
Dutchess 1 2,800 1 $66.06/Ton  Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional lla lla  § /Ton
Essex 12 4,000 12 $69.42/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 12a 12§ /Ton
Franklin 13 500 13 $65.64/Ton  Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 13a 132§ /Ton
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

DD D D D

Bidder

k

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM.

Filed Finished Specify

oGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type

County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color 10R2
Albany 1 12,000 1 $62.90/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional la la $ /Ton
Allegany 2 1,600 2 $42.55/Ton  Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 2a 2a $ __/Ton
Broome 3 250 3 $54.97/Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 3a 3a $ /Ton
Cattaraugus 4 650 4 $46.75/Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 4a 4a $  /Ton
Cayuga 5 2,500 5 $51.65/Ton _Hampton Cornmers, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional Sa Sa $ /Ton
Chautauqua 6 1,000 6 $50.63/Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 6a 6a $ /Ton
Chemung 7 900 7 $49.39/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 7a 7a $ /Ton
Clinton 8 200 8 $74.96/Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 8a 8a $ /Ton
Columbia 9 200 9 $69.87/Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 9a 9a $ __/Ton
Cortland 10 1,500 10 $54.70/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 10a 10a §  /Ton
Dutchess 11 2,800 11 $70.06/Ton  Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional Ila Illa §_ ~ /Ton )
Essex 12 4,000 12 $73.42/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 12a 12§ /Ton o o
Franklin i3 500 13 $69.64/Ton  Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 13a 132§ /Ton N - 3
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=D D D D =

Bidder
Cargill, Incorporated-

Deicing Technology

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)

ITEM.
Filed Finished Specify
OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color 10R2
ClearLandYenhanced
Albany 1 12,000 1 $57.43 /Ton Lansing deicer green 1
Optional la la gNo Bidrg, N/A N/A N/A N/A
Allegany 2 1,600 2 $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A
Optional 2a 2a $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A
learL h
Broome 3 250 3 $42.93 /Ton Lansing gegggran gr%g%ed 1
Optional 3a 3a $No Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
Cattaraugus 4 650 4 $No Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
Optional 4a 4a $No Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
] ClearLaneYenhanced
Cayuga 5 2,500 5 $39.77 /Ton Lansing deicer green 1
Optional 5a 5a $No Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
Chautauqua 6 1,000 6 $No Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
Optional 6a 6a $No Bid/Ton N/A N/A 2 N/A N/A
C
Chemung 7 900 7 $41.88 /Ton Lansing cligiggim eg?éQSEd 1
Optional 7a 7a $No BidTon  N/A N/A N/A N/A
Clinton 8 200 8 $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A
Optional 8a 8a WNo Bid/Ton __N/A N/A AR N/A
‘ ﬁa Sing LearLane nhanced
Columbia 9 200 9 $60.09 /Ton son eicer en 1
LB
Optional 9a 9a $No BidTon N/A N/A ® N/A N/A
Cortland 10 1500 |10 $39.89/Ton Lansing CqSifkgnecephanced
Optional 10a 10a  $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A 1
Lans ing ClearLane@enhanced
Dutchess 11 2,800 11 $62.86 /Ton Hudson deicer green 1
- Broomingburg
Optional lla Ila  $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A
. ClearLan nhanced
Essex 12 4,000 12 $61.90/Ton  Lansing deicer green 1
Optional 12a 12a $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A
Franklin 13 500 13 $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A
Optional 13a 132 $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A

20940i.doc/T06/keg (continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

> I DD D I

Bidder

Imu.s, Twe

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM.
Filed Finished Specify
OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type
County Item # ment Htem # Unit Location Name Color 10R2
. o HamPriw  Bid . »
Albany 1 12,000 1 Y ﬁiﬁﬁ on  Conels A E Shed e e {
Optional la . la $%%. 4 3/Ton 'é ﬂ/{’fﬁiﬁ A Shet B oeon i
‘ o NPro Lear .
Allegany 2 1600 |2 S yITon edeees Bt spe _BLud :
Optional 2a . 2a 54 l‘(‘i 3 /Ton »gt‘T‘\ ﬁma ﬂép‘:&ﬁr&v AL 5HE Ao -
- Hameror Lo s i
Broome 3 250 3 $445.4% /Ton  porwens MpgacSnet ’3""""
grY- )
Optional  3a 32 $Y9H3Ton b Mapesad _Grews E
o ¢4/ A 056 o , .
Cattaraugus 4 650 4 $ 4,93 rTon gm.«,ag;) %].:}Jéﬁb St BLve i
Optional 4a 4a $44 473 /Ton  ppmeny 7 sci Basov
) ] N HAmpree b P {
Cayuga 5 2,500 5 S SO ITon [ pnwens A C S Bl
o . H AmPTe 7
Optional 5a 5a 4t 0 Ton ety AL St Browv
] A BlihF . i
Chautauqua 6 1,000 6 $ fﬂ,ﬁjﬁﬂ“ on (OLAserS R St 8Lv’f’7
. . S 8% kd
Optional 6a ba S5 4 3 /Ton (LW hAge Srbet oo 1.
Chemung 7 900 7 $ 3‘5 43 Ton  onue's g U"(_, e St ﬂ LUC {
. . Ao
Optional Ta 7a $H.93 /Ton  coppets R jHed Brows -
' 9
Clinton 8 200 |8 $4b.$3 /ron AR WES sk Bl l
Optional 8a 8a  $70:33/Ton  NMIES  pagwspe  Broer L
. . s HAMPTEN A v ;
Columbia 9 200 9 $5%:43 /Ton a%yckﬁ [?}4?»;{, okt AL i
X . it W .
Optional 9a 9a $é}ﬁ3 Ton bl STt f o z
i ) t%ﬁﬂl o ' .
Cortland 10 1,500 10 $45.43 /Ton LUA,@@;S ng%i.wu B !
N 7 aree
Optional 10a 10a  $44,43/Ton Lm’"yM AL SHd Bl L
st Lo o :
Dutchess 1 2,800 1 $59.93 /Ton _conuats  midse sl BLUS {
: . R
Optional lla lia SQ%‘-}? /Ton C oA BN IRA A Bl g 7
. " (rAnr o L ,
Essex 12 4,000 12 $6 I &) /Ton I,_;o{uwﬁ; ,gm“ St T {
N / - / 3.9
Optional 12a 12a  $¢458 /Ton ﬁ:ﬁ:«g&; Al Shef B 2-
P Hamiony s _
Franklin 13 500 13 $59. $3 rTon ‘(T/VW ,fé:,;o-u, N Za B !
;o Jné}/nmw o B
Optional 13a 13a $& 143 /Ton !Lu darh g BRI Haou~ 2-
209401.doc/T06/keg {continued)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

PREPARING YOUR BID.

BE SURE YOU HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

T R S

Bidder

SWP Environmental LLC.

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

PREPARING YOUR BID.

BE SURE YOU HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=R D D =

Bidder

INTERNATIONAL SALT COMPANY, LLC

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE Stockpile Locations: Product Names:
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG- l.Wayland, NY. 1. SWP Treated
NESIUM CHLORIDE 2. Lansing, NY. 2. Clearlane Enhanced
gg%ﬁgkmgggﬁz?ﬁM 3. Buffalo, NY. Deicer
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (2) 4. Ogdensburg, NY.
ITEM.
Filed Finished Specify

OGS Require- OGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type
County Item # ment  |ltem# Unit Location Name Color 10R2
Albany 1 12,000 1 $48.88Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional la la $ NB /Ton
Allegany 2 1,600 2 $38.80QTon 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 2a 2a $ NB /Ton
‘Broome 3 250 3 $40.8YTon 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 3a 3a $ NB /Ton
Cattaraugus 4 650 4 $42.83Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 4a 4a $ NB /Ton
Cayuga 5 2,500 5 $39.47¥Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional Sa 5a $§ NB /Ton
Chautauqua 6 1,000 6 $48. 3@Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 6a 6a $ NB /Ton
Chemung 7 900 7 $38.9¥Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 7a 7a $ NB /Ton
Clinton 8 200 8 $65.8%on 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 8a 8a $ NB /Ton
Columbia 9 200 9 $58.7¥0on 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 9a 9a $ NB /Ton
Cortland 10 1,500 10 $46.90ron 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 10a 10a  $ NB /Ton
Dutchess 11 2,800 11 $.58.8%0n 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 1la 1la  $__NB /Ton
Essex 12 4,000 12 $ 70.91Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 12a 122§ NB /Ton
Franklin 13 500 13 $ 65.8%0on 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 13a 13§ NB /Ton
209401.doc/T06/keg {continued)

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF

OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,

PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)

ITEM. |

Filed Finished Specify
OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type

County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color 10R2
Albany 1 12,000 1 $ 57.78 1o, Albany,NY Ice B'Gone Brown Type II
Optional la ‘ la $ No Bidron

Allegany 2 1,600 2 $ No BidTlon

Optional 2a ' 2a  $No Bidlon

Broome 3 250 3 $ NoBid /Ton

Optional 3a 3a $ No Bidlon

Cattaraugus 4 650 4 $ No Bidlon

Optional 4a 4a $ No BIdIon

Cayuga 5 2,500 5 $ No Bidlon

Optional 5a Sa $ No BidTon

Chautauqua 6 1,000 6 $ No BidTon

Optional 6a 6a $ No BidTlon

Chemung 7 900 7 $ No BidTon

Optional 7a Ta $ No BidTon

Clinton 8 200 8 $ No BidTlon

Optional 8a 8a $ No BidTon

Columbia 9 200 9 $61.30/Ton Albany,NY Ice B'Gone Brown Type IT
Optional 9a 9a $No BidTon

Cortland 10 1,500 10 $ No BidTon

Optional 10a 10a  $No BidTon

Dutchess 11 2,800 11 $68.20/Ton Albany,NY Ice B'Gone Brown Type IT
Optional 1la Ila  $No BidTon

Essex 12 4,000 12 $72.07 /Ton Albany,NY Ice B'Gone Brown Type IT
Optional 12a 122 $No BidTon

Franklin 13 500 13 $ No BidTon

Optional 13a 132 §No BidTon

209401.doc/T06/keg (continued)
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(DOT & OTHERS)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
e

e

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM.
Filed Finished Specify

OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color 10R2
Genesee 14 1,200 14 $37.00/Ton  Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 14a 14a $ /Ton
Herkimer 15 4,500 15 $55.73/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 15a 152 § /Ton
Jefferson 16 3,500 16 $52.97 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 16a 16a $ /Ton
Lewis 17 200 17 $54.93/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 17a 172§ /Ton
Livingston 18 3,000 18 $36.24 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 18a 18 $_ /Ton
Madison 19 3,155 19 $49.85/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 19a 19a $ /Ton
Monroe 20 5,000 20 $38.03 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 20a 20§ /Ton
Nassau 21 1,500 21 $72.56 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 2la 2la % /Ton
Niagara 22 1,200 22 $42.61 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 22a 22a  §_ /Ton
Oneida 23 7,495 23 $52.90/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 23a 23a §_ /Ton
Onondaga 24 8,000 24 $46.86 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 24a 24§ /Ton
Ontario 25 500 25 $38.76 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 25a 25a  $ /Ton
Orange 26 500 26 $63.97 /Ton  Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 26a 26a  § /Ton B N

209401i.doc/T06/keg (continued)
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PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

R DD D

Bidder

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

o

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM.

Filed

oGs Require- JOGS  Price/

County Item # ment Item # Unit
Genesee 14 + 1,200 14 $41.00 /Ton
Optional 14a ' l4a  § /Ton
Herkimer 15 4,500 15 $59.73/Ton
Optional 15a 15a  § /Ton
Jefferson 16 3,500 16 $56.97 /Ton
Optional l6a lea $ /Ton
Lewis 17 200 17 $58.93/Ton
Optional 17a 172§ /Ton
Livingston 18 3,000 18 $40.24 /Ton
Optional 18a 188 $§  /Ton
Madison 19 3,155 19 $53.85/Ton
Optional 19a 19a § __/Ton
Monroe 20 5,000 20 $42.03/Ton
Optional 20a 20a  § __[Ton
Nassau 21 1,500 21 $76.56/Ton
Optional 2la 2la  § /Ton
Niagara 22 1,200 22 $46.61/Ton
Optional 22a 22a  § /Ton
Oneida 23 7,495 23 $56.90/Ton
Optional 23a 2322 $  /Ton
Onondaga 24 8,000 24 $50.86/Ton
Optional 24a 24 $  /Ton
Ontario 25 500 25 $42.76/Ton
Optional 25a 252§ JTon
Orange 26 500 26 $ No Bidlon
Optional 26a 26 $  /Ton

209401.doc/T06/keg (continued)

Stockpile
Location

Finished
Product
Name

Hampton Corners,

Specify
Salt Type

Color

NY /Ice B'Gone

10R2

/Brown /2

Hampton

Corners,

NY /Ice B'Gone

/Brown

Hampton

Corners,

NY /Ice B'Gone

/Brown

Hampton

Corners,

NY /Ice B'Gone

/Brown

Hampton

Corners,

NY /Ice B'Gone

/Brown

Hampton

Corners,

NY /Ice B'Gone

/Brown

Hampton

Corners,

NY /Ice B'Gone

/Brown

Hampton

Corners,

NY /Ice B'Gone

/Brown

Hampton

Corners,

NY /Ice B'Gone

/Brown

Hampton

Corners,

NY /Ice B'Gone

/Brown

Hampton

Corners,

NY /Ice B'Gone

/Brown

Hampton

Cormners,

NY /Ice B'Gone

/Brown
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GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT PAGE 35 .
(DOT & OTHERS) (DOT & OTHERS)
r : PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder Careill. In cede PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE )
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE N rgill, corporate INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX f, modeS, 1 we
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX eicing Technology = o oo o= o =
=D D DD D D
GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE zggﬁlﬁgmgglgﬂgnm MAG
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG- - 2
NESIUM CHLORIDE gﬂﬁﬂgglgz ;Nggﬁrmn. iF
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF P:E“AE SE COMPLETEG;‘;EL ITEM,
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM, ITEM (=)
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a) ' Filed o
ITEM. OGS Reaui S Prices Finished Specify
. - . ] & equire- E‘; 5 rice, Stockpile Product Sajt Type
Filed Finished Specify Couaty tom # t
OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type ltem # ment Unit mﬁﬁmd Name Color 1OR2
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color 10R2 Genesee 14 1,200 14 53@ i - f BT = ’ s
S 3,43 /Ton  popmiens ML et Be v §
Iptions . AAITE
Genesee 14 1,200 14 $No Bidron N/A N/A N/A N/A COptional H4a 14a  $47 43/Ton izﬂ(?b‘;‘; magre et hHa o T
, Herkimer 15 4.500 is itampros Bee s
Optional 14a 142 $No Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A ’ (LRI Pb g pded SHRA _beee t
C erttiariced Opuonal {Sa 15a ltﬁ;{” A H i Z
Herkimer 15 4,500 15 $47.05 /Ton  Lansing deicer green 1 Lot o S Py r?-’llig?)?_‘_ [
efferson 3.500 16 il B 8¢t
Optional 15a 152 o Bid/Ton N/A N o e CEALAS ;"%

P bb&%‘éﬂé@&[ﬁ%@éﬁ" —N/A Uptional 16a 16a 552,&3 ITon ?”mg,f“' o Basws v 1
Jefferson 16 3,500 16 $51.53/Ton  Lansing deicer green 1 Lewis 7 200 - . q3/—r prvsy e T SR {
Optional 16a 16a  $0 Bid oy N/A N/A N/A N/A s ﬂf 442 f1on ey on BN /L

. 5430 L . ClgarLan L2 enhan%ed 1 Oprtional 17a 178 $9%,%47 /Ton A e $aet_ Bloos z
Lewis 17 200 |17 $54.30/Ton _Lansing ~~deicer gree Livingsion 18 000 18 53093 mon MRS ‘g soe (
Optional 17a 17a  ®No Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A Optional '&a » Ty . A

_ 182 $40.43 MMon  cotusly magesaet B 1
Livingston 18 3,000 18 o Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A Madison 19 3.155 19 $42.. 7 1Ton {mf’d@"‘ )“/U::m,( A !

i No Bi N/A Opti ‘ . HANIOA )

Optional 18a 18§ Aron / Clegl/:%ané@enhgr/léed NLA prona! e 19 5L /Ton - Gt pac? e
Madison 19 3,155 19 $43.11/Ton Lansing deicer green 1 Monroe 20 5,000 20 $3.93 rron DM 22’3 % Cot frens {
Optional 19a 19a $lo Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A Uptional 20a 200 $40.43 Ton (?}M@ﬁgf AL Anguw '’y
. ClearLane®enhanced s HAN0P 4

Monroe 20 5,000 20 $ 44.57/Ton Lansing deicer green 1 Nassau 21 1,500 24 S]léfifr% ébU‘r : Bl i

] R ) %%W ........ S .
Optional 20a 20a $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A &)?hondi 21a 2ia sggj«gﬁ@g__/’rm m%- ;»5 va M ) ﬂ@ﬁfiﬁ’ ~7/
Nassau 21 1,500 |21  $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A Niagara 22 1200 § 22 $39.93 rTon MMM P Biue {

i Opn 22 HA N¥ow B A
Optional 2la 2la  $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A phional 228 220 343,43 /Ton % ..... ARGt Baraur 2"

. {nes j - & 1
Niagara 22 1200 |22  §No Bidpon  N/A N/A N/A N/A nerda 23 7495 F23 844,43 iTon S A geer \

- Uptional 23a y ; -
Optional 22a 22a  $No BidTon N/A o1 N£A i hN/A . N/A Onond w: 23a Sggiﬂiﬁun %@LW WL;% Sloww z

.TearLandPenhance Jnondaga 2 8,000 24 %39, 4 7w qie s
Oneida 23 7,495 23 $43.59/Ton Lansing deicer green 1 Optional y Eiifmﬂ %%w - diws {
. Jpiis 2 24a $43 43 /T ‘ . " 1
Optional 23a 23a  $No BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A _ _ - . #3./Ton LS .WL ey
. CTearLanderhanced Cntanio 25 500 25 837791 Ton  onpss M‘{iﬁl@j Beod ¢

Onondaga 24 8,000 24 $38.76 /Ton Lansing deicer green 1 Optional 25a 25 st ijﬁ ks, | o “/'m o 7

i - a L ASVT 2 Fion » o f Y
Optional 24a 242 §o Bid/Ton N/A N/A é@e N/A N/A Orange 26 so0 f26 5793 men A0 %% '{;Q—ﬁn 0

) . . ClearLandbenhanced o - Sl ld SO o - 2877 S -1 e
Ontario 25 500 25 $42.80/Ton  Lansing deicer green 1 Optional 26a 26a  $ LB Ton M* e T Ao 7
Optional 25a 25a  $No BidTon N/A o N/A - -
P Lansing_ CIearLandMenhanced S o i

Orange 26 500 26 $57.78/Ton Bloomingburg deicer _ green 1 -U940Ldoe T0Okeg (continued)
Optional 26a 26a  $No BidTon N/A N/A _N/A_____ _N/A

209401.doc/T06/keg

(continued)




GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT PAGE 35 GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT | PAGE 35

(DOT & OTHERS) (DOT & OTHERS)
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
bl ’ .
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX INTERNATIONAL SALT COMPANY, LLC INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX SWP Environmental LLC.
g el -

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE] Stockpile Location: Product Names:
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG- TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG- 1. Wayland, NY. 1. SWP Treated
NESIUM CHLORIDE : NESIUM CHLORIDE 2. Lansing, NY. 2. Clearlane Enhance
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF CORROSION INHIBITED. IF 3. Buffalo, NY. Deicer
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM, OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,] 4. Ogdensburg, NY.
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a) PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM. ) ITEM. .
Filed Finished Specify Filed Finished Specify
OGS Require- locs  Prices Stockpile Product Salt Type OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color 10R2 County Item # ment Item # Unit . Location Name Color 10R2
Genesee 14 1,200 14  $No BidTon Genesee 14 1,200 14 $39-80ron 1-4 1-2  Blue/Green 1
Optional 14a 14a  §No BIdTon Optional 144 . = 1 $NB /Ton .
Herkimer 15 4,500 15 $68.91 /Ton Albany,NY Ice B'Gone Brown Type II Herkimer 15 4,500 15 $52.9YTon 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 15a 152 $No BidTon Optional 15a 152 $ NB  /Ton
Jefferson 16 3,500 16 $No BidTon Jefferson 16 3,500 16 $51.89Ton 1-4 1-2 Bilue/Green 1
Optional 16a l6a  $No BidTon Optional 16a 16a $ NB /Ton
Lewis 17 200 |17  $No BidTon Lewis 17 200 |17  $51.89Ton 1-4 1-2  Blue/Green 1
Optional 17a 17a  $No BidTon Optional 17a 178 $_NB_/Ton
Livingston 18 3,000 18  $No BidTon Livingston 18 3,000 18 $35.69Ton _1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 18a 182 $No BidTon Optional 18a 183 §$ NB /r‘?"
Madison 19 3,155 19 $70.19 /Ton Albany,NY Ice B'Gone Brown Type II Madison 19 3,155 19 $44.9%Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 19a 19a  $No BidTon Optional 19a 19a $_NB /Ton |
Monroe 20 5000 |20 $No BidTon Monroe 20 5000 120 $36.8QTon _1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 20a 20a  $No BidTon Optional 20a 202 $ NB _/Ton
Nassau 21 1,500 21 $73.25 /Ton Pt. Newark,NJ Ice B'Gone Brown Type II Nassau 21 1,500 21 $75.9¥Ton _1-4 1-2 Blue/CGreen 1
Optional 2la 2la  $No BidTon Optional 2la 2la $_NB /Ton
Niagara 22 1,200 22 $No BidTon Niagara 22 1,200 22 $50.9 9r9n 1-4 1-2  Blue/Green_ ]
Optional 2 [
Optional 22a 22a  $No BidTon ptiona 2a 223 $_NB_/Ton
Oneida 23 49. 1- -~
Oneida 23 7,495 |23  $No BidTon net 7495 123 $49.8%on 4 1-2  Blue/Green 1
. Optional 23 NB
Optional 23a 23a  $No BidTon puo a 23a 3 NB /Ton
. Onon 24 8,000 . 1-4 - -
Onondaga 24 8,000 |24 $No BidTon O“ d"’il%a 24 $47.89Ton 1-2 Blue/Green 1
tiona 24a 24 NB
Optional 24a 24a  $No BidTon Op a $_NB _/Ton 1
- ntario 25 500 25 $37.80r -4 1-2 B G
Ontario 25 500 25 $No BidTon ‘ - 2l Riton lue/Green 1
: Optional 25a 25a  $_NB /Ton
Optional 25a 25a  §No BidTon o ..g_S__E_Qr
26 50 6 . O - -
Orange 26 500 26 $66.16 /Ton Albany,NY Ice B'Gone Brown Type II range 0 2 $_22 - SPTon 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
. ional 2 6. NB
Optional 26a 26a  $ NoBid /Ton Optiona 6a 26a  $_NB /Ton
209401.doc/T06/keg (continued)

209401.doc/T06/keg (continued)



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT
(DOT & OTHERS)

PAGE 36

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

g

Bidder

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)

/1

/1

/1

/1

/1

/1

ITEM.

Filed Finished Specify

OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type

County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color 10R2
Oswego 27 1,200 27 $46.51 /Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue /1
Optional 27a 272§ /Ton
Putnam 28 700 28 $68.05 /Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 28a 28a  $ /Ton
St. Lawrence 29 200 29 $60.05 /Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 29a 292 $ /Ton
Schuyler &
Y ates - 30 5,575 30 $41.20 /Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 30a 30a $ /Ton
Seneca 31 600 31 $47.65/Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 31a 3la  $ /Ton
Steuben 32 3,200 32 $39.61 /Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 32a 32 $ /Ton
Suffolk 33 1,620 33 $76.34/Ton _Hampton Cormers, NY /Blue Magic /Blue
Optional 33a 33§ /Ton

209401.doc/T06/keg (continued)

GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT
(DOT & OTHERS)

PAGE 36

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=D DD D

Bidder

0z

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)

/2

/2

/2

/2

/2

ITEM.

Filed Finished Specify

oGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type

County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color 1OR2
Oswego 27 1,200 27 $50.51/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown /2
Optional 27a 27a. $____ /Ton
Putnam 28 © 700 28 $ No BidTon
Optional 28a 28a  $ /Ton
St. Lawrence 29 200 29 $64.05/Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 29a 29a §  /Ton
Schuyler &
Yates 30 5,575 30 $45.20/Ton Hampton Cormers, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 30a 30(a $_ /Ton
Seneca 31 600 31 $51.65/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 3la 3la  §$ /Ton
Steuben 32 3,200 32 $43.61/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 32a 32§ /Ton
Suffolk 33 1,620 33 $80.34 /Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown
Optional 33a 33z $__ /Ton

209401.doc/T06/keg (continued)




GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT
(DOT & OTHERS)

PAGE 36

GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT
(DOT & OTHERS)

PAGE 36

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

oD D D D

Bidder
Cargill, Incorporated-

Deicing Technology

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)

ITEM.
Filed Finished Specify
OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color 10R2
ClearLan@enhamcea
Oswego 27 1,200 27 $ 42.32/Ton Lansing deicer green 1
tional 27 27 Bid/T
Optiona a a o Bid/Ton éA 1 y{% @nl’r E}M% N/A
Putnam 28 700 28 $ 66.00/Ton Bloomlngburg deicer green 1
Hudson
Optional 28a 28a  ¥No Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
St. Lawrence 29 200 29 No Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
Optional 29a 29a  $lo Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
Schuyler & ClearLane@enhanc ed
Yates 30 5,575 30 $39.25/Ton Lansing deicer green
Optional 30 30 $ i N [ A
ptiona a a No Bidlon N/A 1o ééan ,@e’ it auécei
Seneca 31 600 31 $39.83/Ton Lansing deicer green
Optional 31a 31a  $No Bidron N/A N/A d@ N/A N/A
ClearL h d
Steuben 32 3,200 32 $ 44.52Ton Lansing de icaelzrll* I}zr%ré%e 1
Optional 32a 32a ®o Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
Suffolk 33 1,620 33 $No Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
Optional 33a 332 $No_BidTon N/A N/A N/A N/A

20940i.doc/T06/keg (continued)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE ‘
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX /I: m, a‘ () L v
e -
GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM.
Filed Finished Specify
OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type
County ltem#  ment fitem# Unit Location Name Color LOR2
I"/?MUU BLud ) ,
Oswego 27 "~ 200 |27 $51.97Ton MChs  masteepd B ot {
Optional 27a 270 $43.99 Ton ot A B Lz
o "fm"/“” IRy R :
Putnam 28 700 28 $ &L‘?‘:L/T on /”, s ;311:WL gt el B
, . né 2 . »
Optional 28a 28a s{t{i%() /Ton ffﬁ’ SHB el 13 Acivw -
' HAmProe 3auo = .
St Lawrence 29 200 f29  $44.9%/Ton ,mx?;fg Adcgad (L’ L
g . HrvH ard
Optional 29a 292 $5 $.47Ton  coamons MBIt PR o -
Schuyler & . A L geves (
Yates 30 5575 30 $30.43/Ton cprwets macic St LU
Optional 30a 300 $34.43 Ton ol Mhpespet  Gaowe
. HETO L e A
Seneca 31 600 31 $40,43 /Ton ,»,Zq,,um gﬁﬁ ’g,_[;f/’v ________ b
N HAMATOY :
Optional 3la 3la $44, ] 3/Ton ALY St Hicumn e
9 o [t "

Steuben 32 3200 f32  $34,¢3 /Ton o Socesnet  Blos b
. . 2] Hf’ﬂ)mhj 2/
Optional 32a 320 $34.93 Ton  (wifuwns M P ALY

» c
Suffolk 33 1,620 33 3 zg &3 Ton h“'ﬁ”@g‘ %mmc sped By {
e .
Qptional 33a 33a A 5D Ton /ylﬁ«mé Llagesad ﬁm 7 ?/
2090 doc/ TO6/keg {continued)




GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT
(DOT & OTHERS)

PAGE 36

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

PREPARING YOUR BID.

BE SURE YOU HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

e e ==

Bidder

SWP Environmental LLC.

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,

PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM.

Filed

OGS Require-

County Item # ment
Oswego 27 1,200
Optional 27a
Putnam 28 700
Optional 28a
St. Lawrence 29 200
Optional 29a
Schuyler &
Yates 30 5,575
Optional 30a
Seneca 31 600
Optional 31a
Steuben 32 3,200
Optional 32a
Suffolk 33 1,620
Optional 33a

209401 doc/T06/keg

Stockpile Locations:

Product Names:

1. Wayland, NY. 1. SWP Treated

2. Lansing, NY. 2. Clearlane Enhanced

3. Buffalo, NY. Deicer

4. Ogdensburg, NY.

Finished Specify

OGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type
tem # Unit Location Name Color 10R2
27 $45 .1 6Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
272 $_NB /Ton
28 $63.89Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green_ 1
282 $ NB /Ton
29 $56.8%0n 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
292 $ NB /Ton
30 $38.36Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
30a $ NB /Ton
31 $41.9}on 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
312 $ NB /Ton
32 $ 35.4%on 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
32a $_NB /Ton
33 $ 809 }ron 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green__ 1
332 $ NB /Ton

{continued)

GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT PAGE 36

(DOT & OTHERS)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
=D D > =

INTERNATIONAL SALT COMPANY, LLC

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHIL.ORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM.
Filed L Finished Specify
OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color 10R2
Oswego 27 1,200 27 $No Bid/Ton
Optional 27a ‘ 27a  $No Bid/Ton
Putnam 28 700 28 $72.91 /TonAlbany,NY Ice B'Gone Brown Type II
Optional 28a , 28a  $No Bid/Ton
St. Lawrence 29 200 29 $No Bid/'Ton
Optional 29a 292 $No_Bid/Ton
Schuyler &
Yates 30 5,575 30 $No Bid/Ton
Optional 30a 30a  $No Bid/Ton
Seneca 31 600 31 $No Bid/Ton
Optional 3la 3la $NO Bid/Ton
Steuben 32 3,200 32 $No Bid/Ton
Optional 32a 32a $No Bid/Ton
Suffolk 33 1,620 33 $77.16 /TonPt. Newark,NJ Ice B'Gone Brown Type II
Optional 33a 33a $NO Bid/Ton
209401.doc/TO6/keg (continued)



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT
(DOT & OTHERS)

PAGE 37

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX

e s Qe s S Jies

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,

GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT
(DOT & OTHERS)

PAGE 37

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= R D D D

Bidder

g

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)

:)rIIle;EI\/:SE COMPLETE THE (a) ITEM.
' . .. . Filed Finished Specif
Filed Finished Specify . . . peaily
OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type Count gGS 4 Reqlture- 2(;8 4 El l.cte/ lSJtoc‘k!nle ll;roduct Salt Type
County Item#  ment |item# Unit Location Name Color 10R2 Uiy < ment  pemr Lot geation me Lolor LOR 2
. . 1
Washington 34 500 34 $64.66/Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue /1 Washington 34 . 500 34 $68.66 /Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown /2
Optional 34a 3a $ /Ton Optional 3da 3a §___ /Ton
Wayne 35 2,000 35 $40.95/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue /1 Wayne 35 2,000 35 $44.95 /Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown /2
Optional 35a 352§ /Ton Optional 35a 3% §___ [Ton
Wyoming 36 200 16 $37.69/Ton Hampton Corners, NY /Blue Magic /Blue /1 Wyoming 36 200 36 $41.69 /Ton _Hampton Corners, NY /Ice B'Gone /Brown /2
Optional 36a 62§ Ton Optional 36a 36a  § /Ton

State mix method as required by State mix method as required by

Specification Item:

Name of Refiner:

Conveyor Spraying

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

Location of Refinery:
Location of Mine:
Location of Stockpile:

Have you submitted certificate of
written authority of the operator of the
mine to sell rock salt from the said
mine, as required herein, if you are not
the owner and/or operator?

Hampton Corners, NY

Hampton Corners, NY

Hampton Corners, NY

X YES NO

20940i.doc/T06/keg

(continued)

Specification Item:
Name of Refiner:

Location of Refinery:

Conveyor Spray

American Rock Salt Co., LLC

Hampton Corners, NY

Location of Mine:

Hampton Corners, NY

Location of Stockpile:

Hampton Corners, NY

Have you submitted certificate of
written authority of the operator of the
mine to sell rock salt from the said
mine, as required herein, if you are not
the owner and/or operator? X YES

20940i.doc/T06/keg (continued)

NO



GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT PAGE 37

(DOT & OTHERS)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=D D =

Cargill, Incorporated-
Deicing Technology

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,

GROUP 32160 - TREATED SALT
(DOT & OTHERS)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= I I T oD oD

Bidder

:f(//n‘ (/<1‘ng ﬁ'{’/c’

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)

PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM.

Filed Finished Specify
OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type
County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Gy Color 10R2
ClearLane”enhanced
Washington 34 500 34 $55.73/Ton Lansing deicer green 1
Optional 34a 34a  ¥No Bid/Ton N/A N/é@\) N/A N/A
., Cl L h d
Wayne 35 2,000 35 $38.86/Ton Lansing cdqefeer ag%gen 1
Optional 35a 352 $o Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
Wyoming 36 200 36 No Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A
Optional 36a 36a o Bid/Ton N/A N/A N/A N/A

State mix method as required by

Specification Item: Screw Mix Conveyor

Name of Refiner: Cargill Salt

Location of Refinery: Lansing, NY

Location of Mine: Lansing, NY

Location of Stockpile: Lansing, NY

Have you submitted certificate of
written authority of the operator of the
mine to sell rock salt from the said
mine, as required herein, if you are not
the owner and/or operator? YES NO

20940i.doc/T06/keg (continued)

[TEM.
Filed Finished Specify
OGS Require- (OGS Price/ Stockpite Product Saft Type
County ftem # ment tem # Unit Location Name Caolor 1OR2
. , HAmAY  Beee . .
Washington 34 500 34 $5‘; 44 Ton o asnt-d ditige snet B G
o~ iy i Yigaty
Optional 34a 30 $4LGG Ton R P Spel  Brow 2 Z
P i) . ; 2iLE
Wayne 35 2000 §35  sINeSTon UMY i Gee !
Optional 35a 352 % E{_L 1% /Ton ifﬁ” ﬁ?f Apesat  new -
) : -~ £ ~ Bl =
Wyoming 36 200 36 3 3Li M3 Ton (2?353‘-{-0 Mﬂ;‘/zcs‘r’?\cf B UC |
. . i e dd .
Optional 36a 36a S_ftl_ﬁ@ff on  _conaets i Y e

State mix method as required by

Specification ltem: § QWA 4"/5 X

Name of Refiner:

Aneilicrny) Rocdl gt

Location of Refinery:

HADPTON  Counachs

AAA

Location of Mine:

AP 7B CONAERS Ny

Location of Stockpile:

ARMPTEN (NS Y

Have you submitted certificate of
written authority of the operator of the
mine to sell rock salt from the said
mine, as required herein, if you are not
the owner and/or operator?

10940 doc T06/keg {continued)

_NO




GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT
(DOT & OTHERS)

PAGE 37

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YQU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

el

Bidder

SWP Environmental LLC.

GRANULAR SODPIUM CHLORIDE] Stockpile Location: Product Names:
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG- 1. Wayland, NY. 1. SWP Treated
NESIUM CHLORIDE 2. Lansing, NY. 2. Clearlane Enhanced
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF 3. Buffalo, NY. Deicer
OFFERING AN OPTIONALITEM,} 4. Ogdensburg, NY.
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM.
Filed Finished Specify

OGS Require- JOGS  Price/ Stockpile Product Salt Type
County Item # ment tem # Unit Location Name Color 10R2
Washington 34 500 34  $59.5VTon 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 34a 342 $ NB /Ton
Wayne 35 2,000 35 $42.7¥Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 35a 35a $_NB /Ton
Wyoming 36 200 36 $36.8%Ton 1-4 1-2 Blue/Green 1
Optional 36a 36a $ NB /Ton
State mix method as required by

Specification Item: Screw/Pug
Name of Refiner: SWP/Cargill
Location of Refinery: Wayland, NY/Lansing, NY/Buffalo, NY/Ogdensburg, NY
Location of Mine: Mt. Morris, NY/Lansing, NY/Goderich, Ontario-
Canada

Location of Stockpile: Wayland, NY/Lansing, NY/Buffalo, NY/Ogdensburg, NY
Have you submitted certificate of
written authority of the operator of the
mine to sell rock salt from the said
mine, as required herein, if you are not
the owner and/or operator? X YES NO
20940i.doc/T06/keg {continued)

GROUP 32100 - TREATED SALT

(DOT & OTHE

RS)

PAGE 37

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN

PREPARING YOUR BID.

BE SURE YOU

HAVE

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=

Bidder
INTERNATYONAL SALT COMPANY, LILC

GRANULAR SODIUM CHLORIDE
TREATED WITH LIQUID MAG-
NESIUM CHLORIDE
CORROSION INHIBITED. IF
OFFERING AN OPTIONAL ITEM,
PLEASE COMPLETE THE (a)
ITEM.

Filed Finished Specify
OGS Require- WOGS Pri.ce/ Stockpile Product Salt Type

County Item # ment Item # Unit Location Name Color 10R2
Washington 34 500 34 $62.73 /Ton Albany,NY 1Ice B'Gone Brown Type IIX
Optional 34a 34a §$No BidTon
Wayne 35 2,000 35 $ No BidTon
Optional 35a ' 352  $No BidTon
Wyoming 36 200 36 $ No BidTon
Optional 36a 36a  $NO BIdTon

State mix method as required by
Specification Item:
Name of Refiner:
Location of Refinery:
Location of Mine:
Location of Stockpile:
Have you submitted certificate of
written authority of the operator of the
mine to sell rock salt from the said

mine, as required herein, if you are not
the owner and/or operator?

pug mill and/or stacking conveyor

Sociedad Punta de Lobos

Port of Patillos, Chile

Port of Patillos, Chile

Albany, New York;Port Newark, New Jersey

X YES

209401.doc/T06/keg

(continued)

NO



