Bid Opening Results For:

IFB NUMBER 20881
BID OPENING 5/15/2007
GROUP NUMBER 35200

PURCHASING OFFICER  Jill McCabe

TELEPHONE | (518) 474-2804
DESCRIPTION
Firearms, Ammunition, Handcuffs, Batons, Holsters and
Targets

(Statewide)



GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

PAGE 17

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

i

BidferCHAR WHoLESALL, &
100 Airpark Dr.
. Rochester, NY 14624

b

LOT I - FIREARMS

Item

No.  Description

1. Beretta
Law Enforcement Firearms:
Accessories:
Sporting Arms:
Delivery:
Address of Plant where Manufactured:

2. Colt

Law Enforcement Firearms:

Accessories:

Catalog/ Price List
Identification (including Date)

2007 LAW ENF. DEALER

% Discount
from Price List

WHLS TAX OUT

13 PRICE LIST 1/1/07
WHSL + 9% 2007 Beretta USA Price
WHSL + 5% 2007 Silver Dist List
Aprox Firearms Price List

30 Days ARO
Accokeek, MD

20607
Colt Defense LLC 2007
Fet Out .
N Law Enf. Pricing
Retail -42% Colt Defense LLC 2007

- Law Enf . PRicing
etail ~-26.75%_2007 Colt Domestic

Sporting Arms:
Retail Price List
Aprox
Delivery: § 30-90 Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured: Hartford, CT
06144
(continued)

20881i.doc/T0Sjme




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 18
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

GROUP 35200 — FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 18
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide) PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
- PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE . . . )
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder . INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX GLOCK , e
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE AMCHAR WHOLESALE, Inc. ! N
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX 100 A"rpark Dr. |
= D DD = o 3
LOT I -FIREARMS (Cont'd)
LOTI-FIREARMS (Cont'd) « Item % Discount Catalog}
- ) No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date)
[tem % Discount Catalog/ Price List
No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date) ‘ 3 Glock ,
Suggested 2007 LAW ENF. PRICE L APPLIES T O Law Enforcement Firearms: O ;007 LE PAOVLE LIST
3. Glock ; i MoeDEL F Lo i - -
> Law Enforcement Firearms: JA9€NCcg -1% LIST ; Q.LRLC MP?S*D(S 5 © PE , Acces§0r1es: o 26077 LE PUCE LiST
. Suggested 2007 Glock Accessory | GLock " A POk Sporting Arms: N/ v/
Accessories: . ! LiST P g : _NIA A
Agency—=13.75% ——Price LTIst , ;
Sporting Arms: N/A There is no Differenc
Aprox Between LAw And Sportigfj‘ Delivery: (O Days ARO
Delivery: 30 Days ARO Address of Plant where Manufactured: GLOCK 10 cC.6bsoH 16HLANDS PKLOV' SMY 2o
N N oy > . " 4
Address of Plant where Manufactured: Smyrna, GA GLLCK GES pn.. Iy .H. A~22372 DELTSCH WA 6 ram,
30082 AUST Aja
4. Heckler & Koch . - .
L/E Price L/E Price LIst Law Enforcement Firearms: No Bid No Bid
4. Heckler & Koch -3 ) . e S
Law Enforcement Firearms: _E’___ 1/1/07 ; Accessories:
Accessories: | I /E Price Sporting Arms: I \
g : .
. -3% Amchar is a Law Enf
Arms: . |
Sporting Arms —R/A— Dist Ior H&K Only Deliverv: ; Davs ARO
Varies v e W RS
Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Delivery: § 30-90 Days ARO
Sterling VA

20166

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

(continued)

(continued) 20881i.doc/T0Sjmc

20881i.doc/TOSjme




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

PAGE 19

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

e e

Bidden CHAR WHOLESALE, i,
100 Airpark Dr.
... Rochester, Y 14624

LOT I - FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description
5. Mossberg
Law Enforcement Firearms:
Accessories:
Sporting Arms:
Delivery:
Address of Plant where Manufactured:
6. Remington

Law Enforcement Firearms: |
Accessories:

Sporting Arms:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Catalog/ Price List
Identification (including Date)

% Discount
from Price List

Dist -9% 2007 LE Price List
Dist +2% 2007 DIst Price LIst
Dist +2% 2007 Dist Price List
Aprox

30 Days ARO

North Haven CT

06473

Tax out 2007 LE/MIL/FA NET Price
+ 5% List 12/01/06
MSP-NET Gun Parts (accessories) 1/1;
MSP-NET 2007 _RACI DOMESTIC SPORTING
Aprox 11/01/06

30 Days ARO
14 HOefker Ave

Illion, NY 13357

(continued)

20881i.doc/T05jme




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

PAGE 20

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

i

Bid
$ICHAR WHoLESALE, Inc.

100 Airpark Dr.
HOChestpg NY 14824

LOT I - FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

7. . Ruger
Law Enforcement Firearms:
Accessories:
Sporting Arms:
Delivery:
Address of Plant where Manufactured:
8. Savage

Law Enforcement Firearms:

Accessories:

Sporting Arms:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Catalog/ Price List
Identification (including Date)

% Discount
from Price List

Net Dist 2007 Le Dist PRice
+ 1% Sheet
Retail -42.5% 2007 DIst PRice Sheet
Retail-42.08% 2007 Dist for LE
— Olny
Aprox
30  DaysARO
Southport CT
06890
N/A Not Produced
Dealer Net 2007 Dist Price LIst
DIst -2% 2007 Dist Price List

A
p§8x Days ARO
Suffield, CT
06078

(continued)

20881i.doc/T05jme




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

. HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PAGE 21

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

e N

Bidde ’
AvChar WHOLESALE, Inc.
100 Airpark Dr,

LOTI- FIREARMS (cont'd)
Item % Discount Catalog/ Price List
No. Description from Price List Identification (includine Date)
9. SigArms Agency -2% 2007 LE Agency
Law Enforcement Firearms: :
Accessories: fAgency -29%
Sporting Arms: N/A Amchar is a Law
Enforcement DIst
. Aprox W/ Sigarms only
Delivery: 30 Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured: Exter, NH
03833
, 5/1/07
10. Smith & Wesson Dist w/o0 2007 S&W Domestic
Law Enforcement Firearms: FET o 6.5% L/E Dist /Dealer
Accessories: Retail -35s Same as above
Sporting Arms: N/A Amchar is a Law Enf DIst
only for Smith & Wesson
Aprox
Delivery: 58 Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured: Springfield , MA
01102

(continued)

20881i.doc/T05jme

\NDCUFFS, BATONS,
vide)

PAGE 21

Bidder

JUWER 077575

% Discount
from Price List

Catalog/ Price List

Identification (including Date)

Days ARO

Cz %O DZST, 7AX00T Cop omp)

P % LE. DIST. 485 ) 207
XY% orrreran g, F, L2ZST, 218y}, 2007
O

30-60 Days ARO

2190 [L0055vmr T AV F .
SIAING FZE7 . 4, /0
1tinued)

ANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 21

ewide)

{

Bidder
SIGARMS, INC.

Catalog/ Price List
Identification (including Date)

$554.08 as of 04/01/07
/.5% Discount from LE Agency Price of $599.00

% Discount
from Price List

7.5% Discount from LE Agency Price of $599.00

N/A

45 Days ARO
18 Industrial Drive

Exeter, NH (03833

Days ARO

(continued)




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 21
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

e

h 90 Mineola Ave

Roslyn Heights, N.Y. 115
Tol. (516) 484-5892

LOT]I- FIREARMS (cont'd)

Item % Discount Catalog/ Price List
No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date)
9. SigArms
Law Enforcement Firearms: N\\ {5) 15 ’lﬁ 2 & )TD/‘/(
Accessories:
Sporting Arms:
Delivery: Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

! A«UTJ wf(A/éssmf

" duce] fanl M m ’f% . C
1A £
&LLOW' 7 5&(@6\“‘1% S @g(‘ , )ﬂl Lkw %N&'@M
10. Smith & Wesson ]
Law Enforcement Firearms: 4‘9 6’ b'S/‘M}"‘J"‘Wa/ 06”0[“6/(
Accessories: ' Wzl(é List 0&7 o
Sporting Arms: B; bl éf(e(:fa% MW/

Delivery: 30" ?lo Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured: Q.WO F\‘NSQ\PSL‘Y {.‘a% >
Q(‘}p\m@ﬂﬁ\) , Ma.

PLA;@ nofe ] )
PRicec fol Bitchrms anc Ualin Foa

Fmetal €xcce Thx €xaMbr ORDeRE,

il oTieR  Nod Feocnsl exease Tox bxehfr
ouins Must AbD 1o % .

(continued)

20881i.doc/TO5jme




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,
PAGE 3 PURCHASING MEMORANDUM

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

REVISED PAGE 22

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

=D 2 =2 =

BigddaCrar WHOLESALE, INC.
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT I - FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

11 US Repeating Arms (Winchester)
Law Enforcement Firearms:

Accessories:

Sporting Arms:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

12. Other: Benelli

Law Enforcement Firearms:
Accessories:

Sporting Arms:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

% Discount
from Price List

Catafog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

N/A Not Produced

Wholesale Price .(net) 2007
Wholesale Price (net)Confidential

Aprox Wholegale
Price

30 Aays ARO LiSt
- MOrgan, UT
84050

WHLS TAX OUT Beretta
+ 5 8 2007 Law Enf Dealer
S — Priee—list—pages—7-9
WHSL + 9% 2007 Beretta USA Price

n/a Not Available

30-60
Aprox Days ARO
Pocomoke, MD

21851

(continued)

20881p.doc/TO5jme

GROUP 35200 ~ FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

REVISED PAGE 22

PAGE 3 PURCHASING MEMORANDUM

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= D D D

BiddaCnan WHoL 20t
100 Airp
Rochester N

LOT I - FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

11. US Repeating Arms (Winchester)
Law Enforcement Firearms:
Accessories:

Sporting Arms:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

12. Other: BUSHMASTER
Law Enforcement Firearms:

Accessories:

Sporting Arms:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

(continued)

20881p.doc/T05jme

% Discount
from Price List -

Catalog/Price List
Identitication (including Date)

~

Days’ARO

List Price
+ 9.5% 2007 12/06

MSRP -3%
msrp -38%

Aprox
30 Days ARO

L/E DIST. PROGRAM

2007 BUshmaster

Cataldyg
Bushamster 2007

Suggested Retail
Prices

Windham ME

04062




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

REVISED PAGE 22
PAGE 3 PURCHASING MEMORANDUM

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

= DD D

Bidda G han Wioy
1006 Airp
Rochester, NY

LOTI- FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item

No. Description

11. US Repeating Arms (Winchester)
Law Enforcement Firearms:

Accessories:

Sporting Arms:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

12. Other: _ Kahr Arms
Law Enforcement Firearms:

Accessories:

Sporting Arms:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Catalog/Price List
Identification (includirfg Date)

% Discount
from Price List

ays ARO

FET OUt 2007 LE DIST P
F rogram

Dist + 15% Same As Ablve
N/A There 2is no difference
T between Taw and spotiing
Agrox models.
0 Days ARO

Worcester, MA
01603

(continued)

20881p.doc/TOSjme

GROUP 35200 ~ FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,
PAGE 3 PURCHASING MEMORANDUM

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

REVISED PAGE 22

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

e

BiddaCHak Wrot::
100 Adipars D1
Rochester, NY = #n24

LOT 1 - FIREARMS (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

11. US Repeating Arms (Winchester)
Law Enforcement Firearms:

Accessories:

Sporting Arms:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

12. Other: FNH USA

Law Enforcement Firearms:
Accessories:

Sporting Arms:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured;

% Discount

Catalog/Price List /
from Price List - Identification (including Date’

Bag/s ARO

P
Dist 2007 LE Djst Pricing
+6% 11/1/06

LE_Agency -10% et s—
N/A Amchar is Law ENf
DIst only for FNH
Aprox

30-60 Days ARO
Mclean, VA

22101

(continued)

2088 1p.doc/T0OSjme
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HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWR!TEI;}VH EN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HA E BOX
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN TH

= D D D = =

LOT 11— AMMUNITION (New)

Catalog/Price List :
Identification_(including Date)

207 E@QP\Q\\ Price Uit
E®. 09Pmu0)

% Discount
from Price List

2390
39 _:_B_o;oDays ARO

00 Enlen vuve y

P ke, Minnesofa 65303

Item
Na. Desctiption

1. Federal

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Simunition

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

T M MA C 00
THOMAS X MORRIS, KR

EAGLE POINT 2UN

T A MOBRRIS & SO

1797 THIRD STRITET
THOROFARE, NI 05084

REARAFADAT

(continued)

2088 li.doc/T0Sjme

05/15/07.  TUE 08:26 [TX/RX NO 8151] [doz29

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

PAGE 23
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

oD DD D D

BidAsnCHAR WHoLESALE, INg
100 Airpark Dr.
Rochester, NY 14624

LOT I - AMMUNITION (New)

Item

% Discount
No. Description

from Price List

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

1. Federal
{
petvery: | NQBID
Address of Plant where Manufactured: .
L/E W/O FET
. . + 4% 2-U.S. Law ENFORCEMENT
2. Simunition EFEFECTIVE 10/26/07
Delivery: 30 Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured: 5 Montee Des Arsenaux

Le Gardeur, Quebec
J5z21P4

(continued)

20881i.doc/T05ime




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

PAGE 24

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

g

BidlerC ian Whotesae |
100 Airpark Dr,
. Rochester, NY 14624

LOT Il - AMMUNITION (New) (Cont'd)

Item
No.  Description

3. Speer (CCI, Lawman, Blazer)

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

4. Remington

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Catalog/Price List

Identification (including Date)
SPEER LE 2007 RE}‘AIL
PRICE LIST _ 5/97/07

% Discount
from Price List

23501k

VARIED
30-90 Days ARO

Lewistion, ID
83501

Net Price
2007 Law Enf Ammo

Tax Out : ; .
+62 Price List Effective
. 6/1/07-See attached
Varied

Remington Letter
30-90  paysARO

Madison, NC
27025

(continued)

20881i.doc/T05jme




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, REVISED PAGE 25
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide) PAGE4  PURCHASING MEMORANDUM

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE ' /
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX \T é/ﬁf /)/ W E

LOT II - AWIMUNITION (New) (Cont'd)

% Discount Catalog/Price List
from Price List Identification (including Date)

45% LELHETAZL Fu5057 f 2,

Item
No. Description

5. Winchester

Z0- (9 Days ARO
Y27 N, SHAMROCK S7.

EAST LTI, ZL. . X034

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

6. Other:

Delivery: Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

(continued)
20881p.doc/T05jme




16317367317 p.7

Magy 15 2007 10: 200 “vERKLREEN lbdl /absial/ Pp-b ! Mag 15 2007 10:20RAM EVERGREEN

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUT‘\!ITION HANDCUFFS, BATONS, REVISED PAGE 25

REVISED PAGE 25
PAGE4  PURCHASING MEMORANDUM

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNIT[ON HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

. HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Stalewide)

HOLSTERS & TARGETS. (Stalewxde) PAGE 4 PURCHASING MEMORANDUM
PLEASE USE BLACK INK T i
LI A e Speeril P
PREFPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU | ~y INSERTED YO , Ve lree ol
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX (j Sorvices fiaile =>UR ;OMPANY S NAME EN THE BOX = -4 7 S{’Q ‘ f;/J 4
—ey' C
OIS T I = = - =
o LOTI - A :
LOT II - AMMUNITION (New) (Contd) o LOT I - AMMUNITION (New) (Cont d)
i . . Item . .
It % Discount Catalog/Price List .. % Discount Catalog/Price List
EZT Description from Price List Identification (including Date) No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date)
5. Winchester / lz o g / é‘ 5. Winchester _ﬂl ‘7__1; v A
Delivery: Days ARO | Delivery; Days ARO
Address of Plant where Nfanufactured: Address of Plant where ¥Manufactured:
6. Other: .H@fn gé\’,( m% _ 3 §/0 H&rf\a_i y ﬂf) LQ,w 6. Other: Kl 1 d v e F/ﬂmti g S_Za Aﬂw g:n_ﬂ,/& _{,
Delivery: = ( Days ARO . : DEIWETY -2\ __ Days ARO , ‘
Address of Plant where Manufctured: géa w0 ch Fotach Address of Plant where Manufactured: [ SS (il gore b,l\w "
-; Brand Tsland NME L $F03 Toone TN Ipzé/
(continued) 20881p.doc/T0Sjme (continued)

20881p.doc/TOSjme

[ S R ¥} 1 {

'05/15/07 TUE 10:26

[TX/RX NO 81531 Idjoos

[ I i ! 1

] i
05715/07 TUE 10:26

[TX/RX NO 81531 [dioo7




GROUP 35200 — FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 26
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

S

BiddenLriak WHOLESALL,
100 Airpark Dr.
. Rochester, NY 14624

LOT III - HANDCUFFS

Item
No.  Description

1. American Handcuft Co.

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

2. Hiatt-Thompson Co.

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

3. Peerless Handcuff Co.

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

% Discount Catalog/Price List
from Price List Identification (including Date)

~ »NOBID

[V

 ..NOBID

Retail
-45% Retail Price List

Effective 2-1-07
30 Days ARO

Springfield, MA
01103

(continued)

20881i.doc/T05jme

\NDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 26
vide)

Bidder

AV’/’Y?OV /’/0/(/)/773 deuc:l;

% DiSC(_)unt _ Catalog/Price List
from Price List Identification (including Date)
Days ARO

lﬁ/" Hig+1~ 2007 "Pnuf list

JO  Daysaro

Lap VH AT 2N
=itz wol ///‘CIMA‘ /VH Og(‘/('/w]

Days ARO

Jed)




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PAGE 26

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

-

Bidder
RELIAPON POLICE PRODUCTS, INg¢.

LOT HI - HANDCUFFS

Item )
No. Description
1. American Handcuff Co.

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

2. Hiatt-Thompson Co.

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

3. Peerless Handcuff Co.

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

from Price List

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

% Discount

Days ARO

23% H-T 2007 Retaill P/L

14 Days ARO
7200 W. 66th St.
Bedford Park, IL 60638

Days ARO

{continued)

20881i.doc/T05me

ANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 26

wide)

Bidder

Tawren's & Shooters' Supply, Inc.

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

NO BID

% Discount
from Price List

Days ARO

407% Retail Price Sheet dated 5/10/07

045 pays ARO

7200 W. 66th Strest
Bedford Park, IL. 60638

40% Retail Price Sheet dated 1/24/07

045 Days ARO

33 Rose Place
Springfield, MA 01104

itinued)




GROUP 35200 — FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 27 ‘ GROUP 35200 — FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 27

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN B Cran WHOLESALE, fiue PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE \7_2/ p Z/{ WMZ/{S

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX
=S = D = =

e

LOT III - HANDCUFFS (Cont'd)

LOT 111 - HANDCUFFS (Cont'd)

Item % Discount Catalog/Pfice List | Item % Discount Catalog/Price List
No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date) ‘ No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date)
4. Smith & Wesson Bi‘f%ll 2%917/8%“7 pist 'PriCing 4. Smith & Wesson XmFXETﬂZL A,é', W//,ﬁ}//) 200
Delivery: 30 Days ARO Delivery: ‘?ﬂ ’éﬁ Days ARO |
Address of Plant where Manufactured: Springfield MA Address of Plant where Manufactured: 2/00 HOVSEVEZT SIVE,
01102 SIHLINMGETELL, 215 2/ /D 2

RETATL 2007 PRODUCT LIST
5 Other: C&S SECURITY, INC. -9% s Other- AM
— 7 7 Y

livery: 30 DaysARO _
Deivery e Delivery: Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured: Roscommon, MI
ress of et wher 48653 i Address of Plant where Manufactured:

(continued)
20881i.doc/TO5jme
(continued)
20881i.doc/T05jme




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PAGE 27

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

e

BiddexTaARD) LAN ENFORCESEENT STFPLY CT.

190 Mineola Ave.

Heights, N.Y. 11577
Roslyn Heig o892

LOT III - HANDCUFFS (Cont'd)

30” ?O Days ARO

19 dwatiod Dr..; HOU[-{OJ M@

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)
MiTH ¥ W sson]

SMECTIC
Coshiventi AL [ fal E RFO eNST
DisTRAEH G2 / Dea A

3.00 mgen by A mea"»é/@,

.

Item o % Discount
No. Description “,Sdﬁ& RCW”L from Price List ,
4. Smith & Wesson M;dug(') Tt “mf’}) — x4 36’ b 7‘7
G
Delivery:
Address of Plant where Manufactured:
5 . Other:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

E bFecrive m jl,awo7

0i10

Days ARO

(continued)
20881i.doc/T05jme




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 28
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bifdef AR WHOLESALE, Ine
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE 100 Airoark D1
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX Ipa o

. Rochester, NY 14624

= D 2=

LOT 1V —-BATONS

Item % Discount Catalog/Price List
No, Description from Price List Identification (including Date)
i Jan._ 2007 Retail
1. ASP 1—235%11 Price L%sg
. 30
Delivery: Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured: Appleton WI r
54912
2. Kohaut & Co.

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

(continued)
20881i.doc/T0Sjme




GROUP 35200 — FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 28
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder

PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE ) wowr K Co

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME IN THE BOX &2@

=2

LOT IV - BATONS

% Discount Catalog/Pric

Item
from Price List Identification (including Date)

No. Description

1. ASP

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

O 7 See ATIRCHED Troeu!s
Bedtue THS PROE
\ 5 Days ARO -
2130 Cemror —TEAIC “Locp
Seowutser (. G5LEY

.0 Bo* Y17
WT. fucn v~ c»

2. Kohaut & Co.

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

asbSY

(continued)

20881i.doc/TO3me

& Co. ' ;%_229‘
OHAUT

A Division of John C. Kohaut, Inc.

P.O. BOX 518 MT. AUKUM, CA 95656 (530) 620-2044 OFFICE (530) 620-2046 FAX

N.Y.S PRICELIST FOR WOODEN NIGHTSTICKS; RIOT
BATONS AND BILLY CLUBS. EFFECTIVE 6/1/2007

Established 1887

BILLY CLLUB MODEL 25

Hickory 8§ $10.00ea
Dymondwood 8§ $21.50ea.
BILLY CLUB MODEL 50 '

Hickory 13° $10.00ea
Dymondwood 13 $21.50ea.
LAPD BATON MODEL 100

Hickory 26 $ 5.75ea.
Hickory 29° $ 5.75ea.
Hickory 36~ $ 6.50ea.
Hickory 42° $ 8.50ea.
Dymondwood 26" $25.00¢a.
Dymondwood 29 $25.00ea.
NYPD BATON MODEL 200

Hickory 26 $10.50ea.
Dymondwood 26 $22.50ea.
CHICAGO CLUB MODEL 300

Hickory 23" $10.50ea
Dymondwood 23" $25.00ea.
RIOT BATON MODEL 400

Hickory 36~ $14.75¢a.
Dymondwood 36" $35.00ea
DETROIT BATON MODEL 500

Hickory 23" $10.50ca.
Dymondwood 23" $22.50ea
RIOT BATON MODEL 600

Hickory 36" $14.50ea.
Dymondwood 36 . $32.50¢a,
FANCY DRESS STICK MODEL 700

Hickory 247 $15.50ea.
Dymondwood 24” $25.00ea.
ACCESSORIES

Rubber Grommetts $ 1.00ea.
Leather Thongs $ 1.00ea.

AVAILABLE WOOD FINISHES
Hickory: Black, Mahogany, Natural
Dymondwood: Black, Charcoal, Cocobolo
TERMS AND CONDITIONS

Net 30 days upon approval of credit.
FOB Destination, price includes freight to your facility

WOODWORKING & WOODTURNING IN FOREIGN AND DOMESTIC WOODS




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,

PAGE 29

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

—g =

Bidder

N ymac He feirgy s Prdocts| e

LOT IV — BATONS (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

3. Monadnock

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

4. Other:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Catalog/Price List
Identification (including Date)

% Discount
from Price List

15%
3 Days ARO

136 NH BT 2.V
Fito coil)iam, VH 63947

Days ARO

(continued)

20881i.doc/T05jme

maﬂ—AQ/—QDL&—f?QQ—ill (¢ it

May 15 2007 10:24AM EVERGREEN

16317367317 p.23

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AN[MiIN]TION, HBANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 29
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)
FLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRI‘TEB WHEN Bigger )
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE E VR Sfe Cra /‘7‘7
’ : 0 OX . 3
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAMEJN THE B Séf(// s
DS S Ty = =
LOT IV - BATONS (Conr'd)
Item % Discount Catalog/Price List
No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date)
3. Monadnock No g Cri
;Delivery: Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured:
4, Other: 1020 NixSon /ch’r fn:

! Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

. 7
dlice + Sporti~qg Egu
O _ Deys aRO F IC L | ,SM 7 ;lc
2079 \weet S Street
H”ialemh7 FL 330/l

(continued)

2088 1i.doc/TOSjme

u [N I P

| {
05/15/07  TUE 10:26 [TX/RX NO 81531 [do23




NDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 30

GROUP 35200 — FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 30
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide) | ide)
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder JLL{, Bidder A ’[/jg/\z‘?d@a/r VS gac a8
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE 71 /c/ Delaun #s dbister . ;
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX A y o / o/d ings rdedls L ‘7’5)’(5/ /3@/7/'7’ 7\7”7’ 0/@
" 0 { C/ ~ /. / 70/
=S D oD DD o D 7
LOT V-HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES
Item % Discount Catalog/Price List % Discount ) Catalog/Price List
No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date) from Price List Identification (including Date)
1. Bianci ;;i [ 0 14 , 2001 g -List ~——————/ ,/
Delivery: 3( ) Days ARO L_ Days ARO
”~ ) o
Address of Plant where Manufactured: P O @O]( (’I O | 5
Tem ccole. (A 93 589-9015 4
23%. Lxxy 1 /200
2. DeSantis ]_/O . \(Y\{ | /2007.
Delivery: Days ARO _SQ_. Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured: LG
(HYY\C{{/(]H { Hﬁg N Y l )701
3. Don Hume ,4 /
Delivery: Days ARO —mé_ Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured: //

wed)

(continued)




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 3 ANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 30

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide) :wide)
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder Y] INC. Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE NEW YORK POLICE SUPPL .
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX 1460 RIDGE R'\% %ﬁ%; Lawren's & Shooters' Sugply, Inc.

TER,
D D D - 5_%%2-58 =
EAX 585-467-2870
- 2
ORD
LOT YV - HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES
Item % Discount Catalog/Price List % Discount Catalog/Price List
No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date) from Price List Identification (including Date)
1. Bianci NO BID
Delivery: Days ARO : Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

2. DeSantis 0% Retail Price Sheet dated 1/1/07
Delivery: Days ARO : 045 Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured: : 431 Bayview 2

Amityville, NY 11701

3. Don Hume m KRN |, 20077 (RETR;L Q(‘t(ﬁ ) i
Y 40 Retail Prixe Seect dated 1/1/07
Delivery: 3O Days ARO 045
. . : Days ARO
Address of Plant where Manufactured: N Y ‘\P\i’. o¥.

X0 26th Street NW
Miami, 0K 7434

(continued)
20881i.doc/TO5jmc ontinued)




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, ' PAGE 31 ‘
GROUP 35200 — FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFF S, BATONS, PAGE 31

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide) | FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HAND
atewide
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN Bidder ., yORK POLICE SUPPLY, INC.
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX Iawmen's & Shooters' Suply, Tnc. fg&?ﬁgggﬁg% gll\?l; :DIIEYS’UgE YOU HAVE 1460 RIDGE RD. EAST
DD O D D = S NAME IN THE BOX ROCHESTER, NY 14621
=D D DD D 585-467-1370

FAX -
QRDERS ___1-800-262-2832

LOT V- HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES (Cont'd) LOTV - HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ALL LSOV . ACCESSORIES (Cont'd)
Item % Discount Catalog/Price List ) o
No.  Description from Price List Identification (including Date Item . % Discount Catalog/Price List
No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date)
: NO BID
4. Safariland —_— 4. Safariland
Delivery: Days ARO .
—e Delivery: Days ARO
f: d:
Address of Plant where Manufacture ~ Address of Plant where Manufactured:
5. Other: _Gould & Goodrich o6 Retail Prixe Sheet dated 1/15/07 5. Other: \ONC\E MIKE S ,2_@;73_ TRN 1, Lo 67
P
LAW Entore € Ment
Delivery: 3045  Days ARO Delivery: 30 DaysArRO
Address of Plant where Manufactured: 709 E. M\eil Street ‘ Address of Plant where Manufactured: ONER Land D el KS
7

Lillington, NC 2746

G. CUuTTS CLsSToN Lentiter

AGR L9 60

20 Sads meo

(RQLHGSTE&L’ NY

. (continued)
(continued) 20881i.doc/T05imc

20881i.doc/T05jme




GROUP 35200 — FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 31

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide) GROUP 35200 — FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 31

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

- > = = =

BiddghyiGHAR W o
100 Aitpar
 Rochester, &

LOT V — HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES (Cont'd)

[tem
No. Description

4. Safariland
Delivery:
Address of Plant where Manufactured:
5. Other: BLACKHAWK QUTDOORS

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

% Discount Catalog/Price List

from Price List Identification (including Date)

Oofficial 2007 Dealer
Price List 12/15/06

e

LIST
-32%

30 Days ARO

Ngrfolk, VA

23502

(continued)

2088 1i.doc/T05jme

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

e

BidddCHAR WHOLESALE, B
100 Airpark Dr.
.. Rochester, NY 14624

LOT V — HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES (Cont'd)

Item
No. Description

4. Safariland

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

5. Other: Gould & Goodrich

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

% Discount Catalog/Price List
from Price List Identification (including Date)

NOED

Suggested Retail
Reﬁg%l Price List Effective
- 1-15/2007

30 DaysARO
Lillington, NC
27546

(continued)

20881i.doc/T05jmc




GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFF S, BATONS, PAGE 31

HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

—

Bidder

/J mor /'/6 / c/ 11765 /)mlub;s e

LOT V — HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS AND RELATED
ACCESSORIES (Cont'd)

Item % Discount Catalog/Price List

No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date)

4, Safariland ,_-—2; > 0/0 . E,:[Z; i kZQ d P07 éig(’é/ st
Delivery: 3 O Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

3420 EastVission Blod

5. Other:

Delivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

Days ARO

(continued)
20881i.doc/T05jme

Maw 15 2007 10:25AM EVERGREEN

163173687317 p.25

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMU NITIDN HANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 31
HOLSTERS & TARGET S (Statewnde)
PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWR[TER WHEN Bidder
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE Iy, ,%,
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY'S NAME! AN T}ll} BOX E éﬁ ~ Séé(‘/([
— : : kS’fJ.:ZLC.QL_
V- HOLSTERS, DUTY BELTS A ; LATED
ACCESSORIES (Cont'd) ; :
Item % Discount Catalog/Price List
No. Description from Price List Identification (including Date)
4. Safariland Ao B:d

Delivery: Days ARO

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

L{D?{o _[)’UX_OA /FfCT fmé—
/5' Days ARO Pe ((“_ +§f0r4mj E?b

2079 w%% SO Struod >
H:alt.a/«\, FL 330/¢

5. Other: NiXxson

Dclivery:

Address of Plant where Manufactured:

(continued)
2088 li.doc/TO5jme

Lot 1 \ .
05715707 TUE 10:26 [TX/RX NO 81531 I[djo2s




Be/1Lhs 2807

an: 27 BH63H42938 EAGLE PULINIT

ors s s

GROUP 353200 — FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS,
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statcwide) PAGE §

BATONS, REVISED PAGE 32
PURCHASING MEMORANDUM

s A [l

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE

Bidder WAL

ECHPTT T

s E AN

INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX g‘gﬁ; f;w RIS 0 SO
AR CHHER R STE B

= = =2 == THOROFARE, il 09086
' VDAL AL
LOT VI- TARGETS
1. Spocdwell

Estimated Ptice Per Extension Cannt Catalog

Quantity 100 Price Per Box Name
Description speedsel|
FBI-Q 0000 | $JT700 . S5160:00 200 GLEQP RO
B27FS 2000 | $97.60  s3300.00 _LOD 71
B27EGY so000 § 519.00  $G460-00 200 (A
B27FSNYSP 0000 § 52300 $2l,5%-G0 10O N
B2IFSR 12000 | $2 48 STYMEED 0D ot
RGOCT 6ooo | $9vIS.  S_110£00 266 7t
SR1 3,000 § $.21.00 $_G30-00 2¢D Al
B21XNS aono | sQ3.5® 376500 RGO . M
B2IXFS e 10000 § $36.76 §307400_ (00 . 1
B2ITSNYSP 12000 | 522,10 3277200 100 el

- Grand Total: %L___}__l'ij_ég , - ['OO

% Discount for Remaindet of Targets in Speedwell Catalog:

QOther:

Paper:
Catdboard:

Steel:

Delivery:

THOMAS J, MORRIS, [IF % Discan
EAGLE POINT N

TR MORRIS & SON

787 THIRD STRELT
THORDFARE, N.J 08086

Cardboard: -
Steel:

M ST IOAR A
’ Q0 S BV
\\(( m/’q RTET T TR
TBORO A BB
20881 p.doc/T05jme L Ly DL (RORG

R56-848-5045

3 0 Days ARC

See afteched GovLwriows

drs coumts by 915¢
Cactegoy -

and

__ Days ARO

05/15/07 TUE 08:26

[TX/RX NO

Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)

81511 @040



gT0[ [¥9T8 ON X¥/XL] €¢:0T UL L0/S71/90

GROUP 35200 - FIREARMS, AMMUNITION, HANDCUFFS, BATONS,
HOLSTERS & TARGETS (Statewide)

PLEASE USE BLACK INK OR TYPEWRITER WHEN
PREPARING YOUR BID. BE SURE YOU HAVE
INSERTED YOUR COMPANY’S NAME IN THE BOX

—

Bidder :
| o Ewrorcement | Aecer

LOT VI-TARGETS

I.  Speedwell

Estimated

Quantity
Description
FBI-Q 30,000
B27FS 12,000
B27EGY 50,000
B27FSNYSP 50,000
B21FSR 12,000
B6OCT 6,000
SR1 3,000
B21XNS 3,000
B21XFS 10,000
B2{FSNYSP 12,000

5 Discount for Remainder of Targets in Speedwell Catalog:
Paper:

Cardboard:
Steel:

Delivery:

2. Othen:

o4 Discount for Targets in Catalog:
Paper:

Cardboard:

Steel:

Delivery:

Price Per Extension Count Catalog
100 Price Per Box Namec
a : & . v
g ll-ot $ L[,OéA“ A 100 Lav Ernee ‘Lce:i‘u“ »
¢ 37.°° $ o0’ 200 LET
TR —
s24.°°  sl12000." oo  LEY
$ NO O $ -
$ No $ .
%
g PR § HY0- 200 LET
S ML — —_—
§ 30.7° g 700. €7
e, - ——
¢ 31.% § 102" so0 LeC
¢ 31.°° $ 3180.°°
§_po $ -

Days ARO

L Av EM FORCEMENT I Aprsey)
Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)

20 Days ARO

{continued)

2088 11.doc/T0Sjme

ANDCUFFS, BATONS, REVISED PAGE 72
PURCHASING MEMORANDUM_/

PAGE 5
. o v
"ARCHAR WioLEsALE, INc.
100 Airpark Dr.
Bnchester NY 14874
Price Per Extension Count Catalog
100 Price Per Box Name
2006
f
5.18.20 536,40 preporred
$ 30.49 $30.49 100
$ 20.72 $41.,44 200
$ 25.00 $25.00 100
$ 30.49 $30.49 100
$.24.08 $48.16 200
$ 23.18 $57.95 250
$ 26.08 $52.16 200
¢ 33.88 $33.88 100
$ 25.00 $25.00 100 N
Grand Total: ~ $44,948.20

-43% off List
-3% off List
-3% off List

30 Days ARO

Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)

Days ARO

TANDCUFFS, BATONS, PAGE 32
ewide)
N Bidder

Lawren's & Shooters® Suply, Inc.

Price Per Extension Count Catalog
100 Price Per Box Name
g 19.32 $ 5,796.00 200 L/E Clubs 2006
$ 31.61 $ 3,793.20 100 " " "
$21.84 $10,920.00 _200 " " "
$ 36.20 $.18,100.00 _100 " " "
$ 31.61 $ 3,793.20 100 " " "
$ 25.20 $ 1,512.00 200 " " "
$ 24.31 $  729.30 2% " " "
$ 27.21 $ 816.30 200 " " "
$ 35.00 $_3,500.00 _100 " " "
$ 36.20 $ 4,344.00 100 " " "
SEE ATTACHED

L Days ARO

NO BID
Catalog/Price List Identification (including Date)

Days ARO

dntinued)



